HP Desktop, Monitor, Laptop May 2025 Pricing

Software
Data Center Insight Public | House Int'l Extended Lead
Quantity Item Part# Bluum Countertrade Warehouse Howard Sector (SHI) Trafera VLCM Order Times
Desktops
HP Elite 800 G9 SFF, intel Core i5-14500, 16GB DDR5 RAM,
1to 25 256GB SSD, Win 11 Pro, UHD Graphics 770, Bluetooth,
keyboard: US A12GZUTHABA S 949.62 | $ 911.99 [ $ 924.89 No Bid S 943.65 | $ 934.29 No Bid S 939.00
Desktop Mini, Mounting Brackets
HP Elite 800 G9 Desktop Mini, Core i5 14500T, 16GB RAM,
1to 25 512GB SSD, Win 11 Pro, UHD Graphics 770, Gigk,
Bluetooth, keyboard: US (Replaces 86Y58UT#ABA) A12GMUTHABA $ 87999 ¢ 867.99 |  NoBid NoBid |$  909.04 [$ 90002 | NoBid |$ 90500

1to 25 HP EliteDesk 600 69 CUSTOM BUILD Desktop Mini, Core i5-
12500T, 16GB RAM, 512GB NVMe SSD, Win 11 Pro 64 Custom Build S 739.99 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

HP Elite 800 G9 Desktop Mini, Core i7 14700T/ 4.9 GHz,
1to 25 16GB RAM, 512 GB SSD, Win 11 Pro, UHD Graphics 770
(replaces 86Y59UT#ABA) A12GNUT#ABA S 1,007.99 [ $ 1,019.37 No Bid No Bid S 1,056.45 | $ 1,077.35 No Bid $ 1,051.00 | 2weeks

1to 25 HP EliteDesk 600 G7 CUSTOM BUILD Desktop Mini, Core
i7-12700T, 16GB RAM, 512GB NVME SSD, Win 11 Pro 64  Custom Build S 958.99 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

HP B300 PC Mounting Bracket, thin client (For
EliteDisplay E223, E233, E243, E24, E27 monitors listed

1to 25 below) 2DWS3AT S 33.79 No Bid S 32.83 No Bid S 3401 (S 33.18 No Bid No Bid 2-4 weeks
HP B300 mounting kit for Desktop Mini (replaces

1to 25 2DW53AT) 7DB37AT S 43.99 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 3-4 weeks
HP B300 Mounting Bracket for Workstation, Mini PC, Thin

1to 25 Client (Replaces 7DB37AT and 2DW53AT) 7DB37AA No Bid S 42.65 | $ 44.43 No Bid S 4535 | S 44.23 No Bid No Bid
HP Quick Release Bracket 2 (For P27v monitor listed

1to 25 below) 6KD15AA S 15.95 | $ 15.95 [ $ 16.58 No Bid S 17.01|$ 17.08 No Bid No Bid 3-4 weeks
HP B250 PC Mounting Bracket (For P27h monitor listed

1to 25 below) 8RA46AA S 26.59 | $ 26.66 | $ 27.36 No Bid S 28.35 No Bid No Bid No Bid 4-6 weeks

1to 25 HP External USB DVDRW Drive F2B56UT No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 2 weeks
HP B560 PC Mounting Bracket, use for EliteDisplay E24 G5

1to25 and E27 G5 monitors listed below B560/763U8AA S 30.67 [ $ 29.08 | $ 30.14 No Bid S 30.92 No Bid No Bid No Bid
Monitors

1t025 HP 524pf 24" Class Full HD LED Monitor, 16:9, Black

(replaces GN6E9AA#ABA) 9DIL6UTHABA S 153.49 | $ 151.80 | $ 158.84 No Bid S 159.76 | $ 155.80 No Bid S 157.00

1to25 HP P27 G5 LED Monitor, 27", 1920 x 1080 Full HD (1080P),

@ 75 Hz, IPS, HDMI, VGA, Black (Replaces 9TT20A6#ABA) 64X69AAHABA S 171.18 | $ 168.67 | $ 175.67 No Bid S 179.34 | $ 174.90 No Bid $  178.00 2 weeks
1to75 HP P27h G5 LED Monitor, 27", 1920 x 1080 Full HD, @
75Hz, IPS, HDMI, VGA, DisplayPort, speakers, Black 64W41AAHABA S 200.68 | $ 197.76 | $ 190.82 No Bid S 210.26 | $ 205.05 No Bid $  194.00 2-4 weeks
1to 25
° HP E27 G5 E-series, LED Monitor, 27", 1920 x 1080 Full HD 6N4E2AA#ABA S 183.49 | $ 184.18 | $ 190.15 No Bid S 195.83 | $ 190.98 No Bid $  192.00 2 weeks
Laptops

HP Elite x360 830 G11 2-in-1 Multi-Touch Notebook,
13.3" Screen, Intel Ultra 7-165U, 1.70GHz, 16GB memory,
1to 25 512GB SSD storage, Windows 11 Pro, WUXGA, Wi-Fi,
Bluetooth, kbd: US, Touchscreen & Flip Model (Replaces
895MIUTHABA) A6SUBUTHABA S 1,609.99 [ $ 1,613.52 | $ 1,636.34 No Bid S 1,669.54 | $ 1,652.98 No Bid $  1,660.48
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Laptops (cont.)

1to 25

HP EliteBook 830 G11 Notebook, 13.3", Intel Core Ultra 5

135U 12-Core, Intel Graphics, 16GB RAM, 512GB SSD

storage, 1920 x 1200, Win 11 Pro, 5MP Webcam,

Bluetooth, Wi-Fi 6E, kbd: US (no touchscreen) (replaces

895M1UT#ABA) A6TGOUTHABA

$

1,223.99

$ 1,219.58

S 1,236.84

No Bid

S 1,261.93

S 1,249.41

No Bid

$  1,256.00

1to 25

HP EliteBook 840 G11 Notebook, 14" Screen, Intel Core

Ultra 5 135U, 16GB DDR5 SDRAM, 512GB SSD, 1920 x

1200, Intel Graphics, Win 11 Pro, Bluetooth, Wi-Fi 6E,

kbd: US (replacesA16KCUT#ABA) A6SZ3UTHABA

1,178.25

$ 1,167.35

S 1,209.47

No Bid

S 1,234.01

S 1,221.76

No Bid

$  1,228.00

1to25

HP ProBook 440 G11 Notebook, 14" screen, Intel Core

Ultra 7-155U, up to 4.8 GHz, Win 11 Pro, Intel Graphics,

16GB RAM, 512GB SSD NVMe, 14" IPS 1920x1200, Gigabit

Ethernet, Wi-Fi 6E, Bluetooth, pike silver aluminum, kbd:

US, with HP 1 year Wolf Pro Security (no touchscreen or

flip) A1LC3UTHABA

959.00

S 1,013.01

S 976.69

No Bid

S 1,060.91

S 1,050.39

No Bid

$  1,055.00

1to25

HP EliteBook 840 G11 Notebook, 14" Touchscreen,

WUXGA, Intel Fore Ultra 7 155U. 16GB DDR5 RAM, 512GB

SSD, 1920 x 1200 IPS Touchscreen, Win 11 Pro, Intel

Graphics, 5SMP Webcam, Wi-Fi 6E, Bluetooth, keyboard:

US touchscreen (Replaces A14WFUT) A6SZ1UTHABA

1,280.51

S 1,241.30

S 1,286.09

No Bid

S 1,312.18

S 1,299.16

No Bid

S 1,305.06

1to25

HP EliteBook 840 G11 Notebook, 14" Touchscreen,

WUXGA, Intel Core Ultra 5 125U, 16GB DDR5 RAM, 512GB

SSD, 1920 x 1200, Win 11 Pro, Intel Graphics, 5SMP

webcam, Wi-Fi, Bluetooth, kbd: US Touchscreen (replaces
A14RTUTHABA) A6SY4AUTHABA

1,144.29

$ 1,119.64

S 1,128.23

No Bid

S 1,172.59

S 1,160.96

No Bid

$ 1,167.00

1to25

HP EliteBook 860 G11 Multi-touch Notebook, 16"

Touchscreen, Intel Core Ultra 5- 125U, 16GB DDR5 RAM,

512GB SSD, Intel Graphics, 16" 1920 x 1200 IPS

Touchscreen, Win 11 Pro, Bluetooth, Wi-Fi 6E, kbd: US-

TOUCHSCREEN (replaces A14SGUT) A6TE1IUTHABA

1,229.99

$ 1,125.09

$ 1,165.68

No Bid

S 1,189.34

S 1,177.54

No Bid

S 1,183.00

1to25

HP EliteBook 860 G11 Notebook, 16" Screen, Intel Core

Ultra 5 - 125U, 16GB DDR5 RAM, 512GB SSD, Intel

Graphics, 16" 1920 x 1200 screen, Win 11 Pro, Bluetooth,

WiFi 6E, kbd: US(replaces A14SCUT) A6TDSUTHABA

1,098.99

$ 1,093.40

S 1,132.85

No Bid

S 1,155.84

S 1,144.37

No Bid

$ 1,150.00

1to25

HP ProBook 460 G11 Notebook, 16" screen, Intel Core

Ultra 7-155U, up to 4.8 GHz, Win 11 Pro, Intel Graphics,

16GB RAM, 512GB SSD NVMe, 16" IPS 1920x1200, Gigabit

Ethernet, Wi-Fi 6E, Bluetooth, pike silver aluminum, kbd:

US, with HP 1 year Wolf Pro Security (No touchscreen or

flip) A1LHSUT#ABA

993.94

$ 1,029.93

S 988.70

No Bid

S 1,100.00

S 1,089.08

No Bid

No Bid

1to25

HP Zbook Firefly 16" G11 Mobile Workstation, 16"

Screen, Intel Core Ultra 7- 155U, 32GB DDR5 RAM, 512GB

SSD, 16" 1920 x 1200, Intel Graphics, Win 11 Pro, 5SMP

Webca, Wi-Fi 6E, Bluetooth, kbd: US (No touchscreen or

flip) (replaces A1IRD4UT) A6UF5UTH#HABA

1,408.79

$ 1,399.76

S 1,464.42

No Bid

S 1,479.70

S 1,465.01

No Bid

$ 1,472.00

1to25

HP ZBook Firefly 16 G11 Mobile Workstation, 16" Screen,

Intel Core Ultra 7- 165H, 32GB DDR5 RAM, 1TB SSD,

NVIDIA RTX A500 Graphics, Win 11 Pro, 16" 2880 x 1800

OLED display, Wi-Fi 6E, Bluetooth, kbd: US (replaces

7Z1B4UT) A6UG2UTH#ABA

1,993.98

$ 1,980.80

S 2,082.45

No Bid

S 2,093.91

S 2,073.13

No Bid

$ 2,083.00
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Laptop Docking Stations
1to 25 HP USB-C Docking Station S5TW10AA/ 5TW10UT#ABA| S 154.99 ‘ S 176.44 | S 155.74 ‘ No Bid ‘ S 159.76 ‘ S 160.47 ‘ No Bid ‘ S 162.00 ‘ 2-4 weeks
1to0 25 Plugable USB-C Triple 4K Display Docking Station UD-ULTC4K S 212.87 No Bid S 209.13 No Bid S 186.90 | $ 222.49 No Bid $  215.00 2-4 weeks
1to 25 Plugable USB-C Triple HDMI Display Docking Station UD-3900PDZ S 137.87 No Bid S 136.47 No Bid S 129.53 | $ 144.11 No Bid S 140.00 2-4 weeks
1to0 25 Plugable Dual Display Universal Docking Station UD-3900 S 92.65 No Bid S 91.02 No Bid S 8114 S 96.84 No Bid S 98.00 | 2-4 weeks




