HP Desktop, Monitor, Laptop July 2024 Pricing Low Bid
Insight Public Software Extended Order
Quantity Item Part# Bluum Connection Countertrade Howard Sector House Int'l VLCM Lead Time
Desktops
HP EliteDesk 600 G9 SFF, Intel Core i5-13500/ 1.8GHz, 16GB
1to25 memory, 256GB NVMe SSD, Win 11 Pro, UHD Graphics 770,
Bluetooth, keyboard: US 86YA9UTHABA S 758.99 No Bid S 764.06 No Bid S 797.16 | $ 778.20 No Bid 2 weeks
HP Elite 800 G9 SFF, intel Core i5-14500, 16GB DDR5 RAM,
1t025  256GB SSD, Win 11 Pro, UHD Graphics 770, Bluetooth,
keyboard: US A12GZUT#ABA No Bid No Bid S 984.40 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Desktop Mini, Mounting Brackets
HP EliteDesk 600 G9 Desktop Mini, Core i5 13500T, 16GB
1t025  RAM, 256GB SSD, Win 11 Pro, UHD Graphics 770, Gig#,
Bluetooth, keyboard: US (replaces 82J81UT#ABA) 86Y65UTHABA S 753.13 No Bid S 754.29 No Bid S 781.73 | $ 773.17 No Bid
HP Elite 800 G9 Desktop Mini, Core i5 14500T, 16GB RAM,
1t025  512GB SSD, Win 11 Pro, UHD Graphics 770, GigE, Bluetooth,
keyboard: US (Replaces 86Y58UT#ABA) A12GMUTHABA S 796.17 No Bid S 802.52 No Bid S 837.59 | $ 817.35 No Bid
HP Elite 800 G9 Desktop Mini, Core i7 14700T/ 4.9 GHz,
1t025  16GB RAM, 512 GB SSD, Win 11 Pro, UHD Graphics 770
(replaces 86Y59UTH#ABA) A12GNUTH#ABA S 925.27 No Bid S 926.69 No Bid S 973.56 | $ 949.90 No Bid 2 weeks
1to 25 HP B300 PC Mounting Bracket, thin client (For EliteDisplay
E223, E233, E243, E24, E27 monitors listed below) 2DWS53AT S 29.65 No Bid S 30.00 No Bid S 31.28 | $ 30.90 No Bid 2-4 weeks
1to 25
° HP B300 mounting kit for Desktop Mini (replaces 2DW53AT) 7DB37AT S 20.19 No Bid S 15.89 No Bid S 27.83 | $ 25.95 No Bid 3-4 weeks
11025 HP B300 Mounting Bracket for Workstation, Mini PC, Thin
Client (Replaces 7DB37AT) 7DB37AA No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
1to 25
° HP Quick Release Bracket 2 (For P27v monitor listed below) 6KD15AA S 14.95 No Bid S 14.79 No Bid S 16.02 | $ 15.45 No Bid 3-4 weeks
11025 HP B250 PC Mounting Bracket (For P27h monitor listed
below) 8RA46AA S 25.99 No Bid S 24.64 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 4-6 weeks
11025 HP B200 PC Mounting bracket for monitor/mini PC, black,
screen size up to 27" 762T5AA No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid S 23.69 No Bid
1to0 25 HP External USB DVDRW Drive F2B56UT S 48.99 No Bid No Bid No Bid S 47.92 | $ 46.34 No Bid 2 weeks
Monitors
1to 25 HP EliteDisplay E24 G5 23.8" FHD Monitor (replaces
9VF99AAH#ABA) 6N6ESAAHABA S 167.39 No Bid S 166.53 No Bid S 179.09 | $ 171.09 No Bid 2 weeks
1to 25 HP P27 G5 LED Monitor, 27", 1920 x 1080 Full HD (1080P),
@ 75 Hz, IPS, HDMI, VGA, Black (Replaces 9TT20A6#ABA) 64X69AAHABA S 143.99 No Bid S 142.04 No Bid No Bid S 145.65 No Bid 2 weeks
1025 HP P27h G5 LED Monitor, 27", 1920 x 1080 Full HD, @ 75Hz,
IPS, HDMI, VGA, DisplayPort, speakers, Black 64WA1AAH#ABA S 167.39 No Bid S 151.28 No Bid S 151.35 | $ 187.56 No Bid 2-4 weeks
1to 25
0 HP E27 G5 E-series, LED Monitor, 27", 1920 x 1080 Full HD  6N4E2AA#ABA S 187.99 No Bid S 186.12 No Bid S 201.02 | $ 191.93 No Bid 2 weeks
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1to 25

HP EliteBook x360 830 G10 Notebook, 13.3" Screen, Core i7

1365U/1.8 GHz, 16GB RAM, 512GB SSD, Win 11 Pro, IPS

1920 x 1200 (Full HDP, Iris Xe Graphics, Wi-Fi 6E, Bluetooth,

kbd: US Touchscreen with Flip design(Replaces

6C163UTHABA) 895MOUTH#ABA

S 1,469.91

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

S 1,556.25

$

1,475.05

No Bid

3-4 weeks

1to 25

HP Elite x360 830 G11 2-in-1 Multi-Touch Notebook, 13.3"

Screen, Intel Ultra 7-165U, 1.70GHz, 16GB memory, 512GB

SSD storage, Windows 11 Pro, WUXGA, Wi-Fi, Bluetooth,

kbd: US, Touchscreen & Flip Model (Replaces

895M9UTHABA) A14RPUTHABA

$  1,469.91

No Bid

1,473.92

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

1to 25

HP EliteBook 830 G10 Notebook, 13.3", Core i5 1345U/ 1.6

GHz, 16GB RAM, 512GB SSD NVMe, IPS 1920 x 1200, Win

11 Pro, Iris Xe Graphics, Bluetooth, Wi-Fi, kbd: US

touchscreen (replaces 6C165UT#ABA) 895M1UTHABA

$  1,103.89

No Bid

1,109.11

No Bid

S 1,174.90

$

1,109.98

No Bid

3-4 weeks

1to 25

HP EliteBook 830 G11 Notebook, 13.3", Intel Core Ultra 5

135U 12-Core, Intel Graphics, 16GB RAM, 512GB SSD

storage, 1920 x 1200, Win 11 Pro, 5MP Webcam, Bluetooth,

Wi-Fi 6E, kbd: US (replaces 895M1UT#ABA) A14S7UTHABA

$  1,103.89

No Bid

1,109.14

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

1to 25

HP EliteBook 840 G10 Notebook, 14" Screen, Core i5-

1345U/ 1.6 GHz, 16GB RAM, 512GB SSD NVMe, TLC, 14" IPS

1920 x 1200, Iris XE Graphics, Bluetooth, Wi-Fi 6E, kbd: US

(replaces 6C175UT#ABA) 89D93UTHABA

$  1,073.25

No Bid

1,079.53

No Bid

S 1,145.58

$

1,080.38

No Bid

2-4 weeks

1to 25

HP EliteBook 840 G11 Notebook, 14" Screen, Intel Core

Ultra 5 135U, 16GB RAM, 512GB SSD, 1920 x 1200, Intel

Graphics, Win 11 Pro, Bluetooth, Wi-Fi, kbd: US (replaces

89D93UTHABA) A16KCUTHABA

$  1,073.25

No Bid

1,079.56

No Bid

S 1,127.26

$

1,080.38

No Bid

1to 25

HP EliteBook 840 G11 Notebook, 14" Screen, Intel Core

Ultra 5 135U, 16GB DDR5 SDRAM, 512GB SSD, 1920 x 1200,

Intel Graphics, Win 11 Pro, Bluetooth, Wi-Fi 6E, kbd: US
(replacesA16KCUT#ABA) A6SZ3UTHABA

No Bid

No Bid

1,418.35

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

1to 25

HP EliteBook 840 G10 Notebook, 14" Screen, Core i7 1360P/
2.2 GHz, 16GB RAM, 512GB SSD NVMe, Win 11 Pro, 14" IPS
touchscreen 1920 x 1200, Iris Xe Graphics, Wi-Fi 6E,
Bluetooth, kbd: US, touchscreen (replaces 6C1Z3UT#ABA)
89D96UTHABA

S 1,181.06

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

S 1,259.93

$

1,188.92

No Bid

2-4 weeks

1to 25

HP EliteBook 840 G11 Notebook, 14" Touchscreen, WUXGA,
Intel Core Ultra 7 155U, 16GB RAM, 512GB SSD, 1920 x
1200, Win 11 Pro, Intel Graphics, 5SMP webcam, Wi-Fi,
Bluetooth, kbd: US touchscreen (replaces 89D96UT#ABA)
A14WFUTH#ABA

$  1,181.06

No Bid

$

1,180.41

No Bid

S 1,239.50

$

1,188.92

No Bid

1to25

HP EliteBook 840 G11 Notebook, 14" Touchscreen, WUXGA,

Intel Fore Ultra 7 155U. 16GB DDR5 RAM, 512GB SSD, 1920

x 1200 IPS Touchscreen, Win 11 Pro, Intel Graphics, SMP

Webcam, Wi-Fi 6E, Bluetooth, keyboard: US touchscreen

(Replaces A14WFUT) AB6SZI1UTHABA

No Bid

No Bid

$

1,468.90

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

1to 25

HP EliteBook 840 G10 Notebook, 14" Screen, Core i5

1335U/ 1.3 GHz, 16GB RAM, 512GB SSD NVMe, Win 11 Pro,

TLC, 14" IPS touchscreen 1920 x 1200, Iris Xe Graphics,

Bluetooth, Wi-Fi 6E, kbd: US Touchscreen (replaces

6C174UTHABA) 89D92UT#ABA

$  1,069.99

No Bid

$

1,074.60

No Bid

S 1,139.37

$

1,075.45

No Bid

2-4 weeks
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1to 25

HP EliteBook 840 G11 Notebook, 14" Touchscreen, WUXGA,
Intel Core Ultra 5 125U, 16GB RAM, 512GB SSD, 1920 x
1200, Win 11 Pro, Intel Graphics, 5SMP webcam, Wi-Fi,
Bluetooth, kbd: US Touchscreen (replaces 89D92UT#ABA)
A14RTUTHABA

$

1,069.99

No Bid

1,080.00

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

1to 25

HP EliteBook 840 G11 Notebook, 14" Touchscreen, WUXGA,
Intel Core Ultra 5 125U, 16GB DDR5 RAM, 512GB SSD, 1920
x 1200, Win 11 Pro, Intel Graphics, 5MP webcam, Wi-Fi,
Bluetooth, kbd: US Touchscreen (replaces A14RTUT#ABA)
A6SYAUTHABA

No Bid

No Bid

1,383.94

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

1to 25

HP EliteBook 860 G10 Notebook, 16" Screen, Core i5-

1345U, 16GB RAM, 512GB SSD, Iris Xe Graphics, 16" IPS

touchscreen 1920 x 1200, Win 11 Pro, Bluetooth, Wi-Fi 6E,

kbd: US- TOUCHSCREEN (replaces 6C1Z7UT#ABA) 89D73UTHABA

3

1,155.28

No Bid

1,158.40

No Bid

S 1,210.07

$

1,159.31

No Bid

2-4 weeks

1to 25

HP EliteBook 860 G11 Notebook, 16" Touchscreen, Intel

Core Ultra 5 - 125U, 16GB DDR5 RAM, 512GB SSD, Intel

Graphics, 16" IPS touchscreen 1920 x 1200, Win 11 Pro,

Bluetooth, WiFi 6E, kbd: US- TOUCHSCREEN (replaces

89D73UT) A14SGUTH#ABA

No Bid

No Bid

1,401.13

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

1to 25

HP EliteBook 860 G11 Multi-touch Notebook, 16"

Touchscree, Intel Core Ultra 5- 125U, 16GB DDR5 RAM,

512GB SSD, Intel Graphics, 16" 1920 x 1200 IPS

Touchscreen, Win 11 Pro, Bluetooth, Wi-Fi 6E, kbd: US-

TOUCHSCREEN (replaces A14SGUT) AG6TELIUTHABA

No Bid

No Bid

1,383.94

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

1to 25

HP EliteBook 860 G10 Notebook, 16" Screen, Core i5-
1335U/ 1.3GHz, 16GB RAM, 512GB SSD NVMe, 16" IPS 1920
x 1200, Iris Xe Graphics, Win 11 Pro, Wi-Fi 6E, Bluetooth,
kbd: US (No touchscreen or flip) (replaces 6C188UT#ABA)
89D70UTHABA

$

999.74

No Bid

1,005.59

No Bid

S 1,051.56

$

1,006.39

No Bid

2-4 weeks

1to 25

HP EliteBook 860 G11 Notebook, 16" screen, Intel Core

Ultra 5 - 125U, 16GB DDR5 RAM, 512GB SSD, Intel Graphics,

16" 1920 x 1200 screen, Win 11 Pro, Bluetooth, WiFi 6E,

kbd: US(replaces 89D70UT) A14SCUTHABA

No Bid

No Bid

1,384.53

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

1to 25

HP EliteBook 860 G11 Notebook, 16" Screen, Intel Core

Ultra 5 - 125U, 16GB DDR5 RAM, 512GB SSD, Intel Graphics,

16" 1920 x 1200 screen, Win 11 Pro, Bluetooth, WiFi 6E,

kbd: US(replaces A14SCUT) A6TDS8UTHABA

No Bid

No Bid

1,358.13

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

1to 25

HP Zbook Firefly 16 G10 Mobile Workstation, 16" Screen,
Intel Core i7 1360P/ 2.2 GHz, 32GB RAM, 512GB SSD NVMe,
Win 11 Pro, Iris Xe Graphics, 16" IPS 1920 x 1200, Wi-Fi 6E
7Z1B6UTHABA

$

1,299.29

No Bid

1,306.26

No Bid

No Bid

$

1,330.45

No Bid

1to25

HP ZBook Firefly 16 G11 mobile workstation, 16" Screen,

Intel Core Ultra 7- 155H, 32GB DDR5 RAM, 512GB SSD, 16"

1920 x 1200, Intel Arc Graphics, Win 11 Pro, Wi-Fi 6E,

Bluetooth, kbd: UT (No touchscreen or flip) (replaces

7Z1B6UT) A1RD4UTHABA

No Bid

No Bid

1,546.27

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid
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Laptops (cont)
HP Zbook Firefly 16" G11 Mobile Workstation, 16" Screen,
Intel Core Ultra 7- 155U, 32GB DDR5 RAM, 512GB SSD, 16"
1to 25 1920 x 1200, Intel Graphics, Win 11 Pro, 5SMP Webca, Wi-Fi
6E, Bluetooth, kbd: UT (No touchscreen or flip) (replaces
A1RDAUT) A6UF5UT#ABA No Bid No Bid S 1,529.06 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
HP ZBook Firefly 16 G10 Mobile Workstation, 16" Screen,
1t0 25 Intel Core i7 1365U/ 1.8 GHz, 32GB RAM, 1TB SSD NVMe,
Win 11 Pro, 16" IPS 2880 x 1800, Wi-Fi 6E, kbd: US (replaces
6N2H1UTH#ABA) 7Z1BAUTHABA S 1,783.84 No Bid S 1,794.28 No Bid S 1,872.99($ 1,827.50 No Bid 2-4 weeks
HP ZBook Firefly 16 G11 Mobile Workstation, 16" Screen,
Intel Core Ultra 7- 165H, 32GB DDR5 RAM, 1TB SSD, NVIDIA
1to 25 RTX A500 Graphics, Win 11 Pro, 16" 2880 x 1800 OLED
display, Wi-Fi 6E, Bluetooth, kbd: US (replaces 721B4UT)
A6UG2UTHABA No Bid No Bid S 2,259.65 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
1to25  HP USB-C Docking Station STW10AA/ STWIOUT#ABA |§  138.99 NoBid |$ 134.82 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 2-4 weeks
1to 25 HP USB-C Essential Docking Station G5 72C71AAHABA S 152.40 No Bid No Bid No Bid S 163.52 No Bid No Bid 2-4 weeks
1to 25 Plugable USB-C Triple 4K Display Docking Station UD-ULTC4K S 206.84 No Bid No Bid No Bid S 207.99 | $ 195.08 No Bid 2-4 weeks
1to 25 Plugable USB-C Triple HDMI Display Docking Station UD-3900PDZ S 127.99 No Bid No Bid No Bid S 128.75 | $ 120.61 No Bid 2-4 weeks
1to 25 Plugable Dual Display Universal Docking Station UD-3900 S 78.48 No Bid No Bid No Bid S 77.73 | $ 74.06 No Bid 2-4 weeks
Cyber Acoustics USB Docking Station, includes (1) USB Type
1to 25 A Gen 1 Port, (3) USB Type A Gen 2 Ports, (1) HDMI Port, (1)
DisplayPort, (1) RJ-45 Gigabit Ethernet Port, Integrated
Security K-Slot (Lock cable not included) DS-2000 S 135.99 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 2-4 weeks




