
HP Chromebook and Cart April 2024 Pricing Overall Low

Quantity Item Part # Bluum  Countertrade  Howard 

 Insight Public 

Sector 

 School 

Specialty 

 Software 

House Int'l  Trafera  Vivacity Tech  VLCM 

 Extended Order 

Lead Times 

Chromebook and Google Chrome Package

1-100

 HP Chromebook 11 G9 Education Edition, Celeron N4500/ 1.1 

GHz, Google Chrome OS 64, 4GB RAM, 32GB eMMC, 11.6" 1366 

x 768 (HD), UHD Graphics, Wi-Fi, Bluetooth, kbd: US (Replaces 

1A762UT#ABA) 3V2Y2UT#ABA  $            220.24  No Bid  No Bid  $            239.55  No Bid  $            221.14  $       236.00  $         220.00  No Bid 3-4 weeks

1-100

 HP Fortis 11 G10 Chromebook, *RUGGED*, Celeron N100/ 1.0 

GHz 4-Core processor, Google Chrome OS 64, 8GB RAM, 64GB 

eMMC SSD, 11.6" 1366 x 768 (HD), UHD Graphics, Wi-Fi, 

Bluetooth, kbd: US 9R3B4UT#ABA  $            284.26  No Bid  No Bid  $            294.31  No Bid  $            288.63  No Bid  No Bid  No Bid 

1-100

 HP Fortis 11 G10 Chromebook, *RUGGED*, Celeron N200/ 1.0 

GHz 4-core processor, Google Chrome OS 64, 8GB RAM, 64GB 

eMMC SSD, 11.6" 1366 x 768 (HD), UHD Graphics, Wi-Fi, 

Bluetooth, kbd: US 9R3K4UT#ABA  $            369.33  No Bid  No Bid  $            382.55  No Bid  $            374.94  No Bid  No Bid  No Bid 

1-100

 HP Chromebook 11 G9 Education Edition, Celeron N4500/ 1.1 

GHz, Google Chrome OS 64, 4GB RAM, 32GB eMMC, 11.6" 

touchscreen 1366 x 768 (HD), UHD Graphics, Wi-Fi, Bluetooth, 

kbd: US (Replaces 1A764UT#ABA) 3V2Y3UT#ABA  $            229.31  $                228.63  No Bid  $            254.80  No Bid  $            249.72  $       245.00  No Bid  No Bid 4-6 weeks

1-100

 HP Chromebook x360 11 G4 Education Edition, touchscreen and 

flip design, Celeron N5100/ 1.1 GHz, Google Chrome OS 64, 4GB 

RAM, 32GB eMMC, 11.6" IPS touchscreen 1366 x 768 (HD), UHD 

Graphics, Wi-Fi, Bluetooth, kbd: US with Stylus (Replaces 

1A768UT#ABA)  3V254UT#ABA  $            428.38  $                428.00  No Bid  $            442.92  No Bid  $            435.32  No Bid  No Bid  No Bid 12+ weeks

1-100

 HP Fortis x360 11 G3 J Chromebook, touchscreen and flip design 

Celeron N4500, 1.10 GHz w/B, 4GB RAM, 32GB eMMC, 11.6" IPS 

touchscreen, 1366 x 768 (HD), UHD Graphics, Wi-Fi 6, Bluetooth, 

kbd: US 7L2Z9UT#ABA  $            297.84  $                305.00  No Bid  $            315.76  No Bid  $            310.15  No Bid  No Bid  No Bid 4-8 weeks

1-100

 HP Fortis x360 11 G3 J Chromebook, touchscreen and flip design, 

Celeron N4500, 1.10 GHz w/B, 4GB RAM, 32GB eMMC, 5 MP 

Camera, 11.6" IPS touchscreen, 1366 x 768 (HD), UHD Graphics, 

Wi-Fi 6, Bluetooth, kbd: US 7L300UT#ABA  $            309.97  $                324.00  No Bid  $            328.93  No Bid  $            329.59  No Bid  No Bid  No Bid 4-8 weeks

1-100
 *Google Chrome OS Management Console License- academic CROS-SW-DIS-EDU-NEW  $               29.67  $                29.25  No Bid  $               29.81  No Bid  $               29.99  $         32.00  $           29.70  No Bid 3-4 weeks

TOTAL

*  Note: Please order Google licenses from same vendor as Chromebooks when ordering together.

Carts

1 to 20 Aver E36C+ charging cart for 36 units with intelligent charging E36C+  $            799.99  No Bid  No Bid  No Bid  No Bid  No Bid  $       900.00  No Bid  No Bid 

1 to 20 Liftgate Service  included 

1 to 20 Optional Inside Delivery Service  included 

1 to 20 Shipping and Handling for carts only  included  included 

TOTAL  $            799.99  $       900.00 

 2-3 weeks 

1 to 20 Aver C36i+ charging cart for 36 units C36I+  $         1,099.00  No Bid  No Bid  No Bid  No Bid  No Bid  $    1,200.00  No Bid  No Bid 

1 to 20 Liftgate Service  included 

1 to 20 Optional Inside Delivery Service  included 

1 to 20 Shipping and Handling for carts only  included  included 

TOTAL  $         1,099.00  $    1,200.00 

 2-3 weeks 

1 to 20 Anywhere Cart AC-PLUS 36-Unit Secure Charging Cart AC-PLUS  $            979.99  No Bid  No Bid  $         1,358.51  No Bid  $         1,432.67  No Bid  No Bid  No Bid 

1 to 20 Liftgate Service  $            100.00  additional  additional 

1 to 20 Optional Inside Delivery Service  n/a  additional  additional 

1 to 20 Shipping and Handling for carts only  included  included  included 

TOTAL  $         1,079.99  $         1,358.51  $         1,432.67 

 2-3 weeks 

1 to 20 Aver X42i 42-device charging cart X42i  $         1,159.99  No Bid  No Bid  No Bid  No Bid  No Bid  $    1,646.00  No Bid  No Bid 

1 to 20 Liftgate Service  included 

1 to 20 Optional Inside Delivery Service  included 

1 to 20 Shipping and Handling for carts only  included  included 

TOTAL  $         1,159.99  $    1,646.00 

 2-3 weeks 
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Carts (cont.)

1 to 20 Anywhere Cart AC-Pro II 40 Bay Full Feature Smart Cart AC-PRO II  $         1,499.99  No Bid  No Bid  No Bid  No Bid  $         2,064.42  No Bid  No Bid  No Bid 

1 to 20 Liftgate Service  $            100.00  additional 

1 to 20 Optional Inside Delivery Service  n/a  additional 

1 to 20 Shipping and Handling for carts only  included  included 

TOTAL  $         1,599.99  $         2,064.42 

 2-3 weeks 

1 to 20 Ergotron Zip40 Charging Cart Zip40/ DM40-1009-1  $         1,769.00  No Bid  No Bid  No Bid  No Bid  $         3,520.38  No Bid  No Bid  No Bid 

1 to 20 Liftgate Service  $               40.00  additional 

1 to 20 Optional Inside Delivery Service  $            120.00  additional 

1 to 20 Shipping and Handling for carts only  included  included 

TOTAL  $         1,929.00  $         3,520.38 

 2-3 weeks 

1 to 20

Bretford Charging Cart for 45 tablets/notebooks, black (Alt for 

Anywhere AC-PRO II and Ergotron Zip 40 Charging Carts) TCOREX45  $         1,449.00  No Bid  No Bid  $         1,632.54  $     2,313.17  $         1,743.86  No Bid  No Bid  No Bid 

1 to 20 Liftgate Service  included  additional  additional 

1 to 20 Optional Inside Delivery Service  n/a  additional  additional 

1 to 20 Shipping and Handling for carts only  included  additional  included  included 

TOTAL  $         1,449.00  $         1,632.54  $     2,313.17  $         1,743.86 

 2-3 weeks 

1 to 20 Vivacity Tech 36-Unit Smart Charging Cart VTCART-C36-GY  $         1,035.62  No Bid  $         799.00  No Bid 

1 to 20 Liftgate Service  additional  $         100.00 

1 to 20 Optional Inside Delivery Service  additional  additional 

1 to 20 Shipping and Handling for carts only  included  included 

TOTAL  $         1,035.62  $         899.00 

1 to 20 Vivacity Tech 30-Unit Charging Cart VTCART-B30-BK  No Bid  No Bid  No Bid  No Bid  No Bid  No Bid  No Bid  $         499.00  No Bid 

1 to 20 Liftgate Service  $         100.00 

1 to 20 Optional Inside Delivery Service  additional 

1 to 20 Shipping and Handling for carts only  included 

TOTAL  $         599.00 

1 to 20 Vivacity Tech Mini Charging Cabinet- 12 Unit, Black VTCABI-M12-BK  No Bid  No Bid  No Bid  No Bid  No Bid  $            359.85  No Bid  $         299.00  No Bid 

1 to 20 Liftgate Service  $               50.00  $         100.00 

1 to 20 Optional Inside Delivery Service  additional  additional 

1 to 20 Shipping and Handling for carts only  included  included 

TOTAL  $            409.85  $         399.00 

1 to 20

Aver Charge B30 30 device charging cart (compare to Vivacity 30-

unit cart) CHRGEB030  $            487.99  No Bid  No Bid  $            786.20  No Bid  $         1,007.76  $       667.00  No Bid  No Bid 

1 to 20 Liftgate Service  $               40.00  additional  additional 

1 to 20 Optional Inside Delivery Service  n/a  additional  additional 

1 to 20 Shipping and Handling for carts only  included  included  included  included 

 $            527.99  $            786.20  $         1,007.76  $       667.00 

 2-3 weeks 

1 to 20 Luxor 16 Tablet/Chromebook Open Charging Cart LOTM16  $            210.99  No Bid  No Bid  No Bid  $        217.97  No Bid  No Bid  No Bid  No Bid 

1 to 20 Liftgate Service  included 

1 to 20 Optional Inside Delivery Service  included 

1 to 20 Shipping and Handling for carts only  included  included 

TOTAL  $            210.99  $        217.97 

 2-3 weeks 
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Carts (cont.)

1 to 20 Bretford CUBE cart, 16 unit, AC Charging (Alt for Luxor LOTM16) TVC16PAC  $            859.00  No Bid  No Bid  $            953.07  $     1,239.03  $         1,018.07  No Bid  No Bid  No Bid 

1 to 20 Liftgate Service  included  additional  additional 

1 to 20 Optional Inside Delivery Service  n/a  additional  additional 

1 to 20 Shipping and Handling for carts only  included  included  included  included 

TOTAL  $            859.00  $            953.07  $     1,239.03  $         1,018.07 

 2-3 weeks 

1 to 20

Bretford CUBE Transport Open charging cart for 30 units, AC 

Charging, Charcoal TVCT30AC-CK  $            599.00  No Bid  No Bid  $            609.91  $        905.12  $            651.51  No Bid  No Bid  No Bid 

1 to 20 Liftgate Service  $               40.00  additional  additional 

1 to 20 Optional Inside Delivery Service  n/a  additional  additional 

1 to 20 Shipping and Handling for carts only  included  included  included  included 

TOTAL  $            639.00  $            609.91  $        905.12  $            651.51 

 2-3 weeks 

1 to 20

Bretford CUBE cart, 36 Unit, AC Charging (Alt for Anywhere AC-Plus 

and Vivacity 36 unit cart) TVC36PAC  $         1,159.00  No Bid  No Bid  No Bid  $     1,596.24  $         1,249.74  No Bid  No Bid  No Bid 

1 to 20 Liftgate Service  included  additional 

1 to 20 Optional Inside Delivery Service  n/a  additional 

1 to 20 Shipping and Handling for carts only  included  included  included 

TOTAL  $         1,159.00  $     1,596.24  $         1,249.74 

 2-3 weeks 

1 to 20

Anywhere Cart 12 Unit Secure Charging Cabinet for Chromebooks, 

laptops, tablets AC-MINI  $            499.00  No Bid  No Bid  No Bid  No Bid  $            785.40  No Bid  No Bid  No Bid 

1 to 20 Liftgate Service  n/a  additional 

1 to 20 Optional Inside Delivery Service  n/a  additional 

1 to 20 Shipping and Handling for carts only  included  included 

TOTAL  $            499.00  $            785.40 

 2-3 weeks 

1 to 20 Aver X16  12 Device Charge Cabinet X16  $            499.00  No Bid  No Bid  No Bid  No Bid  No Bid  No Bid  No Bid  No Bid 

1 to 20 Liftgate Service  n/a 

1 to 20 Optional Inside Delivery Service  n/a 

1 to 20 Shipping and Handling for carts only  included 

TOTAL  $            499.00 

 2-3 weeks 

1 to 20 Copernicus Tech Tub2, 10 device charging cabinets FTT1100  $            379.44  No Bid  No Bid  No Bid  $        392.93  No Bid  No Bid  No Bid  No Bid 

1 to 20 Liftgate Service  included 

1 to 20 Optional Inside Delivery Service  included 

1 to 20 Shipping and Handling for carts only  included  included 

TOTAL  $            379.44  $        392.93 

 4-6 weeks 

1 to 20 Belkin Store and Charge Station AC, up to 10 devices B2B074  $            142.99  No Bid  No Bid  $            174.13  No Bid  $            183.83  No Bid  No Bid  No Bid 

1 to 20 Liftgate Service  n/a  additional 

1 to 20 Optional Inside Delivery Service  n/a  additional 

1 to 20 Shipping and Handling for stations only  included  additional  included 

TOTAL  $            142.99  $            174.13  $            183.83 

2-3 weeks


