HP Black/White and Color Printers and Multi-Function Printers (MFP) May 2026

Award

Quantity

Item

Part#

CDW-G

Countertrade

Data Center
Warehouse

Dex
Imaging

Fisher's

Howard

Insight Public
Sector

Les Olson

Pacific Office
Automation

SSA
Technology

VLCM

1to 30

Black/White Printers

HP LaserJet Enterprise M607n printer, B/W, laser, A4/Legal,
1200 x 1200 dpi, up to 55 ppm, capacity: 650 sheets, USB 2.0,
Gigabit LAN, USB 2.0 host

KOQ14A#BG)

No Bid

$857.37

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

$878.00

$866.84

$808.68

$650.00

$872.46

No Bid

1to 30

HP LaserJet Enterprise M608n printer, B/W, laser, A4/Legal,
1200 x 1200 dpi, up to 65 ppm, capacity: 650 sheets, USB 2.0,
Gigabit LAN, USB 2.0 host

K0Q17A#BG)

No Bid

$890.10

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

$1,227.00

$997.19

$1,130.68

$895.00

$1,219.85

No Bid

1to 30

HP LaserJet Enterprise M611dn printer, B/W, Duplex, laser,
A4/legal, 1200 x 1200 dpi, up to 65 ppm, USB 2.0, Gigabit LAN,
USB 2.0 host

7PS84AH#BG)

No Bid

$1,301.86

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

$1,457.00

$1,294.32

$1,342.28

$1,099.00

$1,448.14

No Bid

1to 30

HP LaserJet Enterprise M612dn printer, B/W, Duplex, laser,
A4/legal, 1200 x 1200 dpi, up to 75 ppm, capacity: 650 sheets,
USB 2.0, Gigabit LAN, USB 2.0 host

7PS86A#BG)

No Bid

$1,336.00

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

$2,086.00

$1,767.85

$1,921.88

$1,490.00

$2,073.46

No Bid

1to 30

HP LaserJet Enterprise M507dn printer, B/W, Duplex, laser,
A4/Legal, 1200 x 1200 dpi, up to 45 ppm, capacity: 650 sheets,
USB 2.0, Gigabit LAN, USB 2.0 host

1PV87AH#BG)

No Bid

$824.90

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

$869.00

$865.21

$808.68

$575.00

$872.46

No Bid

1to 30

HP LaserJet Pro 4001n printer, B/W, laser (replacement for
W1AS52A#BG))

2Z599F#BG)J

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

$180.81

$348.68

$234.00

$253.44

No Bid

1to 30

HP LaserJet Pro 4001dn printer, B/W, Duplex, laser (replacement
for W1A53A#BG)J)

2Z600F#BG)J

No Bid

$256.25

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

$314.15

$413.08

$275.00

No Bid

No Bid

Color Printers

1to 30

HP Color Laserlet Enterprise 6701dn printer, Color, Duplex, 65
ppm, 650 sheets, 2 trays (cardstock-yes) (replaces M653dn)

58M42A#BG)

No Bid

$1,748.42

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

$2,086.00

$1,875.86

$1,921.88

$1,539.00

No Bid

No Bid

1to 30

HP Color Laserlet Pro 4201dn printer, color, Duplex (cardstock-
no)(Replaces W1Y44A#BG))

4RA85F#BG)J

No Bid

$396.85

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

$509.00

$509.68

$615.48

$459.00

$522.76

No Bid

1to 30

HP Color Laserlet Pro 4201dw printer, color, Duplex, USB 2.0,
Gigabit LAN, Wi-Fi(n), USB host (cardstock- no)(replaces
W1Y45A#BGJ/ M454dw)

4RA86F#BG)

No Bid

$406.60

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

$545.00

$539.26

$643.08

$469.00

$522.80

No Bid

1to 30

HP Color Laserlet Enterprise 5700dn printer, color, duplex, laser,
1200 x 1200 dpi, up to 45 ppm, capacity: 550 sheets, USB 2.0,
Gigabit LAN (cardstock- yes)(replaces 7ZU78A#BG)J)

6QN28AH#BG)

No Bid

$1,286.66

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

$1,048.00

$1,034.48

$965.08

$789.00

$1,041.19

No Bid

1to 30

HP Color Laserlet Enterprise M554dn printer, color, duplex,
laser, A4/legal, 1200 x 1200 dpi, up to 35 ppm, capacity: 650
sheets, USB 2.0, Gigabit LAN, USB 2.0 host (cardstock- yes)

7ZU81A#BG)

No Bid

$977.77

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

$678.00

$669.60

$624.68

$599.00

$673.95

No Bid

Multi-Function Printers (MFP): will print, copy, scan, fax

1to 30

HP LaserJet Pro 4101fdn multifuncton printer, B/W, laser,
letter/legal (replaces W1A29A#BG))

27618F#BG)

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

$371.18

$606.28

$349.00

No Bid

No Bid

1to 30

HP LaserJet Pro MFP 4112fdn multifunction printer, B/W, laser,
letter/legal (replaces 2Z618F#BG))

8X3FOA#BG)

No Bid

$473.28

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

1to 30

HP LaserJet Pro 4101fdw multifunction printer, B/W, laser
(replacement for W1A30A#BGJ)

2Z619F#BG)J

No Bid

$335.13

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

$371.18

$606.28

$359.00

$386.76

No Bid

1to 30

HP LaserJet Enterprise MFP M528dn multifunction printer, B/W,
laser, 8.5 in x 34.02 in (original), A4/legal (media), up to 45 ppm
(copying), 43 ppm (printing), 650 sheets, USB 2.0, Gigabit LAN,
USB 2.0 host

1PV64AH#BG)

No Bid

$1,498.99

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

$1,933.00

$1,622.37

$1,781.10

$1,030.00

$1,921.57

No Bid




Quantity

Item

Part#

CDW-G

Countertrade

Data Center
Warehouse

Dex
Imaging

Fisher's

Howard

Insight Public
Sector

Les Olson

Pacific Office
Automation

SSA
Technology

VLCM

Multi-Function Printers (MFP): will print, copy, scan, fax (cont.)

1to 30

HP Color Laserlet Pro MFP 4301fdw multifunction printer, color,
laser, Legal (8.5 in x 14 in) (original), Af/Legal (media), up to 35

ppm copy and print, 300 sheets, 33.6 Kbps, USB, USB 2.0, Gigabit
LAN, USB 2.0 host, Wi-Fi(ac), Bluetooth (Replaces W1A80A#BGJ)

4RA82F#BG)

No Bid

$457.49

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

$677.00

$654.17

$790.28

$550.00

$670.98

No Bid

1to 30

HP Color LaserJet Pro MFP 4301fdn multifunction printer, color,
laser, Legal (8.5 in x 14 in) (original), A4/Legal (media), up to 35
ppm copy and print, 300 sheets, 33.6 Kbps, USB, USB 2.0, Gigabit
LAN, USB 2.0 host

4RA81F#BG)J

No Bid

$450.47

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

$653.00

$654.17

$790.28

$550.00

No Bid

No Bid

1to 30

HP Color Laserlet Enterprise MFP 5800dn Multifunction printer,
color (replaces M578dn)

6QN29A#BG)

No Bid

$2,039.58

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

$2,558.00

$2,396.16

$2,357.10

$1,795.00

No Bid

No Bid

1to 30

HP Color Laserlet Enterprise MFP 6800dn multifunction printer,
color, laser, Legal (8.5 x 14) (original), A4/Legal (media), up to 55
ppm, 650 sheets, Gigabit LAN, USB 3.0, USB 2.0 host, USB3.0
host (replaces M653dn)

6QN35AH#BG)

No Bid

$2,445.31

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

$4,042.00

$3,480.89

$3,725.10

$2,900.00

No Bid

No Bid




