
HP Black/White and Color Printers and Multi-Function Printers (MFP) March 2026 Award

Quantity Item Part# CDW-G Countertrade

 Data Center 

Warehouse  Dex Imaging  Fisher's Howard

 Insight Public 

Sector Les Olson

 Pacific Office 

Automation 

 Software 

House Int'l 

(SHI) VLCM

Black/White Printers

1 to 30

HP LaserJet Enterprise M607n printer, B/W, laser, A4/Legal, 1200 

x 1200 dpi, up to 55 ppm, capacity: 650 sheets, USB 2.0, Gigabit 

LAN, USB 2.0 host K0Q14A#BGJ 846.03$           798.28$              No Bid 1,011.00$          819.00$      No Bid  $        866.84 808.68$           766.00$              No Bid No Bid

1 to 30

HP LaserJet Enterprise M608n printer, B/W, laser, A4/Legal, 1200 

x 1200 dpi, up to 65 ppm, capacity: 650 sheets, USB 2.0, Gigabit 

LAN, USB 2.0 host K0Q17A#BGJ 1,182.91$       891.11$              No Bid 1,163.00$          929.00$      No Bid 997.19$         1,130.68$       893.00$              No Bid No Bid

1 to 30

HP LaserJet Enterprise M611dn printer, B/W, Duplex, laser, 

A4/legal, 1200 x 1200 dpi, up to 65 ppm, USB 2.0, Gigabit LAN, 

USB 2.0 host 7PS84A#BGJ 1,404.28$       1,398.21$           No Bid 1,509.00$          1,729.00$   No Bid  $     1,294.32 1,342.28$       1,272.00$           No Bid No Bid

1 to 30

HP LaserJet Enterprise M612dn printer, B/W, Duplex, laser, 

A4/legal, 1200 x 1200 dpi, up to 75 ppm, capacity: 650 sheets, 

USB 2.0, Gigabit LAN, USB 2.0 host 7PS86A#BGJ 2,010.66$       1,295.39$           No Bid 2,062.00$          1,379.00$   No Bid  $     1,767.85 1,921.88$       1,550.00$           No Bid No Bid

1 to 30

HP LaserJet Enterprise M507dn printer, B/W, Duplex, laser, 

A4/Legal, 1200 x 1200 dpi, up to 45 ppm, capacity: 650 sheets, 

USB 2.0, Gigabit LAN, USB 2.0 host 1PV87A#BGJ 846.03$           828.20$              No Bid 1,009.00$          759.00$      No Bid  $        865.21 808.68$           715.00$              No Bid No Bid

1 to 30
HP LaserJet Pro 4001n printer, B/W, laser (replacement for 

W1A52A#BGJ) 2Z599F#BGJ 191.53$           244.74$              No Bid 375.00$             259.00$      No Bid  $        180.81 348.68$           275.00$              No Bid  No Bid 

1 to 30
HP LaserJet Pro 4001dn printer, B/W, Duplex, laser (replacement 

for W1A53A#BGJ) 2Z600F#BGJ No Bid 279.28$              No Bid 434.00$             299.00$      No Bid 314.05$         413.08$           277.00$              No Bid  No Bid 

Color Printers

1 to 30 HP Color LaserJet Enterprise 6701dn printer, Color, Duplex, 65 

ppm, 650 sheets, 2 trays (cardstock-yes) (replaces M653dn) 58M42A#BGJ 2,010.66$       1,566.57$           No Bid 2,615.00$          1,639.00$   No Bid  $     1,875.86 1,921.88$       1,525.00$           No Bid No Bid

1 to 30
HP Color LaserJet Pro 4201dn printer, color, Duplex (cardstock-

no)(Replaces W1Y44A#BGJ) 4RA85F#BGJ 470.66$           459.44$              No Bid 674.00$             479.00$      No Bid 466.80$         615.48$           485.00$              No Bid  No Bid 

1 to 30

HP Color LaserJet Pro 4201dw printer, color, Duplex, USB 2.0, 

Gigabit LAN, Wi-Fi(n), USB host (cardstock- no)(replaces 

W1Y45A#BGJ/ M454dw) 4RA86F#BGJ 499.53$           471.46$              No Bid 696.00$             499.00$      No Bid 496.38$         643.08$           505.00$              No Bid  No Bid 

1 to 30
HP Color LaserJet Enterprise 5700dn printer, color, duplex, laser, 

1200 x 1200 dpi, up to 45 ppm, capacity: 550 sheets, USB 2.0, 

Gigabit LAN (cardstock- yes)(replaces 7ZU78A#BGJ) 6QN28A#BGJ 1,009.66$       1,014.32$           No Bid 1,206.00$          1,049.00$   No Bid 1,034.48$     965.08$           916.00$              No Bid No Bid

1 to 30
HP Color LaserJet Enterprise M554dn printer, color, duplex, laser, 

A4/legal, 1200 x 1200 dpi, up to 35 ppm, capacity: 650 sheets, 

USB 2.0, Gigabit LAN, USB 2.0 host (cardstock- yes) 7ZU81A#BGJ 769.03$           772.58$              No Bid 1,045.00$          799.00$      No Bid  $        787.94 735.08$           697.50$              No Bid No Bid

Multi-Function Printers (MFP): will print, copy, scan, fax

1 to 30
HP LaserJet Pro 4101fdn multifuncton printer, B/W, laser, 

letter/legal (replaces W1A29A#BGJ) 2Z618F#BGJ 634.28$           358.85$              No Bid 665.00$             389.00$      No Bid 570.00$         606.28$           380.50$              No Bid No Bid

1 to 30
HP LaserJet Pro 4101fdw multifunction printer, B/W, laser 

(replacement for W1A30A#BGJ) 2Z619F#BGJ 480.28$           364.85$              No Bid 653.00$             389.00$      No Bid 478.38$         606.28$           380.50$              No Bid No Bid

1 to 30

HP LaserJet Enterprise MFP M528dn multifunction printer, B/W, 

laser, 8.5 in x 34.02 in (original), A4/legal (media), up to 45 ppm 

(copying), 43 ppm (printing), 650 sheets, USB 2.0, Gigabit LAN, 

USB 2.0 host 1PV64A#BGJ 1,904.78$       1,365.99$           No Bid 1,892.00$          1,439.00$   No Bid  $     1,622.37 1,781.10$       1,245.00$           No Bid No Bid

1 to 30

HP Color LaserJet Pro MFP 4301fdw multifunction printer, color, 

laser, Legal (8.5 in x 14 in) (original), Af/Legal (media), up to 35 

ppm copy and print, 300 sheets, 33.6 Kbps, USB, USB 2.0, Gigabit 

LAN, USB 2.0 host, Wi-Fi(ac), Bluetooth (Replaces W1A80A#BGJ) 4RA82F#BGJ No Bid 501.48$              No Bid 788.00$             535.00$      No Bid 611.29$         790.28$           610.00$              No Bid No Bid
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Multi-Function Printers (MFP): will print, copy, scan, fax (cont.)

1 to 30

HP Color LaserJet Pro MFP 4301fdn multifunction printer, color, 

laser, Legal (8.5 in x 14 in) (original), A4/Legal (media), up to 35 

ppm copy and print, 300 sheets, 33.6 Kbps, USB, USB 2.0, Gigabit 

LAN, USB 2.0 host 4RA81F#BGJ 615.03$           495.48$              No Bid 763.00$             535.00$      No Bid 611.29$         790.28$           610.00$              No Bid No Bid

1 to 30
HP Color LaserJet Enterprise MFP 5800dn Multifunction printer, 

color (replaces M578dn) 6QN29A#BGJ 2,520.78$       1,667.60$           No Bid 2,794.00$          1,799.00$   No Bid  $     2,396.16 2,357.10$       1,865.00$           No Bid No Bid

1 to 30 

HP Color LaserJet Enterprise MFP 6800dn multifunction printer, 

color, laser, Legal (8.5 x 14) (original), A4/Legal (media), up to 55 

ppm, 650 sheets, Gigabit LAN, USB 3.0, USB 2.0 host, USB3.0 host 

(replaces M653dn) 6QN35A#BGJ 3,983.78$       2,059.55$           No Bid 4,059.00$          2,232.00$   No Bid 3,480.89$     3,725.10$       2,948.00$           No Bid No Bid


