HP Black/White and Color Printers and Multi-Function Printers (MFP) October 2024

Award

Award after
10/26/24

Quantity

Item

Part#

Countertrade

Dex Imaging

Howard

Insight Public
Sector

Les Olson

Pacific Office
Automation

Software
House Int'l
(SHI)

VLCM

Extended Order
Lead Times

B/W Printers

1to30

HP Laserlet Enterprise M607n printer, B/W, laser, A4/Legal,
1200 x 1200 dpi, up to 55 ppm, capacity: 650 sheets, USB 2.0,
Gigabit LAN, USB 2.0 host

KOQ14A#BG)

$ 770.11

685.50

No Bid

No Bid

772.00

S 813.00

S 751.49

$

759.00

2 weeks

1to30

HP Laserlet Enterprise M608n printer, B/W, laser, A4/Legal,
1200 x 1200 dpi, up to 65 ppm, capacity: 650 sheets, USB 2.0,
Gigabit LAN, USB 2.0 host

KOQ17A#BGJ)

$ 849.55

958.00

No Bid

No Bid

862.00

S 1,104.00

S 829.02

$

838.00

2 weeks

1to30

HP Laserlet Enterprise M611dn printer, B/W, Duplex, laser,
A4/legal, 1200 x 1200 dpi, up to 65 ppm, USB 2.0, Gigabit LAN,
USB 2.0 host

7PS84A#BG)

S 1,102.69

1,137.50

No Bid

No Bid

$

1,113.00

S 1,300.00

$  1,076.05

$

1,087.00

2 weeks

1to30

HP Laserlet Enterprise M612dn printer, B/W, Duplex, laser,
A4/legal, 1200 x 1200 dpi, up to 75 ppm, capacity: 650 sheets,
USB 2.0, Gigabit LAN, USB 2.0 host

7PS86A#BG)

$ 1,506.10

1,629.00

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

$ 1,874.00

$  1,469.70

$

1,485.00

2 weeks

1to30

HP Laserlet Enterprise M507dn printer, B/W, Duplex, laser,
A4/Legal, 1200 x 1200 dpi, up to 52 ppm, capacity: 650 sheets,
USB 2.0, Gigabit LAN, USB 2.0 host

1PV87A#BG)

$ 737.10

686.00

No Bid

No Bid

733.00

$ 687.00

$ 719.29

$

726.00

2 weeks

1to30

HP LaserJet Pro 4001n printer, B/W, laser (replacement for
W1A52A#BG))

27599F#BG)

$ 303.76

285.00

No Bid

No Bid

$

298.00

S 248.00

$195.32*

$

196.00

2 weeks

1to30

HP LaserlJet Pro 4001dn printer, B/W, Duplex, laser (replacement
for W1A53A#BG))

2Z600F#BG)

$ 346.90

358.00

No Bid

No Bid

340.00

$ 253.00

$ 231.73

$

231.00

2 weeks

Color Printers

1to 30

HP Color LaserJet Enterprise 6701dn printer, Color, Duplex, 65
ppm, 650 sheets, 2 trays (cardstock-yes) (replaces M653dn)

58M42A#BG)

$ 1,910.42

1,615.00

No Bid

No Bid

$

1,910.00

$ 1,838.00

$  1,864.26

$

1,881.00

3-6 weeks

1to 30

HP Color LaserJet Pro 4201dn printer, color, Duplex (cardstock-
no)(Replaces W1Y44A#BG))

4RA85F#BG)

$ 538.78

506.00

No Bid

No Bid

540.00

$ 384.00

$ 357.45

$

355.00

2 weeks

1to 30

HP Color LaserJet Pro 4201dw printer, color, Duplex, USB 2.0,
Gigabit LAN, Wi-Fi(n), USB host (cardstock- no)(replaces
W1Y45A#BG)/ M454dw)

4RA86F#BG)

S 557.94

524.00

No Bid

No Bid

560.00

$ 392.00

$376.23*

372.00

2-3 weeks

1to30

HP Color LaserJet Enterprise 5700dn printer, color, duplex,
laser, 1200 x 1200 dpi, up to 45 ppm, capacity: 550 sheets, USB
2.0, Gigabit LAN (cardstock- yes)(replaces 7ZU78A#BG)J)

6QN28A#BG)

$ 1,002.28

810.55

No Bid

No Bid

$

1,000.00

$ 929.00

$ 978.05

981.00

2-3 weeks

1to 30

HP Color LaserJet Enterprise M554dn printer, color, duplex,
laser, A4/legal, 1200 x 1200 dpi, up to 35 ppm, capacity: 650
sheets, USB 2.0, Gigabit LAN, USB 2.0 host (cardstock- yes)

7ZU81A#BG)

$ 763.34

618.00

No Bid

No Bid

762.00

$ 717.00

$ 744.97

744.00

2-3 weeks

1to 30

Multi-Function Printers (MFP): will print, copy, scan, fax

HP LaserJet Pro 4101fdn multifuncton printer, B/W, laser,
letter/legal (replaces W1A29A#BG))

27618F#BG)J

S 520.85

328.00

No Bid

No Bid

$

526.00

S 494.00

S 492.61

497.00

2-3 weeks

1to 30

HP Laserlet Pro 4101fdw multifunction printer, B/W, laser
(replacement for W1A30A#BG)J)

27619F#BG)

$ 511.86

328.00

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

$ 504.00

$ 483.84

489.00

2-3 weeks

1to30

HP Laserlet Enterprise MFP M528dn multifunction printer, B/W,
laser, 8.5 in x 34.02 in (original), A4/legal (media), up to 45 ppm
(copying), 43 ppm (printing), 650 sheets, USB 2.0, Gigabit LAN,
USB 2.0 host

1PV64A#BG)

$ 1,382.15

870.00

No Bid

No Bid

$

1,373.00

$ 1,604.00

$  1,348.75

$

1,403.00

3-4 weeks
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1to30

Multi-Function Printers (MFP): will print, copy, scan, fax (cont.)

HP Color LaserJet Pro MFP 4301fdw multifunction printer, color,

laser, Legal (8.5 in x 14 in) (original), Af/Legal (media), up to 35

ppm copy and print, 300 sheets, 33.6 Kbps, USB, USB 2.0, Gigabit

LAN, USB 2.0 host, Wi-Fi(ac), Bluetooth (Replaces W1A80A#BG)) 4RA82F#BG)J

625.53

643.50

No Bid

No Bid

$

632.00

S 496.00

S 477.19

$

477.00

2-3 weeks

1to30

HP Color LaserJet Pro MFP 4301fdn multifunction printer, color,

laser, Legal (8.5 in x 14 in) (original), A4/Legal (media), up to 35

ppm copy and print, 300 sheets, 33.6 Kbps, USB, USB 2.0, Gigabit

LAN, USB 2.0 host ARAB1F#BG)

$

605.98

643.50

No Bid

No Bid

$

614.00

S 501.00

S 477.19

$

477.00

2-3 weeks

1to30

HP Color LaserlJet Enterprise MFP 5800dn Multifunction printer,
color (replaces M578dn) 6QN29A#BG)

$

2,041.39

1,864.00

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

S 2,104.00

$  1,992.06

$

2,072.00

5-7 weeks

1to30

HP Color LaserJet Enterprise MFP 6800dn multifunction printer,

color, laser, Legal (8.5 x 14) (original), A4/Legal (media), up to 55

ppm, 650 sheets, Gigabit LAN, USB 3.0, USB 2.0 host, USB3.0

host (replaces M653dn) 6QN35A#BG)

$

2,965.52

2,946.00

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

$ 3,341.00

$  2,893.86

$

3,050.00

2-5 weeks

*Price Expires 10/26/24




