HP Black/White and Color Printers and Multi-Function Printers (MFP) May 2025

Quantity

Item

Part#

Countertrade

Data Center
Warehouse

Fisher's

Howard

Insight Public
Sector

Les Olson

Pacific Office
Automation

Software
House Int'l
(SHI)

VLCM

Extended Order
Lead Times

1to30

B/W Printers

HP Laserlet Enterprise M607n printer, B/W, laser, Ad/Legal,
1200 x 1200 dpi, up to 55 ppm, capacity: 650 sheets, USB 2.0,
Gigabit LAN, USB 2.0 host

KOQ14A#BG)

891.67

S 871.66

$

749.00

$  695.13

No Bid

S 903.95

910.00

S 671.00

S 976.52

$

919.00

2 weeks

1to30

HP Laserlet Enterprise M608n printer, B/W, laser, Ad/Legal,
1200 x 1200 dpi, up to 65 ppm, capacity: 650 sheets, USB 2.0,
Gigabit LAN, USB 2.0 host

KOQ17A#BG)

983.65

S 971.56

$

828.00

S 967.94

No Bid

S 997.19

1,015.00

S 928.00

$ 1,363.64

$

1,013.00

2 weeks

1to30

HP Laserlet Enterprise M611dn printer, B/W, Duplex, laser,
Ad/legal, 1200 x 1200 dpi, up to 65 ppm, USB 2.0, Gigabit LAN,
USB 2.0 host

7PS84A#BG)

1,276.75

$ 1,259.53

$

1,075.00

$1,157.21

No Bid

S 1,9432

1,311.00

$ 1,073.00

$ 1,615.28

$

1,316.00

2 weeks

1to30

HP Laserlet Enterprise M612dn printer, B/W, Duplex, laser,
Ad/legal, 1200 x 1200 dpi, up to 75 ppm, capacity: 650 sheets,
USB 2.0, Gigabit LAN, USB 2.0 host

7PS86A#BG)

1,743.85

S 1,72136

$

1,468.00

$1,648.26

No Bid

S 1,767.85

1,795.00

$  1,554.00

$ 2,312.09

$

1,797.00

2 weeks

1to30

HP Laserlet Enterprise M507dn printer, B/W, Duplex, laser,
Ad/Legal, 1200 x 1200 dpi, up to 45 ppm, capacity: 650 sheets,
USB 2.0, Gigabit LAN, USB 2.0 host

1PV87A#BG)

853.46

$ 840.93

$

718.00

$ 695.13

No Bid

$ 865.21

864.00

S 679.00

$ 976.52

$

879.00

2 weeks

1to30

HP Laserlet Pro 4001n printer, B/W, laser (replacement for
W1AS52AH#BG))

27599F#BG)

292.44

S 286.94

$

287.00

$ 329.59

No Bid

$ 296.26

298.00

$ 299.00

$ 31791

$

294.00

2 weeks

1to30

HP Laserlet Pro 4001dn printer, B/W, Duplex, laser
(replacement for W1A53A#BG))

27600F#BG)

33451

S 240.69

$

325.00

$ 36577

No Bid

$ 257.56

340.00

$ 329.00

S 279.77

$

313.00

2 weeks

Color Printers

1to30

HP Color LaserJet Enterprise 6701dn printer, Color, Duplex, 65
ppm, 650 sheets, 2 trays (cardstock-yes) (replaces M653dn)

58M42AH#BG)

2,211.99

$ 217714

$

1,825.00

$1,629.10

No Bid

S 224244

2,251.00

S 1,601.00

$ 2,291.99

$

2,204.00

3-6 weeks

1to30

HP Color LaserJet Pro 4201dn printer, color, Duplex (cardstock-
no)(Replaces W1Y44A#BG))

4RA85F#BGJ

519.22

S 386.23

$

498.00

$ 515.86

No Bid

S 412.77

540.00

S 494.00

S 431.02

$

482.00

2 weeks

1to30

HP Color LaserJet Pro 4201dw printer, color, Duplex, USB 2.0,
Gigabit LAN, Wi-Fi(n), USB host (cardstock- no)(replaces
W1Y45A#BG)/ M454dw)

4RA86F#BGJ

542.13

S 420.98

525.00

$ 519.24

No Bid

S 432.50

560.00

S 503.00

S  476.54

$

512.00

2-3 weeks

1to30

HP Color LaserJet Enterprise 5700dn printer, color, duplex,
laser, 1200 x 1200 dpi, up to 45 ppm, capacity: 550 sheets, USB
2.0, Gigabit LAN (cardstock- yes)(replaces 7ZU78A#BG))

6QN28AHBG)

1,160.48

$  1,137.53

977.95

S 820.53

No Bid

S 1,172.13

1,175.00

S 793.00

$ 1,150.32

$

1,106.00

2-3 weeks

1to30

HP Color LaserJet Enterprise M554dn printer, color, duplex,
laser, A4/legal, 1200 x 1200 dpi, up to 35 ppm, capacity: 650
sheets, USB 2.0, Gigabit LAN, USB 2.0 host (cardstock- yes)

7ZU81AH#BG)

883.93

S 869.66

744.00

S 62536

No Bid

S 896.09

898.00

S 609.00

S 881.68

$

848.00

2-3 weeks

1to30

Multi-Function Printers (MFP): will print, copy, scan, fax

HP LaserJet Pro 4101fdn multifuncton printer, B/W, laser,
letter/legal (replaces W1A29A#BG))

2Z618F#BG)J

514.71

S 387.24

488.00

S 329.59

No Bid

S 413.63

526.00

S 349.00

S 43224

$

473.00

2-3 weeks

1to30

HP LaserJet Pro 4101fdw multifunction printer, B/W, laser
(replacement for W1A30A#BG))

2Z619F#BG)

505.82

S 387.24

495.00

S 329.59

No Bid

S 413.63

523.00

S 359.00

S 43224

$

473.00

2-3 weeks

1to30

HP LaserJet Enterprise MFP M528dn multifunction printer,
B/W, laser, 8.5 in x 34.02 in (original), A4/legal (media), up to
45 ppm (copying), 43 ppm (printing), 650 sheets, USB 2.0,
Gigabit LAN, USB 2.0 host

1PV64A#BG)

1,600.34

$ 157870

$

1,347.50

S 879.35

No Bid

S 1,622.37

1,618.00

S 849.00

$ 2,019.94

$

1,649.00

3-4 weeks

1to30

HP Color LaserJet Pro MFP 4301fdw multifunction printer,
color, laser, Legal (8.5 in x 14 in) (original), Af/Legal (media), up
to 35 ppm copy and print, 300 sheets, 33.6 Kbps, USB, USB 2.0,
Gigabit LAN, USB 2.0 host, Wi-Fi(ac), Bluetooth (Replaces

4RA82FH#BG)

609.04

S 494.63

$

600.00

S 655.16

No Bid

S 528.54

632.00

S 592.00

S  554.96

$

623.00

2-3 weeks

1to30

HP Color LaserJet Pro MFP 4301fdn multifunction printer, color,
laser, Legal (8.5 in x 14 in) (original), A4/Legal (media), up to 35
ppm copy and print, 300 sheets, 33.6 Kbps, USB, USB 2.0,
Gigabit LAN, USB 2.0 host

4RA81F#BG)

585.54

S 525.53

$

583.00

S 655.16

No Bid

S 560.69

614.00

S 632.00

S 585.89

$

639.00

2-3 weeks




HP Black/White and Color Printers and Multi-Function Printers (MFP) May 2025

Software
Data Center Insight Public Pacific Office  House Int'l Extended Order
Quantity Item Part# Countertrade Warehouse  Dex Fisher's Howard Sector Les Olson Automation (SHI) VLCM Lead Times
Multi-Function Printers (MFP): will print, copy, scan, fax (cont.
11030 HP Color LaserJet Enterprise MFP 5800dn Multifunction printer,
color (replaces M578dn) 6QN29A#BG) S 2,363.63 | S 2,32828 [ $ 1,989.00 | $ 1,883.86 No Bid S 2,396.16 | $ 2,413.00 [ $ 1,796.00 | $ 2,641.24 | $ 2,436.00 5-7 weeks
HP Color LaserJet Enterprise MFP 6800dn multifunction printer,
11030 color, laser, Legal (8.5 x 14) (original), A4/Legal (media), up to
55 ppm, 650 sheets, Gigabit LAN, USB 3.0, USB 2.0 host, USB3.0
host (replaces M653dn) 6QN35A#BG) S 3,433.64 | S 3,385.58 [ $ 2,891.00 | $2,975.59 No Bid S 3,480.89 [ S 3,519.00 | $ 2,824.00 | S 4,169.96 | $ 3,539.00 2-5 weeks




