HP Black/White and Color Printers and Multi-Function Printers (MFP) July 2024

Award

Award after
07/13/24

Quantity

Part#

Connection

Countertrade

Howard

Insight Public
Sector

Les Olson

Pacific Office
Automation

Software
House Int'l

VLCM

Extended Order
Lead Times

B/W Printers

1to 30

HP LaserJet Enterprise M607n printer, B/W, laser, A4/Legal,
1200 x 1200 dpi, up to 55 ppm, capacity: 650 sheets, USB 2.0,
Gigabit LAN, USB 2.0 host

KOQ14A#BG)

No Bid

S 765.55

No Bid

S 771.33

S 772.00

S 722.00

S 750.72

No Bid

2 weeks

1to 30

HP Laserlet Enterprise M608n printer, B/W, laser, A4/Legal,
1200 x 1200 dpi, up to 65 ppm, capacity: 650 sheets, USB 2.0,
Gigabit LAN, USB 2.0 host

KOQ17A#BG)

No Bid

S 844.52

No Bid

S 873.91

S 862.00

S 821.00

S 828.16

No Bid

2 weeks

1to 30

HP Laserlet Enterprise M611dn printer, B/W, Duplex, laser,
A4/legal, 1200 x 1200 dpi, up to 65 ppm, USB 2.0, Gigabit LAN,

USB 2.0 host

7PS84A#BG)

No Bid

S 1,096.16

No Bid

S 1,441.12

$ 1,113.00

S 1,066.00

S 1,074.96

No Bid

2 weeks

1to 30

HP Laserlet Enterprise M612dn printer, B/W, Duplex, laser,
A4/legal, 1200 x 1200 dpi, up to 75 ppm, capacity: 650 sheets,
USB 2.0, Gigabit LAN, USB 2.0 host

7PS86A#BG)

No Bid

S 1,497.19

No Bid

$ 1,523.09

No Bid

S 1,455.00

S 1,468.19

No Bid

2 weeks

1to 30

HP Laserlet Enterprise M507dn printer, B/W, Duplex, laser,
A4/Legal, 1200 x 1200 dpi, up to 52 ppm, capacity: 650 sheets,
USB 2.0, Gigabit LAN, USB 2.0 host

1PV87A#BGI

No Bid

S 732.73

No Bid

S 739.76

No Bid

S 689.00

S 718.55

No Bid

2 weeks

1to 30

HP Laserlet Pro 4001n printer, B/W, laser (replacement for

W1A52A#BGJ)

2Z599F#BG)

No Bid

S 296.06

No Bid

S 181.53

S 307.00

S 170.00

$163.45*

No Bid

2 weeks

1to 30

HP Laserlet Pro 4001dn printer, B/W, Duplex, laser
(replacement for W1A53A#BG))

27600F#BGJ

No Bid

S 338.51

No Bid

S 220.61

S 342.00

S 225.00

S 199.60

No Bid

2 weeks

Color Printers

1to 30

HP Color LaserJet Enterprise 6701dn printer, Color (replaces

M653dn)

58M42A#BG)

No Bid

S 1,899.10

No Bid

$ 1,909.10

$ 1,910.00

S 1,799.00

S 1,862.33

No Bid

3-6 weeks

1to 30

HP Color LaserJet Pro 4201dn printer, color, Duplex (Replaces

W1Y44AH#BG))

4RA85F#BG)

No Bid

S 526.01

No Bid

S 527.82

S 540.00

S 399.00

$509.98*

No Bid

2 weeks

1to 30

HP Color LaserJet Pro 4201dw printer, color, Duplex, USB 2.0,
Gigabit LAN, Wi-Fi(n), USB host (replaces W1Y45A#BGJ/

M454dw)

4RA86F#BG)

No Bid

S 545.18

No Bid

S 552.95

S 560.00

S 420.00

S 550.11

No Bid

2 weeks

1to 30

HP Color LaserJet Enterprise 5700dn printer, color, duplex,
laser, 1200 x 1200 dpi, up to 45 ppm, capacity: 550 sheets, USB
2.0, Gigabit LAN (replaces 7ZU78A#BGJ)

6QN28A#BG)

No Bid

S 996.34

No Bid

S 999.74

$  1,000.00

S 854.00

S 1,005.37

No Bid

2 weeks

1to 30

HP Color LaserJet Enterprise M554dn printer, color, duplex,
laser, Ad/legal, 1200 x 1200 dpi, up to 35 ppm, capacity: 650
sheets, USB 2.0, Gigabit LAN, USB 2.0 host

7ZU81A#BG)

No Bid

S 758.90

No Bid

S 761.48

S 762.00

S 678.00

S 744.19

No Bid

2 weeks

Multi-Function Printers (MFP): will print, copy, scan, fax

*= price good to 07/13/24

1to 30

HP Laserlet Pro 4101fdn multifuncton printer, B/W, laser,
letter/legal (replaces W1A29A#BG))

27618F#BGJ

No Bid

S 517.75

No Bid

S 519.47

S 526.00

S 280.00

S 500.68

No Bid

2 weeks

1to 30

HP LaserJet Pro 4101fdw multifunction printer, B/W, laser
(replacement for W1A30A#BG))

27619F#BG)

No Bid

S 508.82

No Bid

S 510.87

S 523.00

S 395.00

S 498.97

No Bid

2 weeks

1to 30

HP Laserlet Enterprise MFP M528dn multifunction printer,
B/W, laser, 8.5 in x 34.02 in (original), A4/legal (media), up to
45 ppm (copying), 43 ppm (printing), 650 sheets, USB 2.0,
Gigabit LAN, USB 2.0 host

1PV64A#BG)

No Bid

S 1,373.97

No Bid

S 1,394.24

$ 1,373.00

S 1,333.00

S 1,347.36

No Bid

2 weeks
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1to 30

Multi-Function Printers (MFP): will print, copy, scan, fax (cont)

HP Color LaserJet Pro MFP 4301fdw multifunction printer,
color, laser, Legal (8.5 in x 14 in) (original), Af/Legal (media), up
to 35 ppm copy and print, 300 sheets, 33.6 Kbps, USB, USB 2.0,

Gigabit LAN, USB 2.0 host, Wi-Fi(ac), Bluetooth (Replaces 4RA82F#BG)

No Bid

S 612.33

No Bid

S 473.99

S

632.00

S 499.00

$433.04*

No Bid

2 weeks

1to 30

HP Color LaserJet Pro MFP 4301fdn multifunction printer,
color, laser, Legal (8.5 in x 14 in) (original), A4/Legal (media), up
to 35 ppm copy and print, 300 sheets, 33.6 Kbps, USB, USB 2.0,

Gigabit LAN, USB 2.0 host 4ARA81F#BG)

No Bid

S 593.21

No Bid

S 473.99

S

614.00

S 466.00

433.04

No Bid

2 weeks

1to 30

HP Color LaserJet Enterprise MFP 5800dn Multifunction

printer, color (replaces M578dn) 6QN29A#BG)

No Bid

S 2,029.30

No Bid

S 2,047.03

S

2,048.00

S 1,818.00

2,311.91

No Bid

4-6 weeks

1to 30

HP Color LaserJet Enterprise MFP 6800dn multifunction
printer, color, laser, Legal (8.5 x 14) (original), A4/Legal (media),
up to 55 ppm, 650 sheets, Gigabit LAN, USB 3.0, USB 2.0 host,

USB3.0 host (replaces M653dn) 6QN35A#BG)

No Bid

S 2,947.96

No Bid

S 3,732.77

S

2,987.00

S 2,828.00

2,890.88

No Bid

2-4 weeks

*= price good to 07/13/24




