
HP Black/White and Color Printers and Multi-Function Printers (MFP) February 2025 Award

Quantity Item Part#  Countertrade  Dex Imaging  Fisher's Howard

 Insight Public 

Sector Les Olson

 Pacific Office 

Automation 

 Software 

House Int'l  

(SHI) VLCM

Extended Order 

Lead Time

B/W Printers

1 to 30

HP LaserJet Enterprise M607n printer, B/W, laser, A4/Legal, 

1200 x 1200 dpi, up to 55 ppm, capacity: 650 sheets, USB 2.0, 

Gigabit LAN, USB 2.0 host K0Q14A#BGJ 753.89$              749.00$               685.13$      895.00$      $           766.06 772.00$       685.00$            751.49$           779.00$         2 weeks

1 to 30

HP LaserJet Enterprise M608n printer, B/W, laser, A4/Legal, 

1200 x 1200 dpi, up to 65 ppm, capacity: 650 sheets, USB 2.0, 

Gigabit LAN, USB 2.0 host K0Q17A#BGJ 838.93$              828.00$               957.94$      1,251.00$  845.09$           862.00$       957.00$            829.02$           866.00$         2 weeks

1 to 30

HP LaserJet Enterprise M611dn printer, B/W, Duplex, laser, 

A4/legal, 1200 x 1200 dpi, up to 65 ppm, USB 2.0, Gigabit LAN, 

USB 2.0 host 7PS84A#BGJ 1,085.09$           1,075.00$            1,137.21$   1,485.00$   $        1,096.89 1,113.00$    1,137.00$         1,076.05$        1,120.00$     2 weeks

1 to 30

HP LaserJet Enterprise M612dn printer, B/W, Duplex, laser, 

A4/legal, 1200 x 1200 dpi, up to 75 ppm, capacity: 650 sheets, 

USB 2.0, Gigabit LAN, USB 2.0 host 7PS86A#BGJ 1,484.76$           1,468.00$            1,628.26$   2,125.00$   $        1,498.18 1,524.00$    1,628.00$         1,469.70$        1,525.00$     2 weeks

1 to 30

HP LaserJet Enterprise M507dn printer, B/W, Duplex, laser, 

A4/Legal, 1200 x 1200 dpi, up to 52 ppm, capacity: 650 sheets, 

USB 2.0, Gigabit LAN, USB 2.0 host 1PV87A#BGJ 516.34$              718.00$               685.13$      895.00$      $           733.22 No Bid 685.00$            719.29$           746.00$         2 weeks

1 to 30
HP LaserJet Pro 4001n printer, B/W, laser (replacement for 

W1A52A#BGJ) 2Z599F#BGJ 290.68$              287.00$               326.59$      193.00$      $           296.26 298.00$       216.00$            183.27$            $        192.00 2 weeks

1 to 30
HP LaserJet Pro 4001dn printer, B/W, Duplex, laser 

(replacement for W1A53A#BGJ) 2Z600F#BGJ 248.26$              325.00$               357.77$      255.00$     246.84$           340.00$       263.00$            242.15$            $        251.00 2 weeks

Color Printers

1 to 30 HP Color LaserJet Enterprise 6701dn printer, Color, Duplex, 65 

ppm, 650 sheets, 2 trays (cardstock-yes) (replaces M653dn) 58M42A#BGJ 1,867.11$           1,825.00$            1,614.10$   2,107.00$   $        1,900.37 No Bid 1,587.00$         1,864.26$        1,927.00$     3-6 weeks

1 to 30
HP Color LaserJet Pro 4201dn printer, color, Duplex (cardstock-

no)(Replaces W1Y44A#BGJ) 4RA85F#BGJ 387.61$              498.00$               505.86$      426.00$     412.77$           540.00$       427.00$            404.93$            $        422.00 2 weeks

1 to 30

HP Color LaserJet Pro 4201dw printer, color, Duplex, USB 2.0, 

Gigabit LAN, Wi-Fi(n), USB host (cardstock- no)(replaces 

W1Y45A#BGJ/ M454dw) 4RA86F#BGJ 535.28$              525.00$               529.24$      578.00$     545.54$           560.00$       529.00$            535.18$            $        553.00 2-3 weeks

1 to 30
HP Color LaserJet Enterprise 5700dn printer, color, duplex, 

laser, 1200 x 1200 dpi, up to 45 ppm, capacity: 550 sheets, USB 

2.0, Gigabit LAN (cardstock- yes)(replaces 7ZU78A#BGJ) 6QN28A#BGJ 978.24$              977.95$               810.53$      1,058.00$  996.99$           No Bid 788.00$            978.05$           968.00$         2-3 weeks

1 to 30
HP Color LaserJet Enterprise M554dn printer, color, duplex, 

laser, A4/legal, 1200 x 1200 dpi, up to 35 ppm, capacity: 650 

sheets, USB 2.0, Gigabit LAN, USB 2.0 host (cardstock- yes) 7ZU81A#BGJ 745.11$              744.00$               617.36$      806.00$      $           759.40 762.00$       607.00$            744.97$           737.00$         2-3 weeks

Multi-Function Printers (MFP): will print, copy, scan, fax

1 to 30
HP LaserJet Pro 4101fdn multifuncton printer, B/W, laser, 

letter/legal (replaces W1A29A#BGJ) 2Z618F#BGJ 381.82$              488.00$               327.59$      382.00$     370.76$           526.00$       379.00$            363.71$            $        379.00 2-3 weeks

1 to 30
HP LaserJet Pro 4101fdw multifunction printer, B/W, laser 

(replacement for W1A30A#BGJ) 2Z619F#BGJ 499.81$              495.00$               327.59$      382.00$     509.16$           523.00$       379.00$            363.71$            $        379.00 2-3 weeks

1 to 30

HP LaserJet Enterprise MFP M528dn multifunction printer, 

B/W, laser, 8.5 in x 34.02 in (original), A4/legal (media), up to 45 

ppm (copying), 43 ppm (printing), 650 sheets, USB 2.0, Gigabit 

LAN, USB 2.0 host 1PV64A#BGJ 1,360.08$           1,347.50$            869.35$      1,860.00$   $        1,374.88 1,373.00$    839.00$            1,348.75$        1,404.00$     3-4 weeks
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Multi-Function Printers (MFP): will print, copy, scan, fax (cont.)

1 to 30

HP Color LaserJet Pro MFP 4301fdw multifunction printer, 

color, laser, Legal (8.5 in x 14 in) (original), Af/Legal (media), up 

to 35 ppm copy and print, 300 sheets, 33.6 Kbps, USB, USB 2.0, 

Gigabit LAN, USB 2.0 host, Wi-Fi(ac), Bluetooth (Replaces 

W1A80A#BGJ) 4RA82F#BGJ 438.85$              600.00$               646.16$      558.00$     612.74$           632.00$       558.00$            518.49$            $        535.00 2-3 weeks

1 to 30

HP Color LaserJet Pro MFP 4301fdn multifunction printer, color, 

laser, Legal (8.5 in x 14 in) (original), A4/Legal (media), up to 35 

ppm copy and print, 300 sheets, 33.6 Kbps, USB, USB 2.0, 

Gigabit LAN, USB 2.0 host 4RA81F#BGJ 420.62$              583.00$               646.16$      578.00$     560.69$           614.00$       568.00$            550.04$            $        560.00 2-3 weeks

1 to 30
HP Color LaserJet Enterprise MFP 5800dn Multifunction printer, 

color (replaces M578dn) 6QN29A#BGJ 2,000.11$           1,989.00$            1,863.86$   2,433.00$   $        2,030.65 No Bid 1,809.00$         1,992.06$        2,065.00$     5-7 weeks

1 to 30 

HP Color LaserJet Enterprise MFP 6800dn multifunction printer, 

color, laser, Legal (8.5 x 14) (original), A4/Legal (media), up to 55 

ppm, 650 sheets, Gigabit LAN, USB 3.0, USB 2.0 host, USB3.0 

host (replaces M653dn) 6QN35A#BGJ 2,914.12$           2,891.00$            2,945.59$   3,844.00$  2,949.91$        No Bid 2,909.00$         2,893.86$        3,002.00$     2-5 weeks


