
HP Black/White and Color Printers and Multi-Function Printers (MFP) April 2024 Award
 Award after 

04/15/24 

Quantity Item Part# Connection  Countertrade Howard

 Insight Public 

Sector Les Olson

 Pacific Office 

Automation 

 Software 

House Int'l VLCM

Extended Order 

Lead Times

B/W Printers

1 to 30

HP LaserJet Enterprise M607n printer, B/W, laser, A4/Legal, 1200 

x 1200 dpi, up to 55 ppm, capacity: 650 sheets, USB 2.0, Gigabit 

LAN, USB 2.0 host K0Q14A#BGJ No Bid 757.73$              No Bid  $          771.33 772.00$          694.00$            743.65$          No Bid 2 weeks

1 to 30

HP LaserJet Enterprise M608n printer, B/W, laser, A4/Legal, 1200 

x 1200 dpi, up to 65 ppm, capacity: 650 sheets, USB 2.0, Gigabit 

LAN, USB 2.0 host K0Q17A#BGJ No Bid 835.90$              No Bid 861.13$           No Bid 851.00$            822.84$          No Bid 2 weeks

1 to 30

HP LaserJet Enterprise M611dn printer, B/W, Duplex, laser, 

A4/legal, 1200 x 1200 dpi, up to 65 ppm, USB 2.0, Gigabit LAN, 

USB 2.0 host 7PS84A#BGJ No Bid 1,084.98$           No Bid  $       1,112.35 1,113.00$       1,118.00$        1,066.73$       No Bid 2 weeks

1 to 30

HP LaserJet Enterprise M612dn printer, B/W, Duplex, laser, 

A4/legal, 1200 x 1200 dpi, up to 75 ppm, capacity: 650 sheets, 

USB 2.0, Gigabit LAN, USB 2.0 host 7PS86A#BGJ No Bid 1,481.91$           No Bid  $       1,519.03 1,524.00$       1,526.00$        1,457.89$       No Bid 2 weeks

1 to 30

HP LaserJet Enterprise M507dn printer, B/W, Duplex, laser, 

A4/Legal, 1200 x 1200 dpi, up to 52 ppm, capacity: 650 sheets, 

USB 2.0, Gigabit LAN, USB 2.0 host 1PV87A#BGJ No Bid 725.26$              No Bid  $          739.76 No Bid 689.00$            712.14$          No Bid 2 weeks

1 to 30
HP LaserJet Pro 4001n printer, B/W, laser (replacement for 

W1A52A#BGJ) 2Z599F#BGJ No Bid 289.64$              No Bid  $          212.46 307.00$          199.00$            191.13$          No Bid 2 weeks

1 to 30
HP LaserJet Pro 4001dn printer, B/W, Duplex, laser (replacement 

for W1A53A#BGJ) 2Z600F#BGJ No Bid 335.57$              No Bid 251.53$           342.00$          235.00$            223.36$          No Bid 2 weeks

Color Printers

1 to 30
HP Color LaserJet Enterprise 6701dn printer, Color (replaces 

M653dn) 58M42A#BGJ No Bid 1,879.72$           No Bid  $       1,909.10 1,910.00$       1,629.00$        1,843.73$       No Bid 3-6 weeks

1 to 30 HP Color LaserJet Pro 4201dn printer, color, Duplex (Replaces 

W1Y44A#BGJ) 4RA85F#BGJ No Bid 521.46$              No Bid 527.82$           540.00$          419.00$            489.66$           No Bid 2 weeks

1 to 30
HP Color LaserJet Pro 4201dw printer, color, Duplex, USB 2.0, 

Gigabit LAN, Wi-Fi(n), USB host (replaces W1Y45A#BGJ/ 

M454dw) 4RA86F#BGJ No Bid 551.36$              No Bid 547.04$           560.00$          447.00$            529.04$           No Bid 2 weeks

1 to 30

HP Color LaserJet Enterprise 5700dn printer, color, duplex, laser, 

1200 x 1200 dpi, up to 45 ppm, capacity: 550 sheets, USB 2.0, 

Gigabit LAN (replaces 7ZU78A#BGJ) 6QN28A#BGJ No Bid 986.17$              No Bid 999.74$           1,000.00$       837.00$            966.84$          No Bid 2 weeks

1 to 30

HP Color LaserJet Enterprise M554dn printer, color, duplex, 

laser, A4/legal, 1200 x 1200 dpi, up to 35 ppm, capacity: 650 

sheets, USB 2.0, Gigabit LAN, USB 2.0 host 7ZU81A#BGJ No Bid 751.15$              No Bid  $          761.48 No Bid 651.00$            736.43$          No Bid 2 weeks

Multi-Function Printers (MFP): will print, copy, scan, fax

1 to 30
HP LaserJet Pro 4101fdn multifuncton printer, B/W, laser, 

letter/legal (replaces W1A29A#BGJ) 2Z618F#BGJ No Bid 512.47$              No Bid 519.47$           526.00$          401.00$            482.01$          No Bid 2 weeks

1 to 30
HP LaserJet Pro 4101fdw multifunction printer, B/W, laser 

(replacement for W1A30A#BGJ) 2Z619F#BGJ No Bid 518.72$              No Bid 510.87$           523.00$          415.00$            493.84$          No Bid 2 weeks

1 to 30

HP LaserJet Enterprise MFP M528dn multifunction printer, B/W, 

laser, 8.5 in x 34.02 in (original), A4/legal (media), up to 45 ppm 

(copying), 43 ppm (printing), 650 sheets, USB 2.0, Gigabit LAN, 

USB 2.0 host 1PV64A#BGJ No Bid 1,359.95$           No Bid  $       1,394.24 No Bid 1,399.00$        1,337.07$       No Bid 2 weeks

1 to 30

HP Color LaserJet Pro MFP 4301fdw multifunction printer, color, 

laser, Legal (8.5 in x 14 in) (original), Af/Legal (media), up to 35 

ppm copy and print, 300 sheets, 33.6 Kbps, USB, USB 2.0, Gigabit 

LAN, USB 2.0 host, Wi-Fi(ac), Bluetooth (Replaces W1A80A#BGJ) 4RA82F#BGJ No Bid 606.08$              No Bid 515.22$           632.00$          501.00$            466.93$          No Bid 2 weeks
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Multi-Function Printers (MFP): will print, copy, scan, fax  (cont.)

1 to 30

HP Color LaserJet Pro MFP 4301fdn multifunction printer, color, 

laser, Legal (8.5 in x 14 in) (original), A4/Legal (media), up to 35 

ppm copy and print, 300 sheets, 33.6 Kbps, USB, USB 2.0, Gigabit 

LAN, USB 2.0 host 4RA81F#BGJ No Bid 587.15$              No Bid 515.22$           614.00$          501.00$            $        466.93* No Bid 2 weeks

1 to 30
HP Color LaserJet Enterprise MFP 5800dn Multifunction printer, 

color (replaces M578dn) 6QN29A#BGJ No Bid 2,008.59$           No Bid  $       2,042.39 2,048.00$       1,863.00$        1,971.84$       No Bid 4-6 weeks

1 to 30 

HP Color LaserJet Enterprise MFP 6800dn multifunction printer, 

color, laser, Legal (8.5 x 14) (original), A4/Legal (media), up to 55 

ppm, 650 sheets, Gigabit LAN, USB 3.0, USB 2.0 host, USB3.0 

host (replaces M653dn) 6QN35A#BGJ No Bid 2,917.88$           No Bid 3,725.43$       No Bid 2,944.00$        2,867.41$       No Bid 2-4 weeks

* = pricing expires 4/15/24


