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1 to 30

HP LaserJet Enterprise M607n printer, B/W, laser, A4/Legal, 
1200 x 1200 dpi, up to 55 ppm, capacity: 650 sheets, USB 2.0, 
Gigabit LAN, USB 2.0 host K0Q14A#BGJ 860.51$       No Bid 749.00$      No Bid 929.00$      $     664.59 No Bid 672.00$        No Bid 868.00$      2 weeks

1 to 30

HP LaserJet Enterprise M608n printer, B/W, laser, A4/Legal, 
1200 x 1200 dpi, up to 65 ppm, capacity: 650 sheets, USB 2.0, 
Gigabit LAN, USB 2.0 host K0Q17A#BGJ 949.28$       No Bid 828.00$      No Bid 1,034.00$ 997.19$     No Bid 885.00$        No Bid 949.00$      2 weeks

1 to 30

HP LaserJet Enterprise M611dn printer, B/W, Duplex, laser, 
A4/legal, 1200 x 1200 dpi, up to 65 ppm, USB 2.0, Gigabit LAN, 
USB 2.0 host 7PS84A#BGJ 1,232.13$    No Bid 1,065.00$   No Bid 1,342.00$  $  1,294.32 No Bid 1,055.00$     No Bid 1,237.00$  2 weeks

1 to 30

HP LaserJet Enterprise M612dn printer, B/W, Duplex, laser, 
A4/legal, 1200 x 1200 dpi, up to 75 ppm, capacity: 650 sheets, 
USB 2.0, Gigabit LAN, USB 2.0 host 7PS86A#BGJ 1,682.90$    No Bid 1,468.00$   No Bid 1,833.00$  $  1,767.85 No Bid 1,499.00$     No Bid 1,687.00$  2 weeks

1 to 30

HP LaserJet Enterprise M507dn printer, B/W, Duplex, laser, 
A4/Legal, 1200 x 1200 dpi, up to 45 ppm, capacity: 650 sheets, 
USB 2.0, Gigabit LAN, USB 2.0 host 1PV87A#BGJ 823.63$       No Bid 718.00$      No Bid 898.00$      $     865.21 No Bid 650.00$        No Bid 837.00$      2 weeks

1 to 30
HP LaserJet Pro 4001n printer, B/W, laser (replacement for 
W1A52A#BGJ) 2Z599F#BGJ 306.27$       No Bid 286.75$      No Bid 334.00$      $     238.44 No Bid 328.00$        No Bid $315.00 2 weeks

1 to 30
HP LaserJet Pro 4001dn printer, B/W, Duplex, laser 
(replacement for W1A53A#BGJ) 2Z600F#BGJ 353.98$       No Bid 325.00$      No Bid 386.00$     271.63$     No Bid 355.00$        No Bid $358.00 2 weeks

1 to 30
HP Color LaserJet Enterprise 6701dn printer, Color, Duplex, 65 
ppm, 650 sheets, 2 trays (cardstock-yes) (replaces M653dn) 58M42A#BGJ 2,134.68$    No Bid 1,825.00$   No Bid 2,325.00$  $  1,621.85 No Bid 1,542.00$     No Bid 2,090.00$  3-6 weeks

1 to 30
HP Color LaserJet Pro 4201dn printer, color, Duplex (cardstock-
no)(Replaces W1Y44A#BGJ) 4RA85F#BGJ 550.44$       No Bid 498.00$      No Bid 600.00$     451.19$     No Bid 496.00$        No Bid $450.00 2 weeks

1 to 30

HP Color LaserJet Pro 4201dw printer, color, Duplex, USB 2.0, 
Gigabit LAN, Wi-Fi(n), USB host (cardstock- no)(replaces 
W1Y45A#BGJ/ M454dw) 4RA86F#BGJ 568.09$       No Bid 525.00$      No Bid 619.00$     405.59$     No Bid 517.00$        No Bid $478.00 2-3 weeks

1 to 30

HP Color LaserJet Enterprise 5700dn printer, color, duplex, 
laser, 1200 x 1200 dpi, up to 45 ppm, capacity: 550 sheets, USB 
2.0, Gigabit LAN (cardstock- yes)(replaces 7ZU78A#BGJ) 6QN28A#BGJ 1,119.93$    No Bid 977.95$      No Bid 1,220.00$ 651.19$     No Bid 774.00$        No Bid 1,050.00$  2-3 weeks

1 to 30

HP Color LaserJet Enterprise M554dn printer, color, duplex, 
laser, A4/legal, 1200 x 1200 dpi, up to 35 ppm, capacity: 650 
sheets, USB 2.0, Gigabit LAN, USB 2.0 host (cardstock- yes) 7ZU81A#BGJ 853.03$       No Bid 744.00$      No Bid 929.00$      $     875.07 No Bid 607.00$        No Bid 804.00$      2-3 weeks
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1 to 30
HP LaserJet Pro 4101fdn multifuncton printer, B/W, laser, 
letter/legal (replaces W1A29A#BGJ) 2Z618F#BGJ 542.61$       No Bid 488.00$      No Bid 591.00$     369.20$     No Bid 337.00$        No Bid $483.00 2-3 weeks

1 to 30
HP LaserJet Pro 4101fdw multifunction printer, B/W, laser 
(replacement for W1A30A#BGJ) 2Z619F#BGJ 618.65$       No Bid 495.00$      No Bid 623.00$     369.20$     No Bid 337.00$        No Bid $586.00 2-3 weeks

1 to 30

HP LaserJet Enterprise MFP M528dn multifunction printer, 
B/W, laser, 8.5 in x 34.02 in (original), A4/legal (media), up to 
45 ppm (copying), 43 ppm (printing), 650 sheets, USB 2.0, 
Gigabit LAN, USB 2.0 host 1PV64A#BGJ 1,544.41$    No Bid 1,347.00$   No Bid 1,683.00$  $  1,429.34 No Bid 981.00$        No Bid 1,551.00$  3-4 weeks

1 to 30

HP Color LaserJet Pro MFP 4301fdw multifunction printer, 
color, laser, Legal (8.5 in x 14 in) (original), Af/Legal (media), up 
to 35 ppm copy and print, 300 sheets, 33.6 Kbps, USB, USB 2.0, 
Gigabit LAN, USB 2.0 host, Wi-Fi(ac), Bluetooth (Replaces 4RA82F#BGJ 643.19$       No Bid 600.00$      No Bid 701.00$     480.14$     No Bid 645.00$        No Bid $653.00 2-3 weeks

1 to 30

HP Color LaserJet Pro MFP 4301fdn multifunction printer, 
color, laser, Legal (8.5 in x 14 in) (original), A4/Legal (media), 
up to 35 ppm copy and print, 300 sheets, 33.6 Kbps, USB, USB 
2.0, Gigabit LAN, USB 2.0 host 4RA81F#BGJ 623.10$       No Bid 583.00$      No Bid 673.00$     480.14$     No Bid 645.00$        No Bid $632.00 2-3 weeks

1 to 30
HP Color LaserJet Enterprise MFP 5800dn Multifunction 
printer, color (replaces M578dn) 6QN29A#BGJ 2,281.02$    No Bid 1,989.00$   No Bid 2,485.00$  $  1,495.18 No Bid 1,737.00$     No Bid 2,426.00$  5-7 weeks

1 to 30 

HP Color LaserJet Enterprise MFP 6800dn multifunction 
printer, color, laser, Legal (8.5 x 14) (original), A4/Legal 
(media), up to 55 ppm, 650 sheets, Gigabit LAN, USB 3.0, USB 
2.0 host, USB3.0 host (replaces M653dn) 6QN35A#BGJ 3,313.63$    No Bid 2,747.00$   No Bid 3,610.00$ 2,097.05$  No Bid 2,745.00$     No Bid 3,540.00$  2-5 weeks

Multi-Function Printers (MFP): will print, copy, scan, fax
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