HP Black/White and Color Printers and Multi-Function Printers (MFP) - November 2025 Award Highlighted in Yellow

Insight Pacific
_ Data Center Dex Public Office Software
Quantity Item Part# Countertrade Warehouse |maging Fisher's Howard  Sector Les Olson Automation House Int'l VLCM

B/W Printers

HP LaserJet Enterprise M607n printer, B/W, laser, A4/Legal,
1200 x 1200 dpi, up to 55 ppm, capacity: 650 sheets, USB 2.0,
1to 30 Gigabit LAN, USB 2.0 host KOQ14A#BG) No Bid No Bid $ 749.00|$ 685.00|$1,002.00 (S 939.76 S 910.00 | S 661.00 | No Bid $ 876.00 |2 weeks
HP LaserJet Enterprise M608n printer, B/W, laser, A4/Legal,
1200 x 1200 dpi, up to 65 ppm, capacity: 650 sheets, USB 2.0,
1to 30 Gigabit LAN, USB 2.0 host KOQ17A#BGJ No Bid No Bid S 828.00|$ 1,387.00 | $1,250.00 | $ 1,312.31 | $ 1,015.00 | $ 885.00 | No Bid S 967.00 |2 weeks
HP LaserJet Enterprise M611dn printer, B/W, Duplex, laser,
A4/legal, 1200 x 1200 dpi, up to 65 ppm, USB 2.0, Gigabit LAN,
1to 30 USB 2.0 host 7PS84A#BG) No Bid No Bid $ 1,065.00 | $ 1,314.00 | $1,652.00 | $ 1,554.47 | $ 1,311.00 | $ 1,052.00 | No Bid $ 1,255.00 |2 weeks
HP LaserJet Enterprise M612dn printer, B/W, Duplex, laser,
A4/legal, 1200 x 1200 dpi, up to 75 ppm, capacity: 650 sheets,
1to 30 USB 2.0, Gigabit LAN, USB 2.0 host 7PS86A#BG) No Bid No Bid $ 1,468.00 | No Bid $2,364.00 | $ 2,225.06 | $ 1,795.00 | $ 1,499.00 | No Bid $ 1,714.00 |2 weeks
HP LaserJet Enterprise M507dn printer, B/W, Duplex, laser,
A4/Legal, 1200 x 1200 dpi, up to 45 ppm, capacity: 650 sheets,

1to 30 USB 2.0, Gigabit LAN, USB 2.0 host 1PV87A#BG) No Bid No Bid $ 718.00|$ 875.00|$1,002.00 (S 939.76 S 864.00|S 675.00 | No Bid S 839.00 |2 weeks
HP LaserJet Pro 4001n printer, B/W, laser (replacement for

1to 30 W1AS52A#BG)) 27599F#BGJ No Bid No Bid $ 286.75|S 245.00|S$ 278.00($ 277.29|$ 325.00|$S 301.00 | No Bid $282.00|2 weeks
HP LaserJet Pro 4001dn printer, B/W, Duplex, laser

1to 30 (replacement for W1A53A#BG)J) 2Z600F#BGJ No Bid No Bid $ 325.00|S 280.00|S 325.00|S 324.87 (S 376.00|S$S 340.00 | No Bid $329.00|2 weeks

Color Printers

HP Color LaserJet Enterprise 6701dn printer, Color, Duplex, 65

1to 30 ppm, 650 sheets, 2 trays (cardstock-yes) (replaces M653dn) 58M42A#BG) No Bid No Bid $ 1,825.00 | $ 1,665.00 | $2,344.00 | $ 2,205.72 | $ 2,251.00 | $ 1,625.00 | No Bid $ 2,174.00 |3-6 weeks
HP Color LaserJet Pro 4201dn printer, color, Duplex (cardstock-
1to 30 no)(Replaces W1Y44A#BGJ) 4RA85F#BG) No Bid No Bid S 498.00 S 461.00|S$ 500.00 |$ 498.95|$ 597.00|$S 496.00 | No Bid $499.00* |2 weeks

HP Color LaserJet Pro 4201dw printer, color, Duplex, USB 2.0,
Gigabit LAN, Wi-Fi(n), USB host (cardstock- no)(replaces
1to 30 W1Y45A#BG)/ M454dw) 4RA86F#BG) No Bid No Bid S 525.00 S 420.00|S 493.00|$ 52854|$S 617.00|$ 517.00 | No Bid $492.00(2-3 weeks

HP Color LaserJet Enterprise 5700dn printer, color, duplex,
laser, 1200 x 1200 dpi, up to 45 ppm, capacity: 550 sheets, USB
1to 30 2.0, Gigabit LAN (cardstock- yes)(replaces 7ZU78A#BGJ) 6QN28A#BG) No Bid No Bid $ 977.95|S$ 685.00 | $1,180.00 | $ 1,139.57 | $1,175.00 | $ 774.00 | No Bid $ 1,105.00 [2-3 weeks

HP Color LaserJet Enterprise M554dn printer, color, duplex,
laser, A4/legal, 1200 x 1200 dpi, up to 35 ppm, capacity: 650
1to 30 sheets, USB 2.0, Gigabit LAN, USB 2.0 host (cardstock- yes) 7ZU81A#BG) No Bid No Bid S 744.00|S$ 875.00|S$ 905.00 [$ 88593 |S 898.00|$S 609.00 | No Bid S 869.00 [2-3 weeks
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Multi-Function Printers (MFP): will print, copy, scan, fax

HP LaserJet Pro 4101fdn multifuncton printer, B/W, laser,

1to 30 letter/legal (replaces W1A29A#BG)) 27618F#BGJ No Bid No Bid S 488.00|S 384.00|S$ 512.00|S 54269 (S 58200(S$ 349.00 | No Bid $509.00|2-3 weeks
HP LaserJet Pro 4101fdw multifunction printer, B/W, laser
1to 30 (replacement for W1A30A#BGJ) 27619F#BGJ No Bid No Bid S 495.00|S$ 384.00|S$ 523.00|S$ 521.25($ 579.00($ 349.00 | No Bid $522.00|2-3 weeks

HP LaserJet Enterprise MFP M528dn multifunction printer,
B/W, laser, 8.5 in x 34.02 in (original), A4/legal (media), up to
45 ppm (copying), 43 ppm (printing), 650 sheets, USB 2.0,
1to 30 Gigabit LAN, USB 2.0 host 1PV64A#BG) No Bid No Bid $ 1,347.00 | $ 1,467.00 | $2,066.00 [ $ 1,943.90 | $ 1,618.00 | S 985.00 | No Bid $ 1,573.00 |3-4 weeks
HP Color LaserJet Pro MFP 4301fdw multifunction printer,
color, laser, Legal (8.5 in x 14 in) (original), Af/Legal (media), up
to 35 ppm copy and print, 300 sheets, 33.6 Kbps, USB, USB 2.0,
Gigabit LAN, USB 2.0 host, Wi-Fi(ac), Bluetooth (Replaces

1to 30 W1A80A#BG)) ARA82F#BG) No Bid No Bid S 600.00|S 499.00|S$ 743.00|S 739.92($ 70200(S$ 645.00 | No Bid $656.00* 2-3 weeks
HP Color LaserJet Pro MFP 4301fdn multifunction printer,
color, laser, Legal (8.5 in x 14 in) (original), A4/Legal (media),
up to 35 ppm copy and print, 300 sheets, 33.6 Kbps, USB, USB

1to 30 2.0, Gigabit LAN, USB 2.0 host 4RA81F#BG) No Bid No Bid S 583.00[S 499.00|S 676.00 S 71849 |S 867.00|$S 645.00 | No Bid $635.00(2-3 weeks
HP Color LaserJet Enterprise MFP 5800dn Multifunction
1to 30 printer, color (replaces M578dn) 6QN29A#BG) No Bid No Bid $ 1,989.00 | $ 1,570.00 | $2,701.00 | $ 2,541.82 | $ 2,413.00 | $ 1,737.00 | No Bid $ 2,324.00 [5-7 weeks

HP Color Laserlet Enterprise MFP 6800dn multifunction
printer, color, laser, Legal (8.5 x 14) (original), A4/Legal
(media), up to 55 ppm, 650 sheets, Gigabit LAN, USB 3.0, USB
1to 30 2.0 host, USB3.0 host (replaces M653dn) 6QN35A#BG) No Bid No Bid $ 2,747.00 | $ 2,232.00 | $4,264.00 | $ 4,012.97 [ $ 3,519.00 | $ 2,745.00 | No Bid $ 3,569.00 [2-5 weeks

*= price
expires
11/15/25
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