

HP Black/White and Color Printers and Multi-Function Printers (MFP) July 2026
Award

<u>Quantity</u>	<u>Item</u>	<u>Part#</u>	<u>CDW-G</u>	<u>Countertrade</u>	<u>Fisher's</u>	<u>Howard</u>	<u>Insight Public Sector</u>	<u>Les Olson</u>	<u>Pacific Office Automation</u>	<u>SSA Technology **</u>	<u>VLCM</u>
Black/White Printers											
1 to 30	HP LaserJet Enterprise M607n printer, B/W, laser, A4/Legal, 1200 x 1200 dpi, up to 55 ppm, capacity: 650 sheets, USB 2.0, Gigabit LAN, USB 2.0 host (48 lbs)	K0Q14A#BGJ	No Bid	\$ 890.10	No Bid	\$ 882.00	No Bid	\$ 808.68	\$ 650.00	\$ 881.52	No Bid
1 to 30	HP LaserJet Enterprise 6500n Wired Laser Printer, B/W, A4/Legal, 1200 x 1200 dpi, up to 57 ppm, capacity: 550 sheets, USB 2.0, (40 lbs) (replaces K0Q14A#BGJ)	A29ZBA#BGJ	No Bid	\$ 758.89	No Bid	No Bid	\$ 778.09	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
1 to 30	HP LaserJet Enterprise M608n printer, B/W, laser, A4/Legal, 1200 x 1200 dpi, up to 65 ppm, capacity: 650 sheets, USB 2.0, Gigabit LAN, USB 2.0 host (48 lbs)	K0Q17A#BGJ	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	\$ 1,234.00	\$ 997.19	\$ 1,130.68	\$ 879.00	\$ 1,022.11	No Bid
1 to 30	HP LaserJet Enterprise M611dn printer, B/W, Duplex, laser, A4/legal, 1200 x 1200 dpi, up to 65 ppm, USB 2.0, Gigabit LAN, USB 2.0 host (46 lbs)	7PS84A#BGJ	No Bid	\$ 1,301.86	No Bid	\$ 1,464.00	\$ 1,294.32	\$ 1,342.28	\$ 1,075.00	\$ 1,321.64	No Bid
1 to 30	HP LaserJet Enterprise M612dn printer, B/W, Duplex, laser, A4/legal, 1200 x 1200 dpi, up to 75 ppm, capacity: 650 sheets, USB 2.0, Gigabit LAN, USB 2.0 host (48 lbs)	7PS86A#BGJ	No Bid	\$ 1,336.00	No Bid	\$ 2,096.00	\$ 1,767.85	\$ 1,921.88	\$ 1,329.00	\$ 1,808.71	No Bid
1 to 30	HP LaserJet Enterprise M507dn printer, B/W, Duplex, laser, A4/Legal, 1200 x 1200 dpi, up to 45 ppm, capacity: 650 sheets, USB 2.0, Gigabit LAN, USB 2.0 host (28 lbs)	1PV87A#BGJ	No Bid	\$ 824.90	No Bid	\$ 839.00	\$ 865.21	\$ 808.68	\$ 645.00	\$ 839.91	No Bid
1 to 30	HP LaserJet Pro 4001n printer, B/W, laser (replacement for W1A52A#BGJ) (20 lbs)	2Z599F#BGJ	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	\$ 378.00	No Bid	No Bid	\$ 234.00	\$ 383.41	No Bid
1 to 30	HP LaserJet Pro 4006n Printer, B/W, laser, USB & Ethernet, 47 ppm, (replacement for 2Z599F#BGJ)	8X3D2A#BGJ	No Bid	\$ 309.26	No Bid	No Bid	\$ 314.59	\$ 293.48	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
1 to 30	HP LaserJet Pro 4001dn printer, B/W, Duplex, laser (replacement for W1A53A#BGJ)	2Z600F#BGJ	No Bid	\$ 263.63	No Bid	\$ 275.00	\$ 271.28	No Bid	\$ 249.00	No Bid	No Bid
1 to 30	HP LaserJet Pro 4006dn printer, B/W, Duplex, laser, USB & Ethernet, 47 ppm (replacement for 2Z600F#BGJ)	8X3D4A#BGJ	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	\$ 321.08	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
Color Printers											
1 to 30	HP Color LaserJet Enterprise 6701dn printer, Color, Duplex, 65 ppm, 650 sheets, 2 trays (cardstock-yes) (replaces M653dn)	58M42A#BGJ	No Bid	\$ 1,748.42	No Bid	\$ 2,096.00	\$ 1,875.86	\$ 1,921.88	\$ 1,529.00	No Bid	No Bid
1 to 30	HP Color LaserJet Pro 4201dn printer, color, Duplex (cardstock-no)(Replaces W1Y44A#BGJ) (36 lbs)	4RA85F#BGJ	No Bid	\$ 396.85	No Bid	\$ 494.00	\$ 578.22	\$ 615.48	\$ 395.00	\$ 508.77	No Bid
1 to 30	HP Color LaserJet Pro 4201dw printer, color, Duplex, USB 2.0, Gigabit LAN, Wi-Fi(n), USB host (cardstock- no)(replaces W1Y45A#BGJ/ M454dw) (36 lbs)	4RA86F#BGJ	No Bid	\$ 406.60	No Bid	\$ 513.00	\$ 507.10	\$ 643.08	\$ 404.00	\$ 528.63	No Bid
1 to 30	HP Color LaserJet Enterprise 5700dn printer, color, duplex, laser, 1200 x 1200 dpi, up to 45 ppm, capacity: 550 sheets, USB 2.0, Gigabit LAN (cardstock-yes)(replaces 7ZU78A#BGJ) (67 lbs)	6QN28A#BGJ	No Bid	\$ 1,291.00	No Bid	\$ 1,053.00	\$ 1,034.48	\$965.08	\$ 779.00	\$ 1,052.00	No Bid
1 to 30	HP Color LaserJet Enterprise M554dn printer, color, duplex, laser, A4/legal, 1200 x 1200 dpi, up to 35 ppm, capacity: 650 sheets, USB 2.0, Gigabit LAN, USB 2.0 host (cardstock- yes) (60 lbs)	7ZU81A#BGJ	No Bid	\$ 650.71	No Bid	\$ 648.00	\$ 669.60	\$ 624.68	\$ 599.00	\$ 648.80	No Bid
Multi-Function Printers (MFP): will print, copy, scan, fax											
1 to 30	HP LaserJet Pro 4101fdn multifunction printer, B/W, laser, letter/legal (replaces W1A29A#BGJ)	2Z618F#BGJ	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	\$ 657.00	\$ 649.88	No Bid	\$ 349.00	No Bid	No Bid

HP Black/White and Color Printers and Multi-Function Printers (MFP) July 2026

Award

Quantity	Item	Part#	CDW-G	Countertrade	Fisher's	Howard	Insight Public Sector	Les Olson	Pacific Office Automation	SSA Technology **	VLCM
1 to 30	HP LaserJet Pro MFP 4112fdn multifunction printer, B/W, laser, letter/legal (replaces 2Z618F#BGJ)	8X3F0A#BGJ	No Bid	\$ 478.21	No Bid	\$ 498.00	\$ 492.09	\$ 459.08	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
1 to 30	HP LaserJet Pro 4101fdw multifunction printer, B/W, laser (replacement for W1A30A#BGJ) (28 lbs)	2Z619F#BGJ	No Bid	\$ 638.86	No Bid	\$ 657.00	No Bid	No Bid	\$ 329.00	\$ 666.67	No Bid
1 to 30	HP LaserJet Pro MFP 4112fdw multifunction printer, B/W, laser, Duplex, 47 ppm, USB & Ethernet, capacity: 100 sheets, Wireless (replaces 2Z619F#BGJ)	8X3F2A#BGJ	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	\$ 511.82	\$ 477.48	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
1 to 30	HP LaserJet Enterprise MFP M528dn multifunction printer, B/W, laser, 8.5 in x 34.02 in (original), A4/legal (media), up to 45 ppm (copying), 43 ppm (printing), 650 sheets, USB 2.0, Gigabit LAN, USB 2.0 host (48 lbs)	1PV64A#BGJ	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	\$ 1,943.00	No Bid	\$ 1,781.10	\$ 1,019.00	\$ 1,733.07	No Bid
1 to 30	HP LaserJet Enterprise MFP 5601dn multifunction printer, B/W, laser, Duplex	A29Z5A#BGJ	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	\$ 1,253.18	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
1 to 30	HP LaserJet Enterprise MFP 5602dn multifunction printer, B/W, Duplex, laser, 50 ppm, 550 sheets, USB, (48 lbs) (Replaces 1PV64A#BGJ)	675S3A#BGJ	No Bid	\$ 1,856.28	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
1 to 30	HP Color LaserJet Pro MFP 4301fdw multifunction printer, color, laser, Legal (8.5 in x 14 in) (original), Af/Legal (media), up to 35 ppm copy and print, 300 sheets, 33.6 Kbps, USB, USB 2.0, Gigabit LAN, USB 2.0 host, Wi-Fi(ac), Bluetooth (Replaces W1A80A#BGJ) (45 lbs)	4RA82F#BGJ	No Bid	\$ 457.49	No Bid	\$ 656.00	\$ 632.73	\$ 790.28	\$ 449.00	\$ 658.99	No Bid
1 to 30	HP Color LaserJet Pro MFP 4301fdn multifunction printer, color, laser, Legal (8.5 in x 14 in) (original), A4/Legal (media), up to 35 ppm copy and print, 300 sheets, 33.6 Kbps, USB, USB 2.0, Gigabit LAN, USB 2.0 host	4RA81F#BGJ	No Bid	\$ 450.47	No Bid	\$ 857.00	\$ 654.56	\$ 790.28	\$ 449.00	No Bid	No Bid
1 to 30	HP Color LaserJet Enterprise MFP 5800dn Multifunction printer, color (replaces M578dn)	6QN29A#BGJ	No Bid	\$ 2,039.58	No Bid	\$ 2,571.00	\$ 2,396.16	\$ 2,357.10	\$ 1,895.00	No Bid	No Bid
1 to 30	HP Color LaserJet Enterprise MFP 6800dn multifunction printer, color, laser, Legal (8.5 x 14) (original), A4/Legal (media), up to 55 ppm, 650 sheets, Gigabit LAN, USB 3.0, USB 2.0 host, USB3.0 host (replaces M653dn)	6QN35A#BGJ	No Bid	\$ 2,445.31	No Bid	\$ 4,063.00	\$ 3,480.89	\$ 3,725.10	\$ 2,799.00	No Bid	No Bid

** This vendor will charge shipping on orders over 150 lbs