HP Black/White and Color Printers and Multi-Function Printers (MFP) - February 2026 Award Highlighted in Yellow

Insight Pacific
Data Center Dex Public Office Software
Quantity Ite Part# CDW-G Countertrade Warehouse Imaging Fisher's Howard  Sector Les Olson Automation House Int'l VLCM

B/W Printers

HP LaserJet Enterprise M607n printer, B/W, laser, A4/Legal,
1200 x 1200 dpi, up to 55 ppm, capacity: 650 sheets, USB 2.0,
1to 30 Gigabit LAN, USB 2.0 host KOQ14A#BGJ $ 810.00 | $ 786.37 | No Bid $ 1,011.00 | $ 819.00 | No Bid S 866.84|S 80868 (S 660.00 | No Bid No Bid
HP LaserJet Enterprise M608n printer, B/W, laser, A4/Legal,
1200 x 1200 dpi, up to 65 ppm, capacity: 650 sheets, USB 2.0,
1to 30 Gigabit LAN, USB 2.0 host KOQ17A#BGJ $1,133.00 | $ 877.83 | No Bid $ 1,163.00 | $  929.00 | No Bid S 997.19($ 1,13068 (S 899.00 | No Bid No Bid
HP LaserJet Enterprise M611dn printer, B/W, Duplex, laser,
A4/legal, 1200 x 1200 dpi, up to 65 ppm, USB 2.0, Gigabit LAN,
1to 30 USB 2.0 host 7PS84A#BG) $1,345.00 | $ 1,375.91 | No Bid $ 1,509.00 | $ 1,729.00 | No Bid $1,29432($ 1,342.28 [ $ 1,098.00 | No Bid No Bid
HP LaserJet Enterprise M612dn printer, B/W, Duplex, laser,
A4/legal, 1200 x 1200 dpi, up to 75 ppm, capacity: 650 sheets,
1to 30 USB 2.0, Gigabit LAN, USB 2.0 host 7PS86A#BG) $1,927.00 | $ 1,276.07 | No Bid $ 2,062.00 | $ 1,379.00 | No Bid $ 1,767.85|$ 1,921.88 | $ 1,550.00 | No Bid No Bid
HP LaserJet Enterprise M507dn printer, B/W, Duplex, laser,
A4/Legal, 1200 x 1200 dpi, up to 45 ppm, capacity: 650 sheets,

1to 30 USB 2.0, Gigabit LAN, USB 2.0 host 1PV87A#BG) $ 810.00 | $ 817.27 | No Bid $ 1,009.00 | $  759.00 | No Bid S 865.21|$ 80868 (S 673.00 | No Bid No Bid
HP LaserJet Pro 4001n printer, B/W, laser (replacement for

1to 30 W1AS52A#BG)) 27599F#BGJ $ 183.00 | $ 241.09 | No Bid $ 375.00|$ 259.00 | No Bid S 180.81|$ 34868 (S 209.00 | No Bid No Bid
HP LaserJet Pro 4001dn printer, B/W, Duplex, laser

1to 30 (replacement for W1A53A#BG)J) 2Z600F#BGJ $ 321.00|S 280.77 | No Bid S 434.00|S$ 299.00 | No Bid S 33559 (S 413.08(S 350.00 | No Bid No Bid

Color Printers

HP Color Laserlet Enterprise 6701dn printer, Color, Duplex, 65
1to 30 ppm, 650 sheets, 2 trays (cardstock-yes) (replaces M653dn) 58M42A#BG) $1,927.00 | $  1,543.21 | No Bid $ 2,615.00 | $ 1,639.00 | No Bid $ 1,875.86|S$ 1,921.88 $ 1,599.00 | No Bid No Bid

HP Color Laserlet Pro 4201dn printer, color, Duplex (cardstock-
1to 30 no)(Replaces W1Y44A#BGJ) 4RA85F#BG)J S 451.00 | $ 452.60 | No Bid S 674.00 | S 479.00 | No Bid S 466.80|S 61548 (S 467.00 | No Bid No Bid
HP Color LaserJet Pro 4201dw printer, color, Duplex, USB 2.0,
Gigabit LAN, Wi-Fi(n), USB host (cardstock- no)(replaces

1to 30 W1Y45A#BG)/ M454dw) 4RAB6F#BG)J S 478.00 [ $ 464.42 | No Bid S 696.00 | $ 499.00 | No Bid S 49638 |S 643.08|S 565.00 | No Bid No Bid

HP Color LaserJet Enterprise 5700dn printer, color, duplex,
laser, 1200 x 1200 dpi, up to 45 ppm, capacity: 550 sheets, USB
1to 30 2.0, Gigabit LAN (cardstock- yes)(replaces 7ZU78A#BG)) 6QN28A#BG) S 967.00 [ $ 999.20 | No Bid $ 1,206.00 | $ 1,049.00 | No Bid $ 1,034.48 $965.08 | S 775.00 | No Bid No Bid

HP Color LaserJet Enterprise M554dn printer, color, duplex,
laser, A4/legal, 1200 x 1200 dpi, up to 35 ppm, capacity: 650
1to 30 sheets, USB 2.0, Gigabit LAN, USB 2.0 host (cardstock- yes) 7ZU81AH#BG) S 737.00 [ $ 761.07 | No Bid $ 1,045.00 | $ 799.00 | No Bid S 787.94|$ 735.08 S 604.00 | No Bid No Bid
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Multi-Function Printers (MFP): will print, copy, scan, fax

HP LaserJet Pro 4101fdn multifuncton printer, B/W, laser,

1to 30 letter/legal (replaces W1A29A#BG)) 27618F#BGJ $ 395.00 | $ 353.51 | No Bid $ 665.00 S 389.00 | No Bid S 40334 (S 60628 (S 350.00 | No Bid No Bid
HP LaserJet Pro 4101fdw multifunction printer, B/W, laser
1to 30 (replacement for W1A30A#BG)J) 27619F#BGJ $ 395.00 | $ 359.41 | No Bid $ 653.00|S$ 389.00 | No Bid S 40334 (S 60628 (S 350.00 | No Bid No Bid

HP LaserJet Enterprise MFP M528dn multifunction printer,
B/W, laser, 8.5 in x 34.02 in (original), A4/legal (media), up to
45 ppm (copying), 43 ppm (printing), 650 sheets, USB 2.0,
1to 30 Gigabit LAN, USB 2.0 host 1PV64A#BG) $1,825.00 | $ 1,345.63 | No Bid $ 1,892.00 | $ 1,439.00 | No Bid $ 1,62237($ 1,781.10 | $ 928.00 | No Bid No Bid
HP Color Laserlet Pro MFP 4301fdw multifunction printer,
color, laser, Legal (8.5 in x 14 in) (original), Af/Legal (media), up
to 35 ppm copy and print, 300 sheets, 33.6 Kbps, USB, USB 2.0,
1to 30 Gigabit LAN, USB 2.0 host, Wi-Fi(ac), Bluetooth (Replaces ARA82F#BG) $ 589.00 | $ 494.01 | No Bid $ 788.00|S$ 535.00 | No Bid S 611.29 (S 79028 (S 598.00 | No Bid No Bid
HP Color Laserlet Pro MFP 4301fdn multifunction printer,
color, laser, Legal (8.5 in x 14 in) (original), A4/Legal (media),
up to 35 ppm copy and print, 300 sheets, 33.6 Kbps, USB, USB

1to 30 2.0, Gigabit LAN, USB 2.0 host 4RA81F#BGJ S 589.00 [ $ 508.65 | No Bid S 763.00$ 529.00 | No Bid S 611.29|$ 79028 | S 598.00 | No Bid No Bid
HP Color Laserlet Enterprise MFP 5800dn Multifunction
1to 30 printer, color (replaces M578dn) 6QN29A#BG) $2,416.00 [$  1,642.75 | No Bid $ 2,794.00 | $ 1,799.00 | No Bid $2,396.16 | $ 2,357.10 [ $ 1,775.00 | No Bid No Bid

HP Color Laserlet Enterprise MFP 6800dn multifunction
printer, color, laser, Legal (8.5 x 14) (original), A4/Legal
(media), up to 55 ppm, 650 sheets, Gigabit LAN, USB 3.0, USB
1to 30 2.0 host, USB3.0 host (replaces M653dn) 6QN35A#BG) $3,818.00 [$  2,028.53 | No Bid $ 4,059.00 | $ 2,232.00 | No Bid $3,480.89 | $ 3,725.10 | $ 2,805.00 | No Bid No Bid

Page 2 of 2



