Quantity

B/W Printers

1to 30

HP Black/White and Color Printers and Multi-Function Printers (MFP) - December 2025

Item

HP LaserJet Enterprise M607n printer, B/W, laser, A4/Legal,
1200 x 1200 dpi, up to 55 ppm, capacity: 650 sheets, USB 2.0,
Gigabit LAN, USB 2.0 host

Part#

KOQ14A#BG)

Countertrad Data Center Dex

$

821.37

Warehouse

No Bid

Imaging

S 749.00

Fisher's

S 799.00

Award Highlighted in Yellow

Howard

$ 901.00

Insight
Public
Sector

$ 939.76

Les Olson

No Bid

Pacific
Office

Automation House Int'l

$

660.00

Software

No Bid

VLCM

S 788.00

2 weeks

1to 30

HP LaserJet Enterprise M608n printer, B/W, laser, A4/Legal,
1200 x 1200 dpi, up to 65 ppm, capacity: 650 sheets, USB 2.0,
Gigabit LAN, USB 2.0 host

KOQ17A#BG)

$

941.84

No Bid

S 828.00

$  895.00

$1,125.00

$1,312.31

No Bid

$

812.00

No Bid

S  973.00

2 weeks

1to 30

HP LaserJet Enterprise M611dn printer, B/W, Duplex, laser,
A4/legal, 1200 x 1200 dpi, up to 65 ppm, USB 2.0, Gigabit LAN,
USB 2.0 host

7PS84A#BG)

$ 1,224.38

No Bid

$ 1,065.00

$ 1,669.00

$1,472.00

$ 1,554.47

No Bid

S 1,044.00

No Bid

$ 1,264.00

2 weeks

1to 30

HP LaserJet Enterprise M612dn printer, B/W, Duplex, laser,
A4/legal, 1200 x 1200 dpi, up to 75 ppm, capacity: 650 sheets,
USB 2.0, Gigabit LAN, USB 2.0 host

7PS86A#BG)

$ 1,670.97

No Bid

$ 1,468.00

$ 1,299.00

$2,127.00

$ 2,225.06

No Bid

S 1,444.00

No Bid

$ 1,725.00

2 weeks

1to 30

HP LaserJet Enterprise M507dn printer, B/W, Duplex, laser,
A4/Legal, 1200 x 1200 dpi, up to 45 ppm, capacity: 650 sheets,
USB 2.0, Gigabit LAN, USB 2.0 host

1PV87A#BG)

$

819.80

No Bid

S 718.00

S 720.00

$ 901.00

$ 939.76

No Bid

$

673.00

No Bid

S 789.00

2 weeks

1to 30

HP LaserJet Pro 4001n printer, B/W, laser (replacement for
W1A52A#BG))

27599F#BG)

$

304.11

No Bid

S 286.75

S 249.00

No Bid

$ 35299

No Bid

$

360.00

No Bid

$315.00

2 weeks

1to 30

HP LaserJet Pro 4001dn printer, B/W, Duplex, laser
(replacement for W1A53A#BG)J)

27600F#BG)

$

351.34

No Bid

S 325.00

S 280.00

S 346.00

S 228.40

No Bid

$

265.00

No Bid

$365.00

2 weeks

1to 30

Color Printers

HP Color Laserlet Enterprise 6701dn printer, Color, Duplex, 65
ppm, 650 sheets, 2 trays (cardstock-yes) (replaces M653dn)

58MA42A#BG)

$ 1,952.04

No Bid

$ 1,825.00

$ 1,569.00

$2,127.00

$ 2,205.72

No Bid

$ 1,599.00

No Bid

$ 1,873.00

3-6 weeks

1to 30

HP Color Laserlet Pro 4201dn printer, color, Duplex (cardstock-
no)(Replaces W1Y44A#BG))

4RA85F#BG)

546.73

No Bid

S 498.00

S 460.00

No Bid

$  498.95

No Bid

467.00

No Bid

$566.00

2 weeks

1to 30

HP Color LaserJet Pro 4201dw printer, color, Duplex, USB 2.0,
Gigabit LAN, Wi-Fi(n), USB host (cardstock- no)(replaces
W1Y45A#BGJ/ M454dw)

4RA8B6F#BG)

564.15

No Bid

$  525.00

S 472.00

No Bid

$ 651.04

No Bid

580.00

No Bid

$583.00

2-3 weeks

1to 30

HP Color LaserJet Enterprise 5700dn printer, color, duplex,
laser, 1200 x 1200 dpi, up to 45 ppm, capacity: 550 sheets, USB
2.0, Gigabit LAN (cardstock- yes)(replaces 7ZU78A#BG))

6QN28A#BG)

980.23

No Bid

$  977.95

$ 1,115.00

No Bid

$ 1,139.57

No Bid

675.00

No Bid

$  945.00

2-3 weeks

1to 30

HP Color LaserJet Enterprise M554dn printer, color, duplex,
laser, A4/legal, 1200 x 1200 dpi, up to 35 ppm, capacity: 650
sheets, USB 2.0, Gigabit LAN, USB 2.0 host (cardstock- yes)

7ZU81AH#BG)

746.62

No Bid

S 744.00

$  775.00

$  819.00

S 885.93

No Bid

609.00

No Bid

$  717.00

2-3 weeks
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Quantity

1to 30

HP Black/White and Color Printers and Multi-Function Printers (MFP) - December 2025

Item

HP LaserJet Pro 4101fdn multifuncton printer, B/W, laser,
letter/legal (replaces W1A29A#BG))

Part#

27618F#BG)J

Countertrad Data Center Dex

$ 538.97

Warehouse

No Bid

Imaging

S 488.00

Fisher's

$  359.00

Award Highlighted in Yellow

Howard

S 640.00

Insight
Public
Sector

S 613.78

Les Olson

No Bid

Pacific
Office

Automation House Int'l

$

350.00

Software

No Bid

VLCM

$556.00

Multi-Function Printers (MFP): will print, copy, scan, fax

2-3 weeks

1to 30

HP LaserJet Pro 4101fdw multifunction printer, B/W, laser
(replacement for W1A30A#BG)J)

27619F#BG)

S 538.74

No Bid

S 495.00

$  359.00

No Bid

S 613.78

No Bid

$

350.00

No Bid

$532.00

2-3 weeks

1to 30

HP LaserJet Enterprise MFP M528dn multifunction printer,
B/W, laser, 8.5 in x 34.02 in (original), A4/legal (media), up to
45 ppm (copying), 43 ppm (printing), 650 sheets, USB 2.0,
Gigabit LAN, USB 2.0 host

1PV64A#BG)

$ 1,533.20

No Bid

$ 1,347.00

$ 1,369.00

$1,971.00

$ 1,943.90

No Bid

985.00

No Bid

$ 1,583.00

3-4 weeks

1to 30

HP Color LaserJet Pro MFP 4301fdw multifunction printer,
color, laser, Legal (8.5 in x 14 in) (original), Af/Legal (media), up
to 35 ppm copy and print, 300 sheets, 33.6 Kbps, USB, USB 2.0,
Gigabit LAN, USB 2.0 host, Wi-Fi(ac), Bluetooth (Replaces

4RA82F#BG)

S 637.78

No Bid

S 600.00

S  505.00

No Bid

S 800.04

No Bid

600.00

No Bid

$659.00

2-3 weeks

1to 30

HP Color LaserJet Pro MFP 4301fdn multifunction printer,
color, laser, Legal (8.5 in x 14 in) (original), A4/Legal (media),
up to 35 ppm copy and print, 300 sheets, 33.6 Kbps, USB, USB
2.0, Gigabit LAN, USB 2.0 host

4RA81F#BG)

S 617.48

No Bid

$  583.00

$  505.00

$  696.00

$ 71849

No Bid

$

600.00

No Bid

$638.00

2-3 weeks

1to 30

HP Color LaserJet Enterprise MFP 5800dn Multifunction
printer, color (replaces M578dn)

6QN29A#BG)

$ 2,268.63

No Bid

$ 1,989.00

$ 1,669.00

$2,608.00

$ 2,541.82

No Bid

1,605.00

No Bid

$ 2,298.00

5-7 weeks

1to 30

HP Color LaserJet Enterprise MFP 6800dn multifunction
printer, color, laser, Legal (8.5 x 14) (original), A4/Legal
(media), up to 55 ppm, 650 sheets, Gigabit LAN, USB 3.0, USB
2.0 host, USB3.0 host (replaces M653dn)

6QN35A#BG)

$ 3,291.04

No Bid

$ 2,747.00

$ 2,069.00

$4,121.00

$ 4,012.97

No Bid

3,100.00

No Bid

$ 3,425.00

2-5 weeks
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