Epson Projectors February 2025 Pricing Award
Insight Public Extended Order
Quantity Item Part # Bluum Ford A/V Sector TV Specialists VLCM Lead Times
Epson Powerlite 119W projector , WXGA, 4000 lumens, 2HDMI,
1to 25 .
2VGA, USB (General Classroom Projector) V11H985020 466.93| NoBid |$ 589793 476.90 |$  469.00 [ 3-5weeks
1to 25 Epson Powerlite 982W projector, WXGA, 4200 lumens, 2HDMI, 2VGA,
to ; ;
USB (Extra Bright Classroom Projector) V11H987020 581.24 No Bid $ 812.43 | 59230 |$  583.00| 6-8 weeks
Epson Powerlite L260 projector, Laser, 1080p, 4600 lumens, 2 HDMI,
USB A, USB B, VGA, built in Wireless (For conference rooms whre
1to 25 higher resolution is needed or for brighter classroom projector. This
model needs no replacement lamps) (Replaces V11HA17020 L250F
projector) V11HA69020 1,042.99 No Bid S 1,21596 | S 1,062.63 | S 1,045.00 6-8 weeks
Epson Powerlite 810E projector, Extreme Short Throw, Laser, 1080p
1to25 with 4K Enhancement, 5000 lumens, 2 HDMI, USB A, USB B, Wi-Fi
(This model needs no replacement lamp) V11HA99020 2,747.99 No Bid S 3,041.43 | S 2,801.00 [ S  2,753.00 6-8 weeks
, $154.60
1t025 Epson ELPMB?S Exj[reme Short Throw Wall Mount for 810E projector (order with 810F
(order with 810E projector) . .
V12HB12010 146.89 No Bid S 174.89 projector)| $ 150.00 6-8 weeks
Epson BrigntinkK 760WT Ultra SNort TNTrow Projector, W XGA,
1to0 25 Interactive Laser Display, 3HDMI, 2 VGA, USB-B, RS232 (no
replacement lamp needed) V11HA80020 1,578.39 No Bid S 2,074.67 | S 1,57890 | S 1,628.00 6-8 weeks
Freight
included in
Shipping Shipping for orders under $2,000 (please list ship price per projector) Shipping $9.00/each price $7.00/each $15-20/each
Epson Replacement Lamp for Powerlite 119W, Powerlite 982W
1to25 projectors V13H010L97 64.00 No Bid $ 7458 | $ 67.50 | $ 64.00 2-3 weeks
Shipping cost for a single lamp (under $2,000) Shipping [ Included [ |  included [$ 8.00 | $ 7.00 |




