HP Desktop, Monitor, Laptop June 2026 Pricing

Insight Software SSA
Quantity Item Parti# Bluum CDW-G Countertrade Howard Public Sector | House Int'l | Technology VLCM

Desktops
HP EliteDesk 8 G1i SFF, Intel Core Ultra 5-235, vPro

1to 25 Tech, 16GB RAM, 512GB SSD, Intel Q870 Chip, Win 11 ~ BHOE4AUTHABA $1,321.99 $1,464.00 No Bid No Bid $1,327.94 No Bid $1,469.04 No Bid
Desktop Mini, Mounting Brackets
HP EliteDesk 8 G1i Desktop Mini, Intel Core Ultra 5-
235T, vPro Tech, 16GB RAM, 512GB SSD, Intel Q870

1to 25 Chip, Win 11 Pro, Jack Black, kbd: US BQ4B6UTH#ABA $1,263.05 $1,259.00 No Bid No Bid $1,405.99 No Bid No Bid No Bid
HP EliteDesk 8 G1i Desktop Mini, Intel Core Ultra 5
235T, vPro Technology, 16GB RAM, 512GB PCI Express

1to 25 NVMe SSD, Win 11 Pro, Gigk, Bluetooth (Replaces D32N3UTH#ABA $1,123.58 $1,470.00 No Bid No Bid $1,127.92 No Bid No Bid No Bid
HP Elite 800 G9 Desktop Mini, Core i7 14700T/ 4.9 GHz, No Bid

1to 25 16GB RAM, 512 GB SSD, Win 11 Pro, UHD Graphics 770 A12GNUTH#ABA -NLA $1,482.00 No Bid No Bid $1,591.45 No Bid No Bid No Bid
HP EliteDesk 8 G1i Desktop Mini, Intel Core Ultra 7-
265T, vPro Tech, 16GB RAM, 512GB SSD, Intel Q870

1to 25 Chip, Win 11 Pro, Jack Black, kbd: US BQ4BOUTH#ABA $1,402.97 $1,621.00 No Bid No Bid $1,405.99 No Bid $1,586.72 No Bid
HP EliteDesk 8 G1i Desktop Mini, Intel Core Ultra 7-
264T, vPro Technology, 16GB RAM, 512GB SSD, Intel

1to 25 Q870 Chip, Win 11 Pro, GigE, Bluetooth (replaces D32N5UTH#ABA $1,441.54 $1,675.00 No Bid No Bid $1,447.11 No Bid No Bid No Bid
HP B300 PC Mounting Bracket, thin client (For

1to 25 EliteDisplay E223, E233, E243, E24, E27 monitors listed 2DW53AA $39.35 No Bid No Bid No Bid $39.69 No Bid No Bid No Bid
HP B300 Mounting Bracket for Workstation, Mini PC,

1to 25 Thin Client (Replaces 7DB37AT and 2DW53AT) 7DB37AA No Bid $72.00 No Bid No Bid $63.90 No Bid $65.38 No Bid

1to 25 HP Quick Release Bracket 2 (For P27v monitor listed 6KD15AA $16.86 $38.00 No Bid No Bid $17.01 No Bid $28.91 No Bid

1to 25 HP B250 PC Mounting Bracket (For P27h monitor listed 8RA46AA $38.21 $67.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $65.38 No Bid
HP B560 PC Mounting Bracket, use for EliteDisplay E24

1to 25 G5 and E27 G5 monitors listed below B560/763USAA $30.66 $71.00 No Bid No Bid $30.92 No Bid $30.89 No Bid
Monitors
HP 524pf 24" Class Full HD LED Monitor, 16:9, Black

1to 25 (replaces 6N6ESAAH#ABA) 9DIL6UTHABA $155.17 $193.00 No Bid No Bid $159.76 No Bid $185.43 No Bid
HP 327pf Monitor, 27", 1920 x 1080 Full HD (1080P),

1to 25 16:9, Black (replaces 64X69AA#ABA) BOCG3UTH#ABA $137.99 $148.00 No Bid No Bid $138.73 No Bid $141.33 No Bid

1to 25 HP S5 Pro 527pf Full HD (1920 x 1080) LED Monitor, 27" B28F5UT#ABA $168.73 $229.00 No Bid No Bid $170.06 No Bid $217.98 No Bid
HP 327ph Monitor, 27", 1920 x 1080 Full HD (1080P),
5ms response time for games/films/sports, 16:9, height

1to 25 adjustable, speakers, Black BOCGSUTH#ABA $156.79 $158.00 No Bid No Bid $157.28 No Bid $160.23 No Bid
HP E27 G5 E-series, LED Monitor, 27", 1920 x 1080 Full

1to 25 HD 6N4E2AA#ABA No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
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Laptops

1to 25

HP Elite x360 830 G11 2-in-1 Multi-Touch Notebook,

13.3" Screen, Intel Ultra 7-165U, 1.70GHz, 16GB

memory, 512GB SSD storage, Windows 11 Pro, WUXGA,

Wi-Fi, Bluetooth, kbd: US, Touchscreen & Flip Model

(Replaces 895M9UTH#ABA) A6SU6UTHABA

$1,549.97

$1,858.00

No Bid

No Bid

$1,669.54

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

1to 25

HP EliteBook 8 Flip G1i 13.3" Touchscreen Convertible 2

in 1 Notebook, Intel Core Ultra 7 265U, vPro, 16GB

RAM, 512GB SSD, WUXGA, 13.3" 1920 x 1200, Win 11

Pro, Bluetooth, kbd: US, Touchscreen & Flip Model

(replaces A6GSU6UTHABA) BM5M6UTH#ABA

$2,079.99

$2,171.00

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

1to 25

HP EliteBook 830 G11 Notebook, 13.3", Intel Core Ultra

5 135U 12-Core, Intel Graphics, 16GB RAM, 512GB SSD

storage, 1920 x 1200, Win 11 Pro, 5MP Webcam,

Bluetooth, Wi-Fi 6E, kbd: US (no touchscreen) (replaces
895M1UTHABA) A6TGOUTHABA

$1,061.49

$1,186.00

No Bid

No Bid

$1,160.69

No Bid

$1,020.32

No Bid

1to 25

HP EliteBook 8 G1i 14" Notebook, Intel Core Ultra 5

235U, vPro, 16GB RAM, 512GB SSD, WUXGA 14" 1920 x

1200, Win 11 Pro, Camera, Bluetooth, kbd: US (replaces
A6SZ3UTH#ABA) BE8S8UTH#ABA

$1,579.71

$1,610.00

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

1to 25

HP EliteBook 8 G1i 14" Touchscreen Notebook, Intel

Core Ultra 5-236V, 16GB RAM, 512GB SSD, WUXGA

1920 x 1200 IPS Touchscreen, Win 11 Pro, Camera, Wi-

Fi, Bluetooth, Glacier Silver, kbd: US BG7N5UTH#ABA

$1,649.99

$1,781.00

No Bid

No Bid

$1,667.35

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

1to 25

HP ProBook 4 G1i 14" Notebook, Intel Core Ultra 7-

255U, Win 11 Pro, 16GB RAM, 512GB SSD, 14" WUXGA

1920 x 1200, Camera, Gigabit Ethernet, Wi-Fi,

Bluetooth, Pike Silver, Kbd: US (Replaces A1ILC3UT#ABA) BA7R6UTHABA

$1,181.99

$1,200.00

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

1to 25

HP EliteBook 8 G1i 14" Touchscreen Notebook, Intel

Core Ultra 7 255U, 16GB RAM, 512GB SSD, WUXGA 14"

1920 x 1200, Win 11 Pro, Camera, Bluetooth, kbd: US

(replaces A6SZ1UT#ABA) BESE6UTHABA

$1,724.79

$1,787.00

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

1to 25

HP EliteBook 8 G1i 14" Touchscreen Notebook, Intel

Core Ultra 7-258V, Win 11 Pro, 32GB RAM, 512GB SSD,

WUXGA 1920 x 1200 IPS Touchscreen, Camera. Gigabit

Ethernet, Wi-Fi, Bluetooth, Glacier Silver, kbd: US

(Replaces A6SZ1UT#ABA) BG7N6UTH#ABA

$1,899.00

$1,904.00

No Bid

No Bid

$1,912.24

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

1to 25

HP EliteBook 840 G11 Notebook, 14" Touchscreen,

WUXGA, Intel Core Ultra 5 125U, 16GB DDR5 RAM,

512GB SSD, 1920 x 1200, Win 11 Pro, Intel Graphics,

5MP webcam, Wi-Fi, Bluetooth, kbd: US Touchscreen

(replaces A14RTUTHABA) A6SYAUTHABA

$1,287.49

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

$1,574.18

No Bid
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1to 25

HP EliteBook 8 G1i 14" Touchscreen Notebook, Intel

Core Ultra 5 225U, 16GB RAM, 512GB SSD, WUXGA 14"

1920 x 1200, Win 11 Pro, Camera, Bluetooth, kbd: US

(replaces A6SYAUTH#ABA) BESESUTH#ABA

$1,532.99

$1,603.00

No Bid

No Bid

$1,549.01

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

1to 25

HP EliteBook 8 G1i 14" Touchscreen Notebook, Intel

Core Ultra 5-226V, 16GB RAM, 512GB SSD, WUXGA

1920 x 1200 IPS Touchscreen, Win 11 Pro, Camera, Wi-

Fi, Bluetooth, Glacier Silver, kbd: US Touchscreen

(replaces A6SYAUT#ABA) BG6L7UTH#ABA

$1,581.99

$1,445.00

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

1to 25

HP ZBook 8 G1i 14" Mobile Workstation, WUXGA, 60 Hz,

Intel Core Ultra 7 255H, 32GB RAM, 512GB SSD, WUXGA

14" 1920 x 1200, Win 11 Pro, Camera, Bluetooth, kbd:

us BP6JOUTHABA

$2,149.79

$2,819.00

No Bid

No Bid

$2,159.39

No Bid

$2,635.32

No Bid

1to 25

HP EliteBook 8 G1i 16" Touchscreen Notebook, Intel

Core Ultra 5-225U, 16GB RAM, 512GB SSD, WUXGA 16"

1920 x 1200, Win 11 Pro, Camera, Bluetooth, HDMI,

kbd: US (replaces AGTELUT#ABA and A6TD8UTH#ABA) BG7N2UTHABA

$1,563.51

$1,671.00

No Bid

No Bid

$1,569.54

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

1to 25

HP EliteBook 8 G1i 16" Touchscreen Notebook, Intel

Core Ultra 5-226V, 16GB RAM, 512GB SSD, WUXGA

1920 x 1200 IPS Touchscreen, Win 11 Pro, Camera, Wi-

Fi, Bluetooth, HDMI, Glacier Silver, kbd: US (replaces

A6TE1IUTHABA) BH1B2UT#ABA

$1,518.99

$1,718.00

No Bid

No Bid

$1,521.83

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

1to 25

HP 16" ProBook 4 G1i Notebook Copilot+ laptop, Intel

Core Ultra 7-255U, 16GB RAM, 512GB SSD, 16" 1920 x

1200 IPS, Win 11 Pro, Camera, Wi-Fi 6E, Bluetooth,

HDMI, kbd: US (replaces A1LHSUT#ABA) BB3R1UTH#ABA

$1,225.33

$1,257.00

No Bid

No Bid

$1,411.22

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

1to 25

HP Zbook 8 G1i 16" Mobile Workstation, Intel Core Ultra

7-255H, 32GB RAM, 512GB SSD, WUXGA 16" 1920 x

1200, Win 11 Pro, Camera, Bluetooth, HDMI, kbd: US

(replaces AGUFSUTH#ABA) BP6Y6UTHABA

$2,178.99

$2,829.00

No Bid

No Bid

$2,194.92

No Bid

$2,657.94

No Bid

1to 25

HP ZBook 8 G1i 16" Mobile Workstation, Intel Core Ultra

7-265H, 32GB RAM, 1TB SSD, WQUXGA 16" 3840 x

2400, Win 11 Pro, Camera, Bluetooth, HDMI, kbd: US

(replaces AGUG2UT#ABA) BX7V8UTHABA

$3,017.71

$3,928.00

No Bid

No Bid

$3,060.91

No Bid

$3,112.86

No Bid

1to 25

HP USB-C Docking Station

5TW10AA/ 5STW10UTHABA

$179.17

$208.00

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

1to 25

HP USB-C Docking Station (replaces
5TW10AA/5TW10UT) 9X3V1UTHABA

$135.99

$215.00

No Bid

No Bid

$139.15

No Bid

$192.70

No Bid

1to 25

Plugable USB-C Triple 4K Display Docking Station UD-ULTC4K

$221.79

$235.00

No Bid

No Bid

$206.35

No Bid

$226.45

No Bid

1to 25

Plugable USB-C Triple HDMI Display Docking Station UD-3900PDZ

$144.75

$153.00

No Bid

No Bid

$120.07

No Bid

$148.03

No Bid

1to 25

Plugable Dual Display Universal Docking Station UD-3900

$91.69

$95.00

No Bid

No Bid

$83.65

No Bid

$92.80

No Bid




