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1 to 25

HP Elite 800 G9 SFF, intel Core i5-14500, 16GB DDR5 RAM, 
256GB SSD, Win 11 Pro, UHD Graphics 770, Bluetooth, 
keyboard: US A12GZUT#ABA $949.14 No Bid No Bid $1,081.00 $1,029.95 No Bid No Bid $1,045.88 No Bid

1 to 25

HP EliteDesk 8 G1i SFF, Intel Core Ultra 5-235, vPro Tech, 
16GB RAM, 512GB SSD, Intel Q870 Chip, Win 11 Pro, Jack 
Black, kbd: US BH9E4UT#ABA $1,020.85 $950.02 No Bid $1,031.00 $994.94 No Bid No Bid $1,010.33 No Bid

1 to 25

HP Elite 800 G9 Desktop Mini, Core i5 14500T, 16GB RAM, 
512GB SSD, Win 11 Pro, UHD Graphics 770, GigE, 
Bluetooth, keyboard: US (Replaces 86Y58UT#ABA) A12GMUT#ABA $1,021.34 No Bid No Bid $1,032.00 $1,004.46 No Bid No Bid $1,019.99 No Bid

1 to 25

HP EliteDesk 8 G1i Desktop Mini, Intel Core Ultra 5-235T, 
vPro Tech, 16GB RAM, 512GB SSD, Intel Q870 Chip, Win 
11 Pro, Jack Black, kbd: US BQ4B6UT#ABA $855.49 $896.10 No Bid $954.00 $928.32 No Bid No Bid $942.68 No Bid

1 to 25

HP Elite 800 G9 Desktop Mini, Core i7 14700T/ 4.9 GHz, 
16GB RAM, 512 GB SSD, Win 11 Pro, UHD Graphics 770 
(replaces 86Y59UT#ABA) A12GNUT#ABA $1,013.21 No Bid No Bid $1,014.99 $987.49 No Bid No Bid $1,169.71 No Bid

1 to 25

HP EliteDesk 8 G1i Desktop Mini, Intel Core Ultra 7-265T, 
vPro Tech, 16GB RAM, 512GB SSD, Intel Q870 Chip, Win 
11 Pro, Jack Black, kbd: US BQ4B9UT#ABA $1,024.96 No Bid No Bid $1,104.00 $1,064.87 No Bid No Bid $1,081.34 No Bid

1 to 25

HP B300  PC Mounting Bracket, thin client (For 
EliteDisplay E223, E233, E243, E24, E27 monitors listed 
below) 2DW53AA $38.54 $37.33 No Bid No Bid $39.69 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

1 to 25
HP B300 Mounting Bracket for Workstation, Mini PC, Thin 
Client (Replaces 7DB37AT and 2DW53AT) 7DB37AA $62.06 $60.10 No Bid $67.00 $63.90 No Bid No Bid $65.00 No Bid

1 to 25
HP Quick Release Bracket 2 (For P27v monitor listed 
below) 6KD15AA $16.52 $16.00 No Bid $18.00 $17.01 No Bid No Bid $17.00 No Bid

1 to 25
HP B250 PC Mounting Bracket (For P27h monitor listed 
below) 8RA46AA $37.04 $35.87 No Bid $42.00 $38.13 No Bid No Bid $39.00 No Bid

1 to 25
HP B560 PC Mounting Bracket, use for EliteDisplay E24 G5 
and E27 G5 monitors listed below B560/763U8AA $30.03 $29.08 No Bid No Bid $30.92 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

1 to 25
HP 524pf 24" Class Full HD LED Monitor, 16:9, Black 
(replaces 6N6E9AA#ABA) 9D9L6UT#ABA $155.17 $179.14 No Bid $188.00 $182.02 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

1 to 25
HP 327pf Monitor, 27", 1920 x 1080 Full HD (1080P), 16:9, 
Black (replaces 64X69AA#ABA) B0CG3UT#ABA $155.77 $164.80 No Bid $183.00 $175.22 No Bid No Bid $176.00 No Bid

1 to 25

HP 327ph Monitor, 27", 1920 x 1080 Full HD (1080P), 5ms 
response time for games/films/sports, 16:9, height 
adjustable, speakers, Black B0CG8UT#ABA $185.67 $184.18 No Bid $202.00 $195.83 No Bid No Bid $196.00 No Bid

1 to 25 HP E27 G5 E-series, LED Monitor, 27", 1920 x 1080 Full HD 6N4E2AA#ABA $185.67 $184.18 No Bid $202.00 $195.83 No Bid No Bid $196.00 No Bid
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1 to 25

HP Elite x360 830 G11 2-in-1 Multi-Touch Notebook, 13.3" 
Screen, Intel Ultra 7-165U, 1.70GHz,  16GB memory, 
512GB SSD storage, Windows 11 Pro, WUXGA, Wi-Fi, 
Bluetooth, kbd: US, Touchscreen & Flip Model (Replaces 
895M9UT#ABA) A6SU6UT#ABA $1,588.00 No Bid No Bid $1,731.00 $1,669.54 No Bid No Bid $1,696.00 No Bid

1 to 25

HP EliteBook 8 Flip G1i 13.3" Touchscreen Convertible 2 in 
1 Notebook, Intel Core Ultra 7 265U, vPro, 16GB RAM, 
512GB SSD, WUXGA, 13.3" 1920 x 1200, Win 11 Pro, 
Bluetooth, kbd: US, Touchscreen & Flip Model (replaces 
A6SU6UT#ABA) BM5M6UT#ABA $1,764.58 $1,694.00 No Bid $1,846.00 $1,719.80 No Bid No Bid $1,746.39 No Bid

1 to 25

HP EliteBook 830 G11 Notebook, 13.3", Intel Core Ultra 5 
135U 12-Core, Intel Graphics, 16GB RAM, 512GB SSD 
storage, 1920 x 1200, Win 11 Pro, 5MP Webcam, 
Bluetooth, Wi-Fi 6E, kbd: US (no touchscreen) (replaces 
895M1UT#ABA) A6TG0UT#ABA $1,294.79 No Bid No Bid $1,309.00 $1,261.93 No Bid No Bid $1,282.00 No Bid

1 to 25

HP EliteBook 8 G1i 14" Notebook, Intel Core Ultra 5 235U, 
vPro, 16GB RAM, 512GB SSD, WUXGA 14" 1920 x 1200, 
Win 11 Pro, Camera, Bluetooth, kbd: US (replaces 
A6SZ3UT#ABA) BE8S8UT#ABA $1,210.63 $1,268.12 No Bid $1,362.00 $1,313.71 No Bid No Bid $1,334.02 No Bid

1 to 25

HP EliteBook 8 G1i 14" Touchscreen Notebook, Intel Core 
Ultra 5-236V, 16GB RAM, 512GB SSD, WUXGA 1920 x 1200 
IPS Touchscreen, Win 11 Pro, Camera, Wi-Fi, Bluetooth, 
Glacier Silver, kbd: US BG7N5UT#ABA $1,332.25 $1,395.52 No Bid $1,499.00 $1,445.69 No Bid No Bid $1,468.00 No Bid

1 to 25

HP ProBook 4 G1i 14" Notebook, Intel Core Ultra 7-255U, 
Win 11 Pro, 16GB RAM, 512GB SSD, 14" WUXGA 1920 x 
1200, Camera,  Gigabit Ethernet, Wi-Fi, Bluetooth, Pike 
Silver, Kbd: US (Replaces A1LC3UT#ABA) BA7R6UT#ABA $1,149.04 $1,116.22 No Bid $1,157.99 No Bid No Bid No Bid $1,174.23 No Bid

1 to 25

HP EliteBook 840 G11 Notebook, 14" Touchscreen, 
WUXGA, Intel Fore Ultra 7 155U. 16GB DDR5 RAM, 512GB 
SSD, 1920 x 1200 IPS Touchscreen, Win 11 Pro, Intel 
Graphics, 5MP Webcam, Wi-Fi 6E, Bluetooth, keyboard: 
US touchscreen (Replaces A14WFUT) A6SZ1UT#ABA No Bid No Bid No Bid $1,511.00 $1,407.61 No Bid No Bid $1,429.38 No Bid

1 to 25

HP EliteBook 8 G1i 14" Touchscreen Notebook, Intel Core 
Ultra 7 255U, 16GB RAM, 512GB SSD, WUXGA 14" 1920 x 
1200, Win 11 Pro, Camera, Bluetooth, kbd: US (replaces 
A6SZ1UT#ABA) BE9E6UT#ABA $1,428.69 $1,384.00 No Bid $1,457.00 $1,405.08 No Bid No Bid $1,426.80 No Bid

1 to 25

HP EliteBook 8 G1i 14" Touchscreen Notebook, Intel Core 
Ultra 7-258V, Win 11 Pro, 32GB RAM, 512GB SSD, WUXGA 
1920 x 1200 IPS Touchscreen, Camera. Gigabit Ethernet, 
Wi-Fi, Bluetooth, Glacier Silver, kbd: US (Replaces 
A6SZ1UT#ABA) BG7N6UT#ABA $1,598.67 $1,565.06 No Bid $1,681.00 $1,621.32 No Bid No Bid $1,646.39 No Bid

1 to 25

HP EliteBook 840 G11 Notebook, 14" Touchscreen, 
WUXGA, Intel Core Ultra 5 125U, 16GB DDR5 RAM, 512GB 
SSD, 1920 x 1200, Win 11 Pro, Intel Graphics, 5MP 
webcam, Wi-Fi, Bluetooth, kbd: US Touchscreen (replaces 
A14RTUT#ABA) A6SY4UT#ABA $1,318.36 No Bid No Bid $1,315.00 $1,268.02 No Bid No Bid $1,287.63 No Bid
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1 to 25

HP EliteBook 8 G1i 14" Touchscreen Notebook, Intel Core 
Ultra 5 225U, 16GB RAM, 512GB SSD, WUXGA 14" 1920 x 
1200, Win 11 Pro, Camera, Bluetooth, kbd: US (replaces 
A6SY4UT#ABA) BE9E5UT#ABA $1,163.85 $1,219.12 No Bid $1,355.00 $1,262.94 No Bid No Bid $1,282.47 No Bid

1 to 25

HP EliteBook 8 G1i 14" Touchscreen Notebook, Intel Core 
Ultra 5-226V, 16GB RAM, 512GB SSD, WUXGA 1920 x 1200 
IPS Touchscreen, Win 11 Pro, Camera, Wi-Fi, Bluetooth, 
Glacier Silver, kbd: US Touchscreen (replaces 
A6SY4UT#ABA) BG6L7UT#ABA $1,262.08 $1,322.02 No Bid $1,350.00 $1,369.54 No Bid No Bid $1,390.72 No Bid

1 to 25

HP ZBook 8 G1i 14" Mobile Workstation, WUXGA, 60 Hz, 
Intel Core Ultra 7 255H, 32GB RAM, 512GB SSD, WUXGA 
14" 1920 x 1200, Win 11 Pro, Camera, Bluetooth, kbd: US BP6J9UT#ABA $1,460.70 $1,415.00 No Bid $1,511.00 $1,436.55 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

1 to 25

HP EliteBook 860 G11 Multi-touch Notebook, 16" 
Touchscreen, Intel Core Ultra 5- 125U, 16GB DDR5 RAM, 
512GB SSD, Intel Graphics, 16" 1920 x 1200 IPS 
Touchscreen, Win 11 Pro, Bluetooth, Wi-Fi 6E, kbd: US- 
TOUCHSCREEN (replaces A14SGUT) A6TE1UT#ABA $1,096.02 No Bid No Bid $1,233.00 $1,189.34 No Bid No Bid $1,208.00 No Bid

1 to 25

HP EliteBook 8 G1i 16" Touchscreen Notebook, Intel Core 
Ultra 5-225U, 16GB RAM, 512GB SSD, WUXGA 16" 1920 x 
1200, Win 11 Pro, Camera, Bluetooth, kbd: US (replaces 
A6TE1UT#ABA and A6TD8UT#ABA) BG7N2UT#ABA $1,145.14 $1,199.52 No Bid $1,289.00 $1,242.64 No Bid No Bid $1,261.86 No Bid

1 to 25

HP EliteBook 8 G1i 16" Touchscreen Notebook, Intel Core 
Ultra 5-226V, 16GB RAM, 512GB SSD, WUXGA 1920 x 1200 
IPS Touchscreen, Win 11 Pro, Camera, Wi-Fi, Bluetooth, 
Glacier Silver, kbd: US (replaces A6TE1UT#ABA) BH1B2UT#ABA $1,205.95 $1,263.22 No Bid $1,357.00 $1,308.63 No Bid No Bid $1,328.87 No Bid

1 to 25

HP 16" ProBook 4 G1i Notebook Copilot+ laptop, Intel 
Core Ultra 7-255U, 16GB RAM, 512GB SSD, 16" 1920 x 
1200 IPS, Win 11 Pro, Camera, Wi-Fi 6E, Bluetooth, kbd: 
US (replaces A1LH5UT#ABA) BB3R1UT#ABA $1,095.14 $1,060.51 No Bid $1,152.00 $1,110.66 No Bid No Bid $1,127.84 No Bid

1 to 25

HP Zbook Firefly 16" G11 Mobile Workstation, 16" Screen, 
Intel Core Ultra 7- 155U, 32GB DDR5 RAM, 512GB SSD, 
16" 1920 x 1200, Intel Graphics, Win 11 Pro, 5MP Webca, 
Wi-Fi 6E, Bluetooth, kbd: US (No touchscreen or flip) 
(replaces A1RD4UT) A6UF5UT#ABA $1,518.23 No Bid No Bid $1,534.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid $1,503.00 No Bid

1 to 25

HP ZBook Firefly 16 G11 Mobile Workstation, 16" Screen, 
Intel Core Ultra 7- 165H, 32GB DDR5 RAM, 1TB SSD, 
NVIDIA RTX A500 Graphics, Win 11 Pro, 16" 2880 x 1800 
OLED display, Wi-Fi 6E, Bluetooth, kbd: US (replaces 
7Z1B4UT) A6UG2UT#ABA $2,152.24 $2,084.18 No Bid $2,263.00 $2,182.74 No Bid No Bid $2,217.00 No Bid

1 to 25

HP Zbook 8 G1i 16" Mobile Workstation, Intel Core Ultra 7-
255H, 32GB RAM, 512GB SSD, WUXGA 16" 1920 x 1200, 
Win 11 Pro, Camera, Bluetooth, kbd: US (replaces 
A6UF5UT#ABA) BP6Y6UT#ABA $1,603.67 $1,552.96 No Bid $1,686.00 $1,626.40 No Bid No Bid $1,651.55 No Bid

1 to 25

HP ZBook 8 G1i 16" Mobile Workstation, Intel Core Ultra 7-
265H, 32GB RAM, 1TB SSD, WQUXGA 16" 3840 x 2400, 
Win 11 Pro, Camera, Bluetooth, kbd: US (replaces 
A6UG2UT#ABA) BX7V8UT#ABA $2,083.45 $2,286.34 No Bid $2,456.00 $2,368.53 No Bid No Bid $2,405.15 No Bid
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1 to 25 HP USB-C Docking Station 5TW10AA/ 5TW10UT#ABA $155.17 $150.26 No Bid $162.00 $159.76 No Bid No Bid $160.00 No Bid

1 to 25 HP USB-C Docking Station (replaces 5TW10AA/5TW10UT) 9X3V1UT#ABA $129.99 $134.55 No Bid $146.00 $141.51 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

1 to 25 Plugable USB-C Triple 4K Display Docking Station UD-ULTC4K $212.99 No Bid No Bid $223.00 $191.32 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
1 to 25 Plugable USB-C Triple HDMI Display Docking Station UD-3900PDZ $139.99 No Bid No Bid $143.00 $120.07 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
1 to 25 Plugable Dual Display Universal Docking Station UD-3900 $91.69 No Bid No Bid $96.00 $79.46 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
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