

HP Desktop, Monitor, Laptop August 2026 Pricing

Low Bid

Quantity	Item	Part#	Bluum	CDW-G	Countertrade	Howard	Insight Public Sector	Software House Int'l	SSA Technology	VLCM
Desktops										
1 to 25	HP EliteDesk 8 G1i SFF, Intel Core Ultra 5-235, vPro Tech, 16GB RAM, 512GB SSD, Intel Q870 Chip, Win 11 Pro, Jack Black, kbd: US	BH9E4UT#ABA	\$1,359.49	No Bid	\$1,400.02	\$1,484.00	No Bid	No Bid	\$1,459.23	No Bid
Desktop Mini, Mounting Brackets										
1 to 25	HP EliteDesk 8 G1i Desktop Mini, Intel Core Ultra 5-235T, vPro Tech, 16GB RAM, 512GB SSD, Intel Q870 Chip, Win 11 Pro, Jack Black, kbd: US	BQ4B6UT#ABA	No Bid- NLA	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	\$1,536.31	No Bid	No Bid
1 to 25	HP EliteDesk 8 G1i Desktop Mini, Intel Core Ultra 5 235T, vPro Technology, 16GB RAM, 512GB PCI Express NVMe SSD, Win 11 Pro, GigE, Bluetooth (Replaces BQ4B6UT)	D32N3UT#ABA	\$1,166.79	No Bid	\$1,196.91	\$1,214.00	No Bid	\$1,693.08	No Bid	No Bid
1 to 25	HP EliteDesk 8 G1i Desktop Mini, Intel Core Ultra 7-265T, vPro Tech, 16GB RAM, 512GB SSD, Intel Q870 Chip, Win 11 Pro, Jack Black, kbd: US	BQ4B9UT#ABA	\$1,472.66	No Bid	\$1,418.04	\$1,540.00	No Bid	No Bid	\$1,524.34	No Bid
1 to 25	HP EliteDesk 8 G1i Desktop Mini, Intel Core Ultra 7-264T, vPro Technology, 16GB RAM, 512GB SSD, Intel Q870 Chip, Win 11 Pro, GigE, Bluetooth (replaces BQ4B9UT)	D32N5UT#ABA	\$1,482.99	No Bid	\$1,521.03	\$1,550.00	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
1 to 25	HP B300 PC Mounting Bracket, thin client (For EliteDisplay E223, E233, E243, E24, E27 monitors listed below)	2DW53AA	\$39.16	No Bid	\$38.35	No Bid	No Bid	\$46.30	No Bid	No Bid
1 to 25	HP B300 Mounting Bracket for Workstation, Mini PC, Thin Client (Replaces 7DB37AT and 2DW53AT)	7DB37AA	\$65.96	No Bid	No Bid	\$66.00	No Bid	\$73.85	\$65.38	No Bid
1 to 25	HP Quick Release Bracket 2 (For P27v monitor listed below)	6KD15AA	\$16.86	No Bid	\$16.43	\$18.00	No Bid	\$38.49	No Bid	No Bid
1 to 25	HP B250 PC Mounting Bracket (For P27h monitor listed below)	8RA46AA	\$39.01	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	\$76.90	No Bid	No Bid
1 to 25	HP B560 PC Mounting Bracket, use for EliteDisplay E24 G5 and E27 G5 monitors listed below	B560/763U8AA	\$36.93	No Bid	\$36.16	\$38.00	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
Monitors										
1 to 25	HP 524pf 24" Class Full HD LED Monitor, 16:9, Black (replaces 6N6E9AA#ABA)	9D9L6UT#ABA	\$132.99	No Bid	\$147.62	\$149.00	No Bid	\$129.12	\$148.68	No Bid
1 to 25	HP 327pf Monitor, 27", 1920 x 1080 Full HD (1080P), 16:9, Black (replaces 64X69AA#ABA)	B0CG3UT#ABA	\$135.55	No Bid	\$161.90	\$142.00	No Bid	\$134.72	\$141.33	No Bid
1 to 25	HP S5 Pro 527pf Full HD (1920 x 1080) LED Monitor, 27"	B28F5UT#ABA	\$166.94	No Bid	\$159.90	\$174.00	No Bid	\$197.25	\$217.44	No Bid
1 to 25	HP 327ph Monitor, 27", 1920 x 1080 Full HD (1080P), 5ms response time for games/films/sports, 16:9, height adjustable, speakers, Black	B0CG8UT#ABA	\$149.79	No Bid	\$180.95	\$161.00	No Bid	\$148.91	\$160.23	No Bid
Laptops										
1 to 25	HP EliteBook 8 Flip G2i 13.3" Touchscreen Convertible Copilot+ PC 2 in 1 Notebook, Intel Core Ultra 7, 32GB RAM, 512GB SSD, WUXGA, 13.3" 1920 x 1200, Win 11 Pro, Bluetooth, kbd: US Touchscreen and Flip Model (replaces BM5M6UT#ABA)	D81PHUT#ABA	\$2,440.57	No Bid	\$2,430.00	\$2,590.00	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid

Minimal qty coming into stock

HP Desktop, Monitor, Laptop August 2026 Pricing

Low Bid

Quantity	Item	Part#	Bluum	CDW-G	Countertrade	Howard	Insight Public Sector	Software House Int'l	SSA Technology	VLCM
1 to 25	HP EliteBook 830 G11 Notebook, 13.3", Intel Core Ultra 5 135U 12-Core, Intel Graphics, 16GB RAM, 512GB SSD storage, 1920 x 1200, Win 11 Pro, SMP Webcam, Bluetooth, Wi-Fi 6E, kbd: US (no touchscreen) (replaces 895M1UT#ABA)	A6TG0UT#ABA	\$1,044.79 Limited Quantity	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
1 to 25	HP EliteBook 8 G1i 14" Notebook, Intel Core Ultra 5 235U, vPro, 16GB RAM, 512GB SSD, WUXGA 14" 1920 x 1200, Win 11 Pro, Camera, Bluetooth, kbd: US (replaces A6S23UT#ABA)	BE8S8UT#ABA	\$1,615.26 Limited Quantity	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
1 to 25	HP EliteBook 8 G1i 14" Touchscreen Notebook, Intel Core Ultra 5-236V, 16GB RAM, 512GB SSD, WUXGA 1920 x 1200 IPS Touchscreen, Win 11 Pro, Camera, Wi-Fi, Bluetooth, Glacier Silver, kbd: US	BG7N5UT#ABA	No Bid- NLA	No Bid	No Bid	\$1,628.00	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
1 to 25	HP EliteBook 8 G2i 14" Touchscreen Copilot+ PC Notebook, Intel Core Ultra 7 Series 3 365, 32GB RAM, 512GB SSD, WUXGA 1920 x 1200 IPS Touchscreen, Win 11 Pro, Camera, Wi-Fi, Bluetooth, Glacier Silver, kbd: US (replaces BG7N5UT#ABA)	D82WJUT#ABA	\$2,104.11	No Bid	\$2,095.00	\$2,200.00	No Bid	\$2,300.02	No Bid	No Bid
1 to 25	HP ProBook 4 G2i 14" Copilot+ PC Notebook, Intel Core Ultra 7 Series 3-355, Win 11 Pro, 16GB RAM, 512GB SSD, 14" WUXGA 1920 x 1200, Camera, Wi-Fi, Bluetooth, Pike Silver, kbd: US (replaces BA7R6UT#ABA)	DG4U6UT#ABA	\$1,436.23	No Bid	\$1,435.00	\$1,507.00	No Bid	\$1,602.72	No Bid	No Bid
1 to 25	HP EliteBook 8 G2i 14" Copilot+ PC Notebook, Intel Core Ultra 7 Series 3-355, 16GB RAM, 512GB SSD, WUXGA 1920 x 1200, Win 11 Pro, Camera, Bluetooth, kbd: US (replaces BE9E6UT#ABA)	DK0D1UT#ABA	\$1,652.02	No Bid	\$1,650.00	\$1,733.00	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
1 to 25	HP EliteBook 8 G2i 14" Copilot + PC Notebook, Intel Core Ultra 7-355, Win 11 Pro, 32GB RAM, 512GB SSD, WUXGA 1920 x 1200, Win 11 Pro, Camera, Wi-Fi, Bluetooth, kbd: US (replaces BG7N6UT#ABA but no touchscreen)	D81W3UT#ABA	\$1,957.40	No Bid	\$1,995.00	\$2,045.00	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
1 to 25	HP EliteBook 8 G2i 14" Touchscreen Copilot+ PC Notebook, Intel Cor Ultra 7-365, 32GB RAM. 512GB SSD. WUXGA 14" touchscreen 1920 x 1200, Win 11 Pro, Camera, Wi-Fi, Bluetooth, kbd: US (replaces BG7N6UT#ABA with touchscreen)	D82WJUT#ABA	\$2,107.79	No Bid	No Bid	\$2,318.00	No Bid	\$2,317.65	No Bid	No Bid
1 to 25	HP EliteBook 840 G11 Notebook, 14" Touchscreen, WUXGA, Intel Core Ultra 5 125U, 16GB DDR5 RAM, 512GB SSD, 1920 x 1200, Win 11 Pro, Intel Graphics, SMP webcam, Wi-Fi, Bluetooth, kbd: US Touchscreen (replaces A14RTUT#ABA)	A6SY4UT#ABA	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	\$1,806.69	No Bid
1 to 25	HP EliteBook 8 G1i 14" Touchscreen Notebook, Intel Core Ultra 5 225U, 16GB RAM, 512GB SSD, WUXGA 14" 1920 x 1200, Win 11 Pro, Camera, Bluetooth, kbd: US (replaces A6SY4UT#ABA)	BE9E5UT#ABA	No Bid- NLA	No Bid	No Bid	\$1,617.00	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
1 to 25	HP EliteBook 8 G2i 14" Copilot+ PC Notebook, Intel Core Ultra 5-325, 16GB RAM, 512GB SSD, WUXGA 1920 1200, Win 11 Pro, Camera, Wi-Fi, Bluetooth 6.0, Wi-Fi 7, Glacier Silver, kbd: US	DJ9V7UT#ABA	\$1,621.35	No Bid	\$1,658.85	\$1,690.00	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
1 to 25	HP EliteBook 8 G2i 14" Copilot+PC Notebook, Intel Core Ultra 5-325, 32GB RAM, 512GB SSD, WUXGA 1920 x 1200, Win 11 Pro, Camera, Wi-Fi, Bluetooth, Glacier Silver, kbd: US (replaces BE9E5UT/BG6L7UT but no touchscreen)	DJ9V6UT#ABA	\$1,767.93	No Bid	\$1,855.00	\$1,851.00	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid

HP Desktop, Monitor, Laptop August 2026 Pricing

Low Bid

Quantity	Item	Part#	Bluum	CDW-G	Countertrade	Howard	Insight Public Sector	Software House Int'l	SSA Technology	VLCM
1 to 25	HP Zbook 8 G1i 14" Mobile Workstation, WUXGA, 60 Hz, Intel Core Ultra 7 255H, 32GB RAM, 512GB SSD, WUXGA 14" 1920 x 1200, Win 11 Pro, Camera, Bluetooth, kbd: US	BP6J9UT#ABA	\$2,199.70	No Bid	No Bid	\$2,296.00	No Bid	No Bid	\$2,700.33	No Bid
1 to 25	HP Zbook 8 G2i 14" Copilot+ PC Mobile Workstation, WUXGA, Intel Core Ultra 7 356H, 32GB RAM, 512GB SSD, WUXGA 14" 1920 x 1200. Win 11 Pro, Camera, Wi-Fi, Bluetooth, kbd: US	DK3E6UT#ABA	\$2,099.09	No Bid	\$2,124.68	\$2,184.00	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
1 to 25	HP EliteBook 8 G2i 16" Touchscreen Notebook, Intel Core Ultra 7-365, 32GB RAM, 512GB SSD, WUXGA 16" Touchscreen 1920 x 1200, Win 11 Pro, Camera, Wi-Fi, Bluetooth, Glacier Silver, kbd: US (replaces BG7N2UT/BH1B2UT with Touchscreen)	D81QPUT#ABA	\$1,978.57	No Bid	\$1,970.00	\$2,328.00	No Bid	\$2,407.77	No Bid	No Bid
1 to 25	HP EliteBook 8 G2i 16" Notebook, Intel Core Ultra 5-325, 32GB RAM, 512GB SSD, WUXGA 1920 x 1200, Win 11 Pro, Camera, Wi-Fi, Bluetooth, Glacier Silver, kbd: US (replaces BG7N2UT/BH1B2UT but no touchscreen)	DJ9V8UT#ABA	\$1,814.27	No Bid	\$1,865.00	\$1,900.00	No Bid	\$2,127.91	No Bid	No Bid
1 to 25	HP ProBook 4 G2i 16" Copilot+ PC Notebook, Intel Core Ultra 7-355, 16GB RAM, 512GB SSD, 16" 1920 x 1200 IPS, WUXGA, Win 11 Pro, Camera, Wi-Fi, Bluetooth, HDMI, kbd: US (replaces BB3R1UT#ABA)	DG5J7UT#ABA	\$1,359.88	No Bid	\$1,395.87	\$1,422.00	No Bid	\$1,600.14	No Bid	No Bid
1 to 25	HP Zbook 8 G1i 16" Mobile Workstation, Intel Core Ultra 7-255H, 32GB RAM, 512GB SSD, WUXGA 16" 1920 x 1200, Win 11 Pro, Camera, Bluetooth, HDMI, kbd: US (replaces A6UF5UT#ABA)	BP6Y6UT#ABA	\$2,233.79	No Bid	\$2,301.03	\$2,344.00	No Bid	No Bid	\$2,683.00	No Bid
1 to 25	HP Zbook 8 G2i 16" Copilot+ PC mobile workstation, Intel Core Ultra 7-356H, 32GB RAM, 512GB SSD, WUXGA 16" 1920 x 1200 IPS, Win 11 Pro, Camera, Wi-Fi, Bluetooth, HDMI, kbd: US (replaces BP6Y6UT#ABA)	DK2H8UT#ABA	\$2,105.17	No Bid	\$2,139.93	\$2,211.00	No Bid	\$2,849.00	No Bid	No Bid
1 to 25	HP ZBook 8 G1i 16" Mobile Workstation, Intel Core Ultra 7-265H, 32GB RAM, 1TB SSD, WQXGA 16" 3840 x 2400, Win 11 Pro, Camera, Bluetooth, HDMI, kbd: US (replaces A6UG2UT#ABA)	BX7V8UT#ABA	\$2,810.71 Limited Availability	No Bid	\$2,771.05	\$3,271.00	No Bid	\$2,935.41	No Bid	No Bid
1 to 25	HP Zbook 8 G2i 16" Copilot+ PC Mobile Workstation, Intel Core Ultra7-366H, 32GB RAM, 1TB SSD, WQXGA 16" 3840 x 2400, Win 11 Pro, Camera, Wi-Fi, Bluetooth, HDMI, kbd: US (replaces BX7V8UT#ABA)	DK2K1UT#ABA	\$3,055.57	No Bid	\$3,020.20	\$3,172.00	No Bid	\$3,939.33	No Bid	No Bid
1 to 25	HP USB-C Docking Station	5TW10AA/ 5TW10UT#ABA	No Bid- NLA	No Bid	No Bid	\$207.00	No Bid	\$207.93	No Bid	No Bid
1 to 25	HP USB-C Docking Station (replaces 5TW10AA/5TW10UT)	9X3V1UT#ABA	\$137.97	No Bid	\$135.00	\$141.00	No Bid	\$202.89	No Bid	No Bid
1 to 25	Plugable USB-C Triple 4K Display Docking Station	UD-ULTC4K	\$221.79	No Bid	\$214.27	\$233.00	No Bid	\$229.15	\$226.45	No Bid
1 to 25	Plugable USB-C Triple HDMI Display Docking Station	UD-3900PDZ	\$144.75	No Bid	\$140.05	\$151.00	No Bid	\$148.64	No Bid	No Bid
1 to 25	Plugable Dual Display Universal Docking Station	UD-3900	\$91.69	No Bid	\$91.89	\$95.00	No Bid	\$92.90	No Bid	No Bid

Minimal qty coming into stock