
HP Desktop, Monitor, Laptop May 2026 Pricing Low Bid

Quantity Item Part#  Bluum  CDW-G  Countertrade 

 Data Center 

Warehouse  Howard 

 Insight 

Public Sector 

 Software 

House Int'l 

(SHI) 

 SSA 

Technology VLCM

Desktops

1 to 25

HP EliteDesk 8 G1i SFF, Intel Core Ultra 5-235, vPro Tech, 

16GB RAM, 512GB SSD, Intel Q870 Chip, Win 11 Pro, Jack 

Black, kbd: US BH9E4UT#ABA $1,296.61 No Bid $1,356.57 No Bid $1,326.00 $1,327.94 No Bid $1,403.29 No Bid

Desktop Mini, Mounting Brackets

1 to 25

HP EliteDesk 8 G1i Desktop Mini, Intel Core Ultra 5-235T, 

vPro Tech, 16GB RAM, 512GB SSD, Intel Q870 Chip, Win 11 

Pro, Jack Black, kbd: US BQ4B6UT#ABA $1,246.04 No Bid $1,286.43 No Bid $1,257.00 $1,222.67 No Bid $1,243.07 No Bid

1 to 25
HP EliteDesk 8 G1i Desktop Mini, Intel Core Ultra 5 235T, 

vPro Technology, 16GB RAM, 512GB PCI Express NVMe 

SSD, Win 11 Pro, GigE, Bluetooth (Replaces BQ4B6UT) D32N3UT#ABA No Bid No Bid $1,152.24 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

1 to 25

HP Elite 800 G9 Desktop Mini, Core i7 14700T/ 4.9 GHz, 

16GB RAM, 512 GB SSD, Win 11 Pro, UHD Graphics 770 

(replaces 86Y59UT#ABA) A12GNUT#ABA $1,497.61 No Bid No Bid No Bid $1,526.00 No Bid No Bid $1,488.11 No Bid

1 to 25

HP EliteDesk 8 G1i Desktop Mini, Intel Core Ultra 7-265T, 

vPro Tech, 16GB RAM, 512GB SSD, Intel Q870 Chip, Win 11 

Pro, Jack Black, kbd: US BQ4B9UT#ABA $1,386.14 No Bid $1,436.30 No Bid $1,406.00 $1,405.99 No Bid $1,563.50 No Bid

1 to 25
HP EliteDesk 8 G1i Desktop Mini, Intel Core Ultra 7-264T, 

vPro Technology, 16GB RAM, 512GB SSD, Intel Q870 Chip, 

Win 11 Pro, GigE, Bluetooth (replaces BQ4B9UT) D32N5UT#ABA No Bid No Bid $1,669.93 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

1 to 25 HP B300  PC Mounting Bracket, thin client (For EliteDisplay 

E223, E233, E243, E24, E27 monitors listed below) 2DW53AA $39.35 No Bid $38.51 No Bid $41.00 $39.69 No Bid $77.04 No Bid

1 to 25
HP B300 Mounting Bracket for Workstation, Mini PC, Thin 

Client (Replaces 7DB37AT and 2DW53AT) 7DB37AA $33.99 No Bid $62.64 No Bid $65.00 $63.90 No Bid $65.06 No Bid

1 to 25
HP Quick Release Bracket 2 (For P27v monitor listed below) 6KD15AA $16.86 No Bid $16.51 No Bid $33.00 $17.01 No Bid $31.96 No Bid

1 to 25
HP B250 PC Mounting Bracket (For P27h monitor listed 

below) 8RA46AA $38.21 No Bid $37.00 No Bid $41.00 $38.13 No Bid $65.06 No Bid

1 to 25
HP B560 PC Mounting Bracket, use for EliteDisplay E24 G5 

and E27 G5 monitors listed below B560/763U8AA $30.66 No Bid $30.00 No Bid $31.00 $30.92 No Bid $68.84 No Bid

Monitors

1 to 25 HP 524pf 24" Class Full HD LED Monitor, 16:9, Black 

(replaces 6N6E9AA#ABA) 9D9L6UT#ABA $155.17 No Bid $161.41 No Bid $165.00 $159.76 No Bid $184.51 No Bid

1 to 25
HP 327pf Monitor, 27", 1920 x 1080 Full HD (1080P), 16:9, 

Black (replaces 64X69AA#ABA) B0CG3UT#ABA $155.52 No Bid $177.03 No Bid $143.00 $138.73 No Bid $140.63 No Bid

1 to 25
HP S5 Pro 527pf Full HD (1920 x 1080) LED Monitor, 27" B28F5UT#ABA $165.00 No Bid $171.82 No Bid $175.00 $170.06 No Bid $216.90 No Bid

1 to 25

HP 327ph Monitor, 27", 1920 x 1080 Full HD (1080P), 5ms 

response time for games/films/sports, 16:9, height 

adjustable, speakers, Black B0CG8UT#ABA $162.40 No Bid $183.75 No Bid $162.00 $157.28 No Bid $159.43 No Bid

1 to 25
HP E27 G5 E-series, LED Monitor, 27", 1920 x 1080 Full HD 6N4E2AA#ABA $207.64 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
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Laptops

1 to 25

HP Elite x360 830 G11 2-in-1 Multi-Touch Notebook, 13.3" 

Screen, Intel Ultra 7-165U, 1.70GHz,  16GB memory, 512GB 

SSD storage, Windows 11 Pro, WUXGA, Wi-Fi, Bluetooth, 

kbd: US, Touchscreen & Flip Model (Replaces 

895M9UT#ABA) A6SU6UT#ABA No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $1,550.00 $1,669.54 No Bid $1,206.45 No Bid

1 to 25

HP EliteBook 8 Flip G1i 13.3" Touchscreen Convertible 2 in 

1 Notebook, Intel Core Ultra 7 265U, vPro, 16GB RAM, 

512GB SSD, WUXGA, 13.3" 1920 x 1200, Win 11 Pro, 

Bluetooth, kbd: US, Touchscreen & Flip Model (replaces 

A6SU6UT#ABA) BM5M6UT#ABA $2,035.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid $2,147.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

1 to 25

HP EliteBook 830 G11 Notebook, 13.3", Intel Core Ultra 5 

135U 12-Core, Intel Graphics, 16GB RAM, 512GB SSD 

storage, 1920 x 1200, Win 11 Pro, 5MP Webcam, 

Bluetooth, Wi-Fi 6E, kbd: US (no touchscreen) (replaces 

895M1UT#ABA) A6TG0UT#ABA $1,187.99 No Bid No Bid No Bid $1,170.00 $1,261.93 No Bid $1,525.14 No Bid

1 to 25

HP EliteBook 8 G1i 14" Notebook, Intel Core Ultra 5 235U, 

vPro, 16GB RAM, 512GB SSD, WUXGA 14" 1920 x 1200, 

Win 11 Pro, Camera, Bluetooth, kbd: US (replaces 

A6SZ3UT#ABA) BE8S8UT#ABA $1,555.28 No Bid $1,669.75 No Bid $1,632.00 $1,642.86 No Bid No Bid No Bid

1 to 25

HP EliteBook 8 G1i 14" Touchscreen Notebook, Intel Core 

Ultra 5-236V, 16GB RAM, 512GB SSD, WUXGA 1920 x 1200 

IPS Touchscreen, Win 11 Pro, Camera, Wi-Fi, Bluetooth, 

Glacier Silver, kbd: US BG7N5UT#ABA $1,642.99 No Bid $1,694.64 No Bid $1,716.00 $1,658.88 No Bid No Bid No Bid

1 to 25

HP ProBook 4 G1i 14" Notebook, Intel Core Ultra 7-255U, 

Win 11 Pro, 16GB RAM, 512GB SSD, 14" WUXGA 1920 x 

1200, Camera,  Gigabit Ethernet, Wi-Fi, Bluetooth, Pike 

Silver, Kbd: US (Replaces A1LC3UT#ABA) BA7R6UT#ABA $1,171.99 No Bid $1,481.00 No Bid $1,207.00 $1,457.14 No Bid No Bid No Bid

1 to 25

HP EliteBook 8 G1i 14" Touchscreen Notebook, Intel Core 

Ultra 7 255U, 16GB RAM, 512GB SSD, WUXGA 14" 1920 x 

1200, Win 11 Pro, Camera, Bluetooth, kbd: US (replaces 

A6SZ1UT#ABA) BE9E6UT#ABA $1,714.55 No Bid $1,776.58 No Bid $1,731.00 $1,747.96 No Bid No Bid No Bid

1 to 25

HP EliteBook 8 G1i 14" Touchscreen Notebook, Intel Core 

Ultra 7-258V, Win 11 Pro, 32GB RAM, 512GB SSD, WUXGA 

1920 x 1200 IPS Touchscreen, Camera. Gigabit Ethernet, Wi-

Fi, Bluetooth, Glacier Silver, kbd: US (Replaces 

A6SZ1UT#ABA) BG7N6UT#ABA $1,867.51 No Bid $1,943.55 No Bid $1,903.00 $1,912.24 No Bid No Bid No Bid

1 to 25

HP EliteBook 840 G11 Notebook, 14" Touchscreen, 

WUXGA, Intel Core Ultra 5 125U, 16GB DDR5 RAM, 512GB 

SSD, 1920 x 1200, Win 11 Pro, Intel Graphics, 5MP 

webcam, Wi-Fi, Bluetooth, kbd: US Touchscreen (replaces 

A14RTUT#ABA) A6SY4UT#ABA $1,309.43 No Bid No Bid No Bid $1,289.00 $1,379.70 No Bid $1,591.78 No Bid

1 to 25

HP EliteBook 8 G1i 14" Touchscreen Notebook, Intel Core 

Ultra 5 225U, 16GB RAM, 512GB SSD, WUXGA 14" 1920 x 

1200, Win 11 Pro, Camera, Bluetooth, kbd: US (replaces 

A6SY4UT#ABA) BE9E5UT#ABA $1,518.44 No Bid $1,624.12 No Bid $1,593.00 $1,541.15 No Bid No Bid No Bid
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Laptops (cont.)

1 to 25

HP EliteBook 8 G1i 14" Touchscreen Notebook, Intel Core 

Ultra 5-226V, 16GB RAM, 512GB SSD, WUXGA 1920 x 1200 

IPS Touchscreen, Win 11 Pro, Camera, Wi-Fi, Bluetooth, 

Glacier Silver, kbd: US Touchscreen (replaces 

A6SY4UT#ABA) BG6L7UT#ABA $1,545.40 No Bid $1,616.86 No Bid $1,607.00 $1,582.74 No Bid No Bid No Bid

1 to 25
HP ZBook 8 G1i 14" Mobile Workstation, WUXGA, 60 Hz, 

Intel Core Ultra 7 255H, 32GB RAM, 512GB SSD, WUXGA 

14" 1920 x 1200, Win 11 Pro, Camera, Bluetooth, kbd: US BP6J9UT#ABA $2,128.92 No Bid $2,205.46 No Bid $2,124.00 $2,159.39 No Bid $1,978.14 No Bid

1 to 25

HP EliteBook 8 G1i 16" Touchscreen Notebook, Intel Core 

Ultra 5-225U, 16GB RAM, 512GB SSD, WUXGA 16" 1920 x 

1200, Win 11 Pro, Camera, Bluetooth, HDMI, kbd: US 

(replaces A6TE1UT#ABA and A6TD8UT#ABA) BG7N2UT#ABA $1,547.39 No Bid $1,603.38 No Bid $1,622.00 $1,569.54 No Bid No Bid No Bid

1 to 25

HP EliteBook 8 G1i 16" Touchscreen Notebook, Intel Core 

Ultra 5-226V, 16GB RAM, 512GB SSD, WUXGA 1920 x 1200 

IPS Touchscreen, Win 11 Pro, Camera, Wi-Fi, Bluetooth, 

HDMI, Glacier Silver, kbd: US (replaces A6TE1UT#ABA) BH1B2UT#ABA $1,514.99 No Bid $1,554.63 No Bid $1,574.00 $1,521.83 No Bid No Bid No Bid

1 to 25

HP 16" ProBook 4 G1i Notebook Copilot+ laptop, Intel Core 

Ultra 7-255U, 16GB RAM, 512GB SSD, 16" 1920 x 1200 IPS, 

Win 11 Pro, Camera, Wi-Fi 6E, Bluetooth, HDMI, kbd: US 

(replaces A1LH5UT#ABA) BB3R1UT#ABA $1,213.07 No Bid $1,434.33 No Bid $1,236.00 $1,411.22 No Bid No Bid No Bid

1 to 25

HP Zbook 8 G1i 16" Mobile Workstation, Intel Core Ultra 7-

255H, 32GB RAM, 512GB SSD, WUXGA 16" 1920 x 1200, 

Win 11 Pro, Camera, Bluetooth, HDMI, kbd: US (replaces 

A6UF5UT#ABA) BP6Y6UT#ABA $2,163.95 No Bid $2,242.24 No Bid $2,181.00 $2,194.92 No Bid $2,053.58 No Bid

1 to 25

HP ZBook 8 G1i 16" Mobile Workstation, Intel Core Ultra 7-

265H, 32GB RAM, 1TB SSD, WQUXGA 16" 3840 x 2400, Win 

11 Pro, Camera, Bluetooth, HDMI, kbd: US (replaces 

A6UG2UT#ABA) BX7V8UT#ABA $3,017.71 No Bid $3,126.90 No Bid $3,017.00 $3,060.91 No Bid $2,901.77 No Bid

1 to 25 HP USB-C Docking Station
5TW10AA/ 

5TW10UT#ABA $179.17 No Bid No Bid No Bid $162.00 $159.76 No Bid $186.46 No Bid

1 to 25
HP USB-C Docking Station (replaces 5TW10AA/5TW10UT) 9X3V1UT#ABA $135.99 No Bid No Bid No Bid $141.00 $139.15 No Bid $202.01 No Bid

1 to 25 Plugable USB-C Triple 4K Display Docking Station UD-ULTC4K $211.74 No Bid No Bid No Bid $209.00 $205.13 No Bid $215.42 No Bid

1 to 25 Plugable USB-C Triple HDMI Display Docking Station UD-3900PDZ $144.75 No Bid No Bid No Bid $144.00 $120.07 No Bid $148.03 No Bid

1 to 25 Plugable Dual Display Universal Docking Station UD-3900 $91.69 No Bid No Bid No Bid $91.00 $83.24 No Bid $92.80 No Bid


