
HP Chromebook and Cart March 2026 Pricing

Quantity Item Part # Bluum  CDW-G  Countertrade 

 Data Center 

Warehouse  Howard 

 Insight Public 

Sector 

 School 

Specialty 

 Software 

House Int'l 

(SHI)  Trafera 

 Vivacity 

Tech  VLCM 

Chromebook and Google Chrome Package

1-100
HP Fortis G10 11.6" Chromebook, Intel N-Series N100, 4GB RAM, 

32GB eMMC, Google Chrome OS, 11.6" 1366 x 768 (HD), UHD 

Graphics, Wi-Fi, Bluetooth, kbd: US (replaces 3V2Y2UT#ABA) 9R3A9UT#ABA  $      212.99  No Bid  $           212.63  No Bid  No Bid  $              228.43  No Bid  No Bid  No Bid  No Bid  No Bid 

1-100

HP Fortis G1i 11" Chromebook, Intel N150, 4GB RAM, 32GB 

storage, Google Chrome OS, 11" 1366 x 768 (HD), Wi-Fi, 

Bluetooth, kbd: US (replaces 9R3A9UT#ABA) B69P5UT#ABA  $      368.93  No Bid  $           366.36  No Bid  No Bid  $              376.12  No Bid  No Bid  No Bid  No Bid  No Bid 

1-100

HP Fortis 11 G10 Chromebook, *RUGGED*, Celeron N100/ 1.0 

GHz 4-Core processor, Google Chrome OS 64, 8GB RAM, 64GB 

eMMC SSD, 11.6" 1366 x 768 (HD), UHD Graphics, Wi-Fi, 

Bluetooth, kbd: US 9R3B4UT#ABA  $      245.22  No Bid  No Bid  No Bid  No Bid  $              248.73  No Bid  No Bid  No Bid  No Bid  No Bid 

1-100

HP Fortis G1i 11" Chromebook, *RUGGED*, Intel N150, 8GB RAM, 

64GB Storage, Google Chrome OS, 11" 1366 x 768 (HD), Wi-Fi, 

Bluetooth, kbd: US (replaces 9R3B4UT#ABA) B69P6UT#ABA  $      445.51  No Bid  $           442.40  No Bid  No Bid  $              454.18  No Bid  No Bid  No Bid  No Bid  No Bid 

1-100

HP Fortis G1i 11.6" Chromebook, *RUGGED*, Intel N250, 8GB 

RAM, 128GB storage, Google Chrome OS, 11.6" 1366 x 768 (HD), 

Wi-Fi, Bluetooth, kbd: US (Replaces 9R3K4UT#ABA) B69SNUT#ABA  $      498.85  No Bid  $           493.76  No Bid  No Bid  $              505.99  No Bid  No Bid  No Bid  No Bid  No Bid 

1-100

HP Fortis G10 11.6" Touchscreen Chromebook, Intel N-Series 

N100, 4GB RAM, 32GB eMMC, Google Chrome OS, 11.6" 

Touchscreen 1366 x 768 (HD), UHD Graphics, Wi-Fi, Bluetooth, 

kbd: US 9R3B0UT#ABA  $      261.56  No Bid  $           275.84  No Bid  No Bid  $              279.25  No Bid  No Bid  No Bid  No Bid  No Bid 

1-100
HP Fortis G1i 11.6" Touchscreen Chromebook, Intel N150, 4GB 

RAM, 32GB storage, Google Chrome OS, 11.6" Touchscreen 1366 

x 768 (HD), Wi-Fi, Bluetooth, kbd: US (Replaces 9R3B0UT#ABA) B69SJUT#ABA  $      393.96  No Bid  $           391.21  No Bid  No Bid  $              401.63  No Bid  No Bid  No Bid  No Bid  No Bid 

1-100

HP Fortis Flip G1i 11" Touchscreen and flip design Chromebook, 

Intel N150, 4GB RAM, 32GB storage, Google Chrome OS, 11" 

1366 x 768 (HD), Wi-Fi, Bluetooth, kbd: US (Replaces 

9R393UT#ABA) B69PJUT#ABA  $      433.75  No Bid  $           445.88  No Bid  No Bid  $              457.76  No Bid  No Bid  No Bid  No Bid  No Bid 

1-100

HP Fortis Flip G1i 11" touchscreen and flip design Chromebook, 

Intel N150, 4GB RAM, 32GB storage, Google Chrome OS, 11" 

1366 x 768 (HD), Wi-Fi, Bluetooth, kbd: US (Replaces 

9R396UT#ABA and 9R395UT#ABA) B69PKUT#ABA  $      453.25  No Bid  $           442.42  No Bid  No Bid  $              467.96  No Bid  No Bid  No Bid  No Bid  No Bid 

1-100

Google Chrome OS Management Console License- academic  

(Purchase for all Chromebooks, Chromeboxes and Chromebook 

Plus devices) CROS-SW-DIS-EDU-NEW  $        29.59  No Bid  $            29.15  No Bid  No Bid  $                29.87  No Bid  No Bid  No Bid  No Bid  No Bid 

(For Chromebooks and Chromeboxes) TOTAL

Chromeboxes

1-100 HP Chromebox G4, ChromeOS, Intel Celeron 7305, 4GB memory, 

64GB eMMC storage, Intel UHD Graphics, Wi-Fi 6E, Bluetooth 8R2T3UT#ABA  $      393.99  No Bid  No Bid  No Bid  No Bid  $              458.43  No Bid  No Bid  No Bid  No Bid  No Bid 

1-100
HP Custom Chromebook XG4 i5-1335U, 16GB RAM, 256GB 

storage (Custom Build) (Replaces AM0L5UP#ABA) D10XQUP#ABA  $  1,258.95  No Bid  $        1,262.95  No Bid  No Bid  No Bid  No Bid  No Bid  No Bid  No Bid  No Bid 

1-100 HP Chromebox G4, Intel core i5-1335U, 32GB RAM, 256GB 

storage (Custom Build)

Config ID# 51932074 

Jordan SD or 

AM0N0UP#ABA  $      939.79  No Bid  $       1,252.62  No Bid  No Bid  No Bid  No Bid  No Bid  No Bid  No Bid  No Bid 

1-100
Google Chrome OS Management Console License- academic  

(Purchase for all Chromebooks, Chromeboxes and Chromebook 

Plus devices) CROS-SW-DIS-EDU-NEW  $        29.59  No Bid  $            29.15  No Bid  No Bid  $                29.87  No Bid  No Bid  No Bid  No Bid  No Bid 

Chromebook Plus Devices for Teachers/Administrators

1-100

HP Fortis G1i 14" Chromebook, Intel N250 3.8GHz, Chrome OS, 

8GB RAM, 128GB storage, 1920 x 1080 (Full HD), Wi-Fi 6E, 180 

degree lay flat hinge, privacy camera B69SDUT#ABA  $      556.90  No Bid  $           551.21  No Bid  No Bid  $              567.76  No Bid  No Bid  No Bid  No Bid  No Bid 

1-100

HP Fortis G1i 14" Touchscreen Chromebook, Intel N250 3.8GHz, 

Chrome OS, 8GB RAM, 128GB storage, 1920 x 1080 (Full HD), Wi-

Fi 6E B69SFUT#ABA  $      581.93  No Bid  $           575.98  No Bid  No Bid  $              590.25  No Bid  No Bid  No Bid  No Bid  No Bid 

1-100
HP Fortis G1i 14" Chromebook, Intel N150 3.6GHz, Chrome OS, 

8GB RAM, 128GB storage, 1920 x 1080 (Full HD), Wi-Fi B69NZUT#ABA  $      518.56  No Bid  $           518.24  No Bid  No Bid  $              532.04  No Bid  No Bid  No Bid  No Bid  No Bid 

Overall Low

*  Note: Please order Google licenses from same vendor as Chromebooks & Chromeboxes when 

ordering together.
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Overall Low

*  Note: Please order Google licenses from same vendor as Chromebooks & Chromeboxes when 

ordering together.

Chromebook Plus Devices for Teachers/Administrators (cont.)

1-100  HP Fortis G1i 14" Chromebook, Intel N150 3.6GHz, Chrome OS, 

8GB RAM, 128GB storage, 1920 x 1080 (Full HD), Wi-Fi B69P0UT#ABA  $      511.86  No Bid  $           506.63  No Bid  No Bid  $              519.19  No Bid  No Bid  No Bid  No Bid  No Bid 

1-100

HP Fortis G1i 14" Enterprise Chromebook,Intel N150 3.6GHz, 

Chrome OS, 8GB RAM, 128/GB storage,  1920 x 1080 (Full HD), 

Wi-Fi B6AX3UT#ABA  $      645.27  No Bid  $           647.45  No Bid  No Bid  $              664.69  No Bid  No Bid  No Bid  No Bid  No Bid 

1-100

HP Fortis G1i 14" Enterprise Touchscreen Chromebook, Intel N150 

3.6GHz, Chrome OS, 8GB RAM, 64GB storage, 1920 x 1080 (Full 

HD), Wi-Fi, camera B6AX4UT#ABA  $      722.05  No Bid  $           717.03  No Bid  No Bid  $              736.12  No Bid  No Bid  No Bid  No Bid  No Bid 

1-100

HP Fortis Flip G1i 11" Touchscreen & Flip Convertible 2 in 1 

Chromebook, Intel N150 3.6GHz, Chrome OS, 16GB RAM, 128GB 

storage, 11.6" 1366 x 768 (HD), Wi-Fi B69PQUT#ABA   $      708.63  No Bid  $           704.01  No Bid  No Bid  $              722.76  No Bid  No Bid  No Bid  No Bid  No Bid 

1-100
HP USI Garaged Pen (Stylus sold seperately for HP Fortis Flip G1i 

Touchscreen & Flip, part# B69PQUT#ABA) 4R0Q5AA#ABA  $        60.22  No Bid  $             59.32  No Bid  No Bid  $                67.48  No Bid  No Bid  No Bid  No Bid  No Bid 

1-100

Google Chrome OS Management Console License- academic  

(Purchase for all Chromebooks, Chromeboxes and Chromebook 

Plus devices) CROS-SW-DIS-EDU-NEW  $        29.59  No Bid  $            29.15  No Bid  No Bid  $                29.87  No Bid  No Bid  No Bid  No Bid  No Bid 

Carts

1 to 20 Aver E36CV charging cart for 36 units for iPads E36CV  $  1,029.99  No Bid  No Bid  No Bid  No Bid  No Bid  No Bid  No Bid  No Bid  No Bid  No Bid 

1 to 20 Liftgate Service  included 

1 to 20 Optional Inside Delivery Service  included 

1 to 20 Shipping and Handling for carts only  included 

TOTAL  $  1,029.99 

1 to 20 Aver C36i+ charging cart for 36 units C36I+  $  1,209.00  No Bid  No Bid  No Bid  No Bid  $           1,826.31  No Bid  No Bid  No Bid  No Bid  No Bid 

1 to 20 Liftgate Service  included  additional 

1 to 20 Optional Inside Delivery Service  included  additional 

1 to 20 Shipping and Handling for carts only  included  $              384.85 

TOTAL  $  1,209.00  $           2,211.16 

1 to 20 Anywhere Cart PT-36 charging cart for 36 units PT-36  $      797.00  No Bid  No Bid  No Bid  No Bid  $           1,334.94  No Bid  No Bid  No Bid  No Bid  No Bid 

1 to 20 Liftgate Service  included  additional 

1 to 20 Optional Inside Delivery Service included  additional 

1 to 20 Shipping and Handling for carts only included  $              417.67 

TOTAL  $      797.00  $              -    $           1,752.61 

1 to 20 Anywhere Cart AC-PLUS-T 36-Unit Secure Smart Charging Cart AC-PLUS-T  $      869.99  No Bid  No Bid  No Bid  No Bid  No Bid  No Bid  No Bid  No Bid  No Bid  No Bid 

1 to 20 Liftgate Service  included 

1 to 20 Optional Inside Delivery Service  n/a 

1 to 20 Shipping and Handling for carts only  included 

TOTAL  $      869.99 

1 to 20 Aver X42i 42-device charging cart X42i  $  1,209.00  No Bid  No Bid  No Bid  No Bid  No Bid  No Bid  No Bid  No Bid  No Bid  No Bid 

1 to 20 Liftgate Service  included 

1 to 20 Optional Inside Delivery Service  included 

1 to 20 Shipping and Handling for carts only  included 

TOTAL  $  1,209.00 

1 to 20 Anywhere Cart AC-Pro II 40 Bay Full Feature Smart Cart AC-PRO II  $  1,339.00  No Bid  No Bid  No Bid  No Bid  $           1,937.70  No Bid  No Bid  No Bid  No Bid  No Bid 

1 to 20 Liftgate Service  included  additional 

1 to 20 Optional Inside Delivery Service  n/a  additional 

1 to 20 Shipping and Handling for carts only  included  $              523.57 

TOTAL  $  1,339.00  $           2,461.27 
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Overall Low

*  Note: Please order Google licenses from same vendor as Chromebooks & Chromeboxes when 

ordering together.

Carts (cont)

1 to 20 Vivacity Tech 36-Unit Smart Charging Cart VTCART-C36-G2  No Bid  No Bid  No Bid  No Bid  No Bid  No Bid  No Bid  No Bid  No Bid  No Bid  No Bid 

1 to 20 Liftgate Service

1 to 20 Optional Inside Delivery Service

1 to 20 Shipping and Handling for carts only

TOTAL

1 to 20 Vivacity Tech 30-Unit Charging Cart VTCART-B30-G2  No Bid  No Bid  No Bid  No Bid  No Bid  No Bid  No Bid  No Bid  No Bid  No Bid  No Bid 

1 to 20 Liftgate Service

1 to 20 Optional Inside Delivery Service

1 to 20 Shipping and Handling for carts only

TOTAL

1 to 20 Vivacity Tech Mini Charging Cabinet- 12 Unit, Black VTCABI-B12-G2  No Bid  No Bid  No Bid  No Bid  No Bid  No Bid  No Bid  No Bid  No Bid  No Bid  No Bid 

1 to 20 Liftgate Service

1 to 20 Optional Inside Delivery Service

1 to 20 Shipping and Handling for carts only

TOTAL

1 to 20

Aver Charge B30 30 device charging cart (compare to Vivacity 30-

unit cart) CHRGEB030  $      779.79  No Bid  No Bid  No Bid  No Bid  $              888.58  No Bid  No Bid  No Bid  No Bid  No Bid 

1 to 20 Liftgate Service  $        40.00  additional 

1 to 20 Optional Inside Delivery Service  n/a  additional 

1 to 20 Shipping and Handling for carts only  included  $              202.18 

TOTAL  $      819.79  $           1,090.76 

1 to 20

Anywhere Cart AC-30  30 Bay charging cart (compare to Vivacity 30 

or Aver B30) AC-30  $      549.79  No Bid  No Bid  No Bid  No Bid  $              954.27  No Bid  No Bid  No Bid  No Bid  No Bid 

1 to 20 Liftgate Service  included  additional 

1 to 20 Optional Inside Delivery Service  included  additional 

1 to 20 Shipping and Handling for carts only  included  $              317.37 

TOTAL  $      549.79  $           1,271.64 

1 to 20 Luxor 16 Tablet/Chromebook Open Charging Cart LOTM16  $      207.97  No Bid  No Bid  No Bid  No Bid  $              208.95  $        217.97  No Bid  No Bid  No Bid  No Bid 

1 to 20 Liftgate Service  included  additional 

1 to 20 Optional Inside Delivery Service  included  additional 

1 to 20 Shipping and Handling for carts only  included  $              124.31  included 

TOTAL  $      207.97  $              333.26  $        217.97 

1 to 20 Luxor 32 Tablet/Chromebook Open Charging Cart LOTM32  $      319.99  No Bid  No Bid  No Bid  No Bid  No Bid  No Bid  No Bid  No Bid  No Bid  No Bid 

1 to 20 Liftgate Service  included 

1 to 20 Optional Inside Delivery Service  additional 

1 to 20 Shipping and Handling for carts only  included 

TOTAL  $      319.99 

1 to 20 Anywhere Cart AC-COMP16 16 Bay charging cart AC-COMP-16  $      399.99  No Bid  No Bid  No Bid  No Bid  $              591.43  No Bid  No Bid  No Bid  No Bid  No Bid 

1 to 20 Liftgate Service  included  additional 

1 to 20 Optional Inside Delivery Service  included  additional 

1 to 20 Shipping and Handling for carts only  included  $              142.90 

TOTAL  $      399.99  $              734.33 
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Overall Low

*  Note: Please order Google licenses from same vendor as Chromebooks & Chromeboxes when 

ordering together.

Carts (cont)

1 to 20

Anywhere Cart 12 Unit Secure Charging Cabinet for Chromebooks, 

laptops, tablets AC-MINI  $      417.99  No Bid  No Bid  No Bid  No Bid  No Bid  No Bid  No Bid  No Bid  No Bid  No Bid 

1 to 20 Liftgate Service  n/a 

1 to 20 Optional Inside Delivery Service  n/a 

1 to 20 Shipping and Handling for carts only  included 

TOTAL  $      417.99 

1 to 20 Aver X16  12 Device Charge Cabinet X16  $      485.99  No Bid  No Bid  No Bid  No Bid  No Bid  No Bid  No Bid  No Bid  No Bid  No Bid 

1 to 20 Liftgate Service  n/a 

1 to 20 Optional Inside Delivery Service  n/a 

1 to 20 Shipping and Handling for carts only  included 

TOTAL  $      485.99 

1 to 20 Belkin Store and Charge Station AC, up to 10 devices B2B074  $      133.99  No Bid  No Bid  No Bid  No Bid  $              146.40  No Bid  No Bid  No Bid  No Bid  No Bid 

1 to 20 Liftgate Service  n/a  n/a 

1 to 20 Optional Inside Delivery Service  n/a  n/a 

1 to 20 Shipping and Handling for stations only  included  $                27.29 

TOTAL  $      133.99  $              173.69 


