

HP Chromebook and Cart Pricing - August 2025 - Revised 8/18/25

Award Highlighted in Yellow

Quantity	Item	Part #	Bluum	Countertrade	Data Center Warehouse	Howard	Insight Public Sector	School Specialty	Software House Int'l	Trafera	Vivacity Tech	VLCM
----------	------	--------	-------	--------------	-----------------------	--------	-----------------------	------------------	----------------------	---------	---------------	------

* Note: Please order Google licenses from same vendor as Chromebooks & Chromeboxes when ordering together.

Chromebook and Google Chrome Package												
1-100	HP Fortis G10 11.6" Chromebook, Intel N-Series N100, 4GB RAM, 32GB eMMC, Google Chrome OS, 11.6" 1366 x 768 (HD), UHD Graphics, Wi-Fi, Bluetooth, kbd: US (replaces 3V2Y2UT#ABA)	9R3A9UT#ABA	\$214.86	\$216.35	\$208.08	No Bid	\$ 228.43	No Bid	\$ 217.40	No Bid	\$ 232.00	No Bid
1-100	HP Fortis G1i 11" Chromebook, Intel N150, 4GB RAM, 32GB storage, Google Chrome OS, 11" 1366 x 768 (HD), Wi-Fi, Bluetooth, kbd: US (replaces 9R3A9UT#ABA)	B69P5UT#ABA	\$285.17	\$279.63	\$283.27	No Bid	\$ 289.34	No Bid	\$ 275.37	No Bid	\$ 294.00	No Bid
1-100	HP Fortis 11 G10 Chromebook, *RUGGED* , Celeron N100 / 1.0 GHz 4-Core processor, Google Chrome OS 64, 8GB RAM, 64GB eMMC SSD, 11.6" 1366 x 768 (HD), UHD Graphics, Wi-Fi, Bluetooth, kbd: US	9R3B4UT#ABA	\$219.56	\$240.39	\$235.56	No Bid	\$ 248.73	No Bid	\$ 236.73	No Bid	\$ 253.00	No Bid
1-100	HP Fortis G1i 11" Chromebook, *RUGGED* , Intel N150, 8GB RAM, 64GB Storage, Google Chrome OS, 11" 1366 x 768 (HD), Wi-Fi, Bluetooth, kbd: US (replaces 9R3B4UT#ABA)	B69P6UT#ABA	\$311.28	\$305.14	\$309.11	No Bid	\$ 315.74	No Bid	\$ 300.50	No Bid	\$ 321.00	No Bid
1-100	HP Fortis 11 G10 Chromebook, *RUGGED* , Celeron N200 / 1.0 GHz 4-core processor, Google Chrome OS 64, 8GB RAM, 64GB eMMC SSD, 11.6" 1366 x 768 (HD), UHD Graphics, Wi-Fi, Bluetooth, kbd: US	9R3K4UT#ABA	\$406.14	\$399.41	\$403.44	No Bid	\$ 412.08	No Bid	\$ 392.19	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
1-100	HP Fortis G1i 11.6" Chromebook, *RUGGED* , Intel N250, 8GB RAM, 128GB storage, Google Chrome OS, 11.6" 1366 x 768 (HD), Wi-Fi, Bluetooth, kbd: US (Replaces 9R3K4UT#ABA)	B69SNUT#ABA	\$351.21	\$344.39	\$348.87	No Bid	\$ 356.35	No Bid	\$ 339.14	No Bid	\$ 362.00	No Bid
1-100	HP Fortis G10 11.6" Touchscreen Chromebook, Intel N-Series N100, 4GB RAM, 32GB eMMC, Google Chrome OS, 11.6" <u>Touchscreen</u> 1366 x 768 (HD), UHD Graphics, Wi-Fi, Bluetooth, kbd: US	9R3B0UT#ABA	\$261.68	\$281.00	\$262.31	No Bid	\$ 296.45	No Bid	\$ 282.13	No Bid	\$ 302.00	No Bid
1-100	HP Fortis G1i 11.6" Touchscreen Chromebook, Intel N150, 4GB RAM, 32GB storage, Google Chrome OS, 11.6" <u>Touchscreen</u> 1366 x 768 (HD), Wi-Fi, Bluetooth, kbd: US (Replaces 9R3B0UT#ABA)	B69SJUT#ABA	\$310.18	\$304.16	\$308.12	No Bid	\$ 314.72	No Bid	\$ 299.52	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
1-100	HP Fortis x360 11 G5 11.6" Chromebook, <u>touchscreen and flip design</u> , Intel N100, 4GB RAM, 32GB storage, camera, 11.6" touchscreen, 1366 x 768 (HD), UHD Graphics, Wi-Fi, Bluetooth, kbd: US (replaces 7L2Z9UT#ABA)	9R393UT#ABA	\$320.19	\$314.88	\$318.06	No Bid	\$ 324.87	No Bid	\$ 309.19	No Bid	\$ 330.00	No Bid
1-100	HP Fortis Flip G1i 11" <u>Touchscreen and flip design</u> Chromebook, Intel N150, 4GB RAM, 32GB storage, Google Chrome OS, 11" 1366 x 768 (HD), Wi-Fi, Bluetooth, kbd: US (Replaces 9R393UT#ABA)	B69PJUT#ABA	\$365.22	\$358.12	\$362.79	No Bid	\$ 370.56	No Bid	\$ 352.67	No Bid	\$ 377.00	No Bid
1-100	HP Fortis G5 11.6" Chromebook, <u>touchscreen and flip design</u> , Intel N100, 4GB RAM, 32GB storage, 8 MP Camera , 11.6" touchscre, 1366 x 768 (HD), UHD Graphics, Wi-Fi, Bluetooth, kbd: US (replaces 7L2Z9UT#ABA and 3V254UT#ABA)	9R396UT#ABA	\$413.84	\$406.98	\$411.09	No Bid	\$ 419.90	No Bid	\$ 399.63	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
1-100	HP Fortis Flip G1i 11" <u>touchscreen and flip design</u> Chromebook, Intel N150, 4GB RAM, 32GB storage, Google Chrome OS, 11" 1366 x 768 (HD), Wi-Fi, Bluetooth, kbd: US (Replaces 9R396UT#ABA and 9R395UT#ABA)	B69PKUT#ABA	\$375.22	\$367.94	\$372.73	No Bid	\$ 380.71	No Bid	\$ 362.33	No Bid	\$ 387.00	No Bid
1-100	HP Fortis G5 11.6" Chromebook, <u>touchscreen and flip design</u> , Intel N100, 4GB RAM, 32GB storage, 8 MP Camera , 11.6" touchscreen, 1366 x 768 (HD), UHD Graphics, Wi-Fi, Bluetooth, kbd: US (replaces 7L300UT#ABA)	9R395UT#ABA	\$356.47	\$379.00	\$382.67	No Bid	\$ 392.86	No Bid	\$ 344.23	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid

HP Chromebook and Cart Pricing - August 2025 - Revised 8/18/25

Award Highlighted in Yellow

Quantity	Item	Part #	Bluum	Countertrade	Data Center Warehouse	Howard	Insight Public Sector	School Specialty	Software House Int'l	Trafera	Vivacity Tech	VLCM
----------	------	--------	-------	--------------	-----------------------	--------	-----------------------	------------------	----------------------	---------	---------------	------

* Note: Please order Google licenses from same vendor as Chromebooks & Chromeboxes when ordering together.

Chromebook and Google Chrome Package (continued)

1-100	Google Chrome OS Management Console License- academic (Purchase for all Chromebooks, Chromeboxes and Chromebook Plus devices)	CROS-SW-DIS-EDU-NEW	\$29.59	\$ 29.15	\$ 29.95	No Bid	\$ 29.81	No Bid	\$ 30.40	No Bid	\$ 29.90	No Bid	3-4 weeks
	(For Chromebooks and Chromeboxes)	TOTAL											

Chromeboxes

1-100	HP Chromebox G4, ChromeOS, Intel Celeron 7305, 4GB memory, 64GB eMMC storage, Intel UHD Graphics, Wi-Fi 6E, Bluetooth	8R2T3UT#ABA	356.47	\$ 346.06	\$ 335.36	No Bid	\$ 363.53	No Bid	\$ 357.56	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	
1-100	HP Chromebox G4, Intel i5- 1335U, 16GB RAM, 256GB storage (Custom Build)	Config ID# 51932056 Jordan SD or AM0LSUP#ABA	\$ 708.33	\$ 859.58	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	
1-100	HP Chromebox G4, Intel core i5-1335U, 32GB RAM, 256GB storage (Custom Build)	Config ID# 51932074 Jordan SD or AM0N0UP#ABA	\$ 880.66	\$ 835.59	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	

Chromebook Plus Devices for Teachers/Administrators

1-100	HP Fortis G1i 14" Chromebook, Intel N250 3.8GHz, Chrome OS, 8GB RAM, 128GB storage, 1920 x 1080 (Full HD), Wi-Fi 6E, 180 degree lay flat hinge, privacy camera	B69SDUT#ABA	\$ 410.24	\$ 403.44	\$ 407.52	No Bid	\$ 416.24	No Bid	\$ 396.15	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	
1-100	HP Fortis G1i 14" Touchscreen Chromebook, Intel N250 3.8GHz, Chrome OS, 8GB RAM, 128GB storage, 1920 x 1080 (Full HD), Wi-Fi 6E	B69SFUT#ABA	\$ 435.26	\$ 428.04	\$ 432.36	No Bid	\$ 441.62	No Bid	\$ 420.30	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	
1-100	HP Fortis G1i 14" Chromebook, Intel N150 3.6GHz, Chrome OS, 8GB RAM, 128GB storage, 1920 x 1080 (Full HD), Wi-Fi	B69NZUT#ABA	\$ 375.22	\$ 369.00	\$ 372.73	No Bid	\$ 380.71	No Bid	\$ 362.33	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	
1-100	HP Fortis G1i 14" Chromebook, Intel N150 3.6GHz, Chrome OS, 8GB RAM, 128GB storage, 1920 x 1080 (Full HD), Wi-Fi	B69P0UT#ABA	\$ 403.49	\$ 428.04	\$ 432.36	No Bid	\$ 443.88	No Bid	\$ 389.64	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	
1-100	HP Fortis G1i 14" Enterprise Chromebook, Intel N150 3.6GHz, Chrome OS, 8GB RAM, 128/GB storage, 1920 x 1080 (Full HD), Wi-Fi	B6AX3UT#ABA	\$ 505.30	\$ 495.49	\$ 501.94	No Bid	\$ 512.69	No Bid	\$ 487.94	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	
1-100	HP Fortis G1i 14" Enterprise Touchscreen Chromebook, Intel N150 3.6GHz, Chrome OS, 8GB RAM, 64GB storage, 1920 x 1080 (Full HD), Wi-Fi, camera	B6AX4UT#ABA	\$ 575.34	\$ 564.16	\$ 571.52	No Bid	\$ 583.76	No Bid	\$ 555.58	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	
1-100	HP Fortis Flip G1i 11" Touchscreen & Flip Convertible 2 in 1 Chromebook, Intel N150 3.6GHz, Chrome OS, 16GB RAM, 128GB storage, 11.6" 1366 x 768 (HD), Wi-Fi	B69PQUT#ABA	\$ 465.28	\$ 456.24	\$ 462.18	No Bid	\$ 472.08	No Bid	\$ 449.30	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	

* Note: Please order Google licenses from same vendor as Chromebooks & Chromeboxes when ordering together.

HP Chromebook and Cart Pricing - August 2025 - Revised 8/18/25

Award Highlighted in Yellow

Quantity	Item	Part #	Bluum	Countertrade	Data Center		Insight	School	Software	Trafera	Vivacity	VLCM	
					Warehouse	Howard	Public Sector	Specialty	House Int'l		Tech		
Power Vaults with Battery Powerbanks													
1 to 20	Power Technologies Power Vault with <u>5 standard PowerBank Batteries</u>	CAB-PVS-B10K-D5	\$ 1,119.79	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	\$ 1,653.02	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	
1 to 20	Power Technologies Power Vault with <u>10 standard PowerBank Batteries</u>	CAB-PVS-B10K-D10	\$ 1,395.00	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	\$ 2,130.36	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	
1 to 20	Power Technologies Anti-Theft PowerVault, 10 Bay Secure Battery Charging Cabinet w/ HS Cables w/ <u>5 Power Bank HS Batteries</u>	CAB-PVS-B10K-D5H	\$ 1,174.49	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	\$ 1,653.02	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	
1 to 20	Power Technologies Anti-Theft PowerVault, 10 Bay Secure Battery Charging Cabinet w/ HS Cables w/ <u>10 Power Bank HS Batteries</u>	CAB-PVS-B10K-D10H	\$ 1,493.29	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	\$ 2,130.36	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	
1 to 20	Power Technologies Standard PowerBank, Rechargeable LiOn Battery, 20K mAh, Single Battery	BAT-PVS-20K-1	\$ 70.99	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	
1 to 20	Power Technologies Anti-Theft PowerBank, Rechargeable LiOn HS Battery, 20K mAh, Single Battery	BAT-PVS-20K-1H	\$ 80.39	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	
Carts													
1 to 20	Aver E36C+ charging cart for 36 units with intelligent charging	E36C+	\$ 795.00	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	
1 to 20	Liftgate Service		included										
1 to 20	Optional Inside Delivery Service		included										
1 to 20	Shipping and Handling for carts only		included										
		TOTAL	\$ 795.00										
			2-3 weeks										
1 to 20	Aver C36i+ charging cart for 36 units	C36i+	\$ 1,099.00	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	
1 to 20	Liftgate Service		included										
1 to 20	Optional Inside Delivery Service		included										
1 to 20	Shipping and Handling for carts only		included										
		TOTAL	\$ 1,099.00										
			2-3 weeks										
1 to 20	Anywhere Cart PT-36 charging cart for 36 units	PT-36	\$ 797.00	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	
1 to 20	Liftgate Service		included										
1 to 20	Optional Inside Delivery Service		included										
1 to 20	Shipping and Handling for carts only		included										
		TOTAL	\$ 797.00										
1 to 20	Anywhere Cart AC-PLUS-T 36-Unit Secure Smart Charging Cart	AC-PLUS-T	\$ 854.44	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	
1 to 20	Liftgate Service		included										
1 to 20	Optional Inside Delivery Service		n/a										
1 to 20	Shipping and Handling for carts only		included										
		TOTAL	\$ 854.44										
			2-3 weeks										
1 to 20	Aver X42i 42-device charging cart	X42i	\$ 1,129.99	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	
1 to 20	Liftgate Service		included										
1 to 20	Optional Inside Delivery Service		included										
1 to 20	Shipping and Handling for carts only		included										
		TOTAL	\$ 1,129.99										
			2-3 weeks										

HP Chromebook and Cart Pricing - August 2025 - Revised 8/18/25

Award Highlighted in Yellow

Quantity	Item	Part #	Bluum	Countertrade	Data Center Warehouse	Howard	Insight Public Sector	School Specialty	Software House Int'l	Trafera	Vivacity Tech	VLCM	
Carts (continued)													
1 to 20	Anywhere Cart AC-Pro II 40 Bay Full Feature Smart Cart	AC-PRO II	\$ 1,309.99	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	\$ 1,937.71	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	
1 to 20	Liftgate Service		included				additional						
1 to 20	Optional Inside Delivery Service		n/a				additional						
1 to 20	Shipping and Handling for carts only		included				\$ 359.44						
		TOTAL	\$ 1,309.99				\$ 2,297.15						
			2-3 weeks										
1 to 20	Ergotron Zip40 Charging Cart	Zip40/ DM40-1009-1	\$ 1,929.00	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	
1 to 20	Liftgate Service		\$ 40.00										
1 to 20	Optional Inside Delivery Service		\$ 120.00										
1 to 20	Shipping and Handling for carts only		included										
		TOTAL	\$ 2,089.00										
			2-3 weeks										
1 to 20	Anywhere AC-45 45 Bay Secure Smart Charging Cart	AC-45	\$ 1,079.00	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	
1 to 20	Liftgate Service		included										
1 to 20	Optional Inside Delivery Service		included										
1 to 20	Shipping and Handling for carts only		included										
		TOTAL	\$ 1,079.00										
1 to 20	Vivacity Tech 36-Unit Smart Charging Cart	VTCART-C36-G2	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	\$ 749.00	No Bid	
1 to 20	Liftgate Service										\$ 100.00		
1 to 20	Optional Inside Delivery Service										additional		
1 to 20	Shipping and Handling for carts only										included		
		TOTAL									\$ 849.00		
1 to 20	Vivacity Tech 30-Unit Charging Cart	VTCART-B30-G2	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	\$ 449.00	No Bid	
1 to 20	Liftgate Service										\$ 100.00		
1 to 20	Optional Inside Delivery Service										additional		
1 to 20	Shipping and Handling for carts only										included		
		TOTAL									\$ 549.00		
1 to 20	Vivacity Tech Mini Charging Cabinet- 12 Unit, Black	VTCABI-B12-G2	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	\$ 249.00	No Bid	
1 to 20	Liftgate Service										\$ 100.00		
1 to 20	Optional Inside Delivery Service										additional		
1 to 20	Shipping and Handling for carts only										included		
		TOTAL									\$ 349.00		
1 to 20	Aver Charge B30 30 device charging cart (compare to Vivacity 30-unit cart)	CHRGEB030	\$499.99	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	
1 to 20	Liftgate Service		\$ 40.00										
1 to 20	Optional Inside Delivery Service		n/a										
1 to 20	Shipping and Handling for carts only		included										
		TOTAL	\$539.99										
			2-3 weeks										
1 to 20	Anywhere Cart AC-30 30 Bay charging cart (compare to Vivacity 30 or Aver B30)	AC-30	\$529.99	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	
1 to 20	Liftgate Service		included										
1 to 20	Optional Inside Delivery Service		included										
1 to 20	Shipping and Handling for carts only		included										
		TOTAL	\$529.99										

HP Chromebook and Cart Pricing - August 2025 - Revised 8/18/25

Award Highlighted in Yellow

Quantity	Item	Part #	Bluum	Countertrade	Data Center Warehouse	Howard	Insight Public Sector	School Specialty	Software House Int'l	Trafera	Vivacity Tech	VLCM
Carts (continued)												
1 to 20	Luxor 16 Tablet/Chromebook Open Charging Cart	LOTM16	\$ 199.97	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	\$ 208.95	\$ 217.97	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
1 to 20	Liftgate Service		included				additional					
1 to 20	Optional Inside Delivery Service		included				additional					
1 to 20	Shipping and Handling for carts only		included				\$ 74.29	included				
	TOTAL		\$ 199.97				\$ 283.24	\$ 217.97				
			2-3 weeks									
1 to 20	Luxor 32 Tablet/Chromebook Open Charging Cart	LOTM32	\$ 291.00	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
1 to 20	Liftgate Service		included									
1 to 20	Optional Inside Delivery Service		additional									
1 to 20	Shipping and Handling for carts only		included									
	TOTAL		\$ 291.00									
			3-4 weeks									
1 to 20	Anywhere Cart AC-COMP16 16 Bay charging cart	AC-COMP-16	\$ 389.99	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	\$ 591.43	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
1 to 20	Liftgate Service		included				additional					
1 to 20	Optional Inside Delivery Service		included				additional					
1 to 20	Shipping and Handling for carts only		included				\$ 87.86					
	TOTAL		\$ 389.99				\$ 679.29					
1 to 20	Anywhere Cart 12 Unit Secure Charging Cabinet for Chromebooks, laptops, tablets	AC-MINI	\$ 410.99	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
1 to 20	Liftgate Service		n/a									
1 to 20	Optional Inside Delivery Service		n/a									
1 to 20	Shipping and Handling for carts only		included									
	TOTAL		\$ 410.99									
			2-3 weeks									
1 to 20	Aver X16 12 Device Charge Cabinet	X16	\$ 474.99	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
1 to 20	Liftgate Service		n/a									
1 to 20	Optional Inside Delivery Service		n/a									
1 to 20	Shipping and Handling for carts only		included									
	TOTAL		\$ 474.99									
			2-3 weeks									
1 to 20	Copernicus Tech Tub2, 10 device charging cabinets	FTT1100	\$ 379.44	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	\$ 392.93	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
1 to 20	Liftgate Service		included									
1 to 20	Optional Inside Delivery Service		included									
1 to 20	Shipping and Handling for carts only		included					included				
	TOTAL		\$ 379.44					\$ 392.93				
			4-6 weeks									
1 to 20	Belkin Store and Charge Station AC, up to 10 devices	B2B074	\$ 129.99	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	\$ 136.91	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
1 to 20	Liftgate Service		n/a				n/a					
1 to 20	Optional Inside Delivery Service		n/a				n/a					
1 to 20	Shipping and Handling for stations only		included				\$ 16.29					
	TOTAL		\$ 129.99				\$ 153.20					
			2-3 weeks									